
Regular Meeting
Monday, May 15, 2017 6:00 PM
Central 301 District Office, 275 South St, P.O. Box 396, Burlington, IL 60109

1. Call Meeting to Order - President Kellenberger
A. Roll Call
B. Approval of Agenda
2. Pledge of Allegiance
3. Public Open Forum
A. Recognition of Visitors
B. Public Comments
4. Action Reports
A. Consent Agenda
1) Minutes
B. Treasurer's Report
1) Payment of Bills
C. Approve Fuel Bid
D. Approve Classroom Furniture Bid
E. Approve the Bid for Repaving Work at Prairie View and Lily Lake Grade 
School

F. Approve Social Studies Textbook Adoption
G. Approve Overnight Trips for the JV and Varsity Volleyball Teams
H. Approve Overnight Trip for the Wrestling Team to Travel to Illinois 
Wesleyan

I. Approve Overnight Trip for the Varsity Football Team to Travel to 
Elmhurst College

J. Appoint Persons to Prepare the Tentative Budget
K. Approve Board of Education Meeting Dates for the 2017-2018 School Year
5. Information Reports
A. Committee Reports
B. Mobile App Developer and Business Incubator
C. Northern Kane Regional Career and Vocational Services
D. Construction Update
E. High School Course Proposal Process
F. Central High School Graduation - Friday June 2, 2017
G. Board Committee Assignments
H. Chemistry Textbook Adoption
I. Biology Textbook Adoption
J. College Physics/AP Physics Textbook Adoption
K. Fundamentals of Business Textbook Adoption
L. Child Development: Early Stages through Age 12 Textbook Adoption
M. Enrollment Report
6. FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT
A. Daniel Stocker - Midwest Bus Sales
B. James Bachman - Illinois Retired Teachers Association
7. Executive Session
A. “The appointment, employment, resignation, compensation, discipline, 
performance, or
dismissal of specific employees of the public body or legal counsel for 
the
public body, including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an
employee or against the legal counsel for the District to determine its



validity [5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1)].              
B. Open Session
C. Action Items from Closed Session
8. Board Open Forum
9. Adjourn



  

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 

Board of Education Minutes 
 

Where: Central High School Library Meeting:                         Regular 

Date: April 17, 2017 Time:                              6:00 p.m. 

 

Board Members Present  Administrators Present 
Gorman, Jeff Y   Stirn, Todd  Y 

Marlovits, Jan Y  Mongan, Esther Y 

Penar, Mitch Y  Pflug, Daina Y  

Perry, Maggie Y  Ahlsted, Carrie Y 

Rabe Laura Y  Bushman, Kristine Y  

Schmitt, Duane Y                                Diversey, Steve N 

Kellenberger, Jeff Y  Duffield, Tracie Y 

   Haug, Matthew Y 

   Jurs, Rebecca Y 

    King, Jeff Y 

   Lewis, Kim Y 

   McCastland, Kerrie N  

   Mirenda, Pamela N  

   Paszt, Alex Y 

   Polowy, Dan N  

   Potsic, Mike Y 

   Salamone, Julie Y 

   Schreiber, Jill Y 

   Schuth, Daniel Y  

   Testone, Chris Y 

   Tobin, Brian Y 

   Vaughn, Michelle Y  

   Walter, Carie Y 

 

Roll Call Roll call was taken at 6:00 p.m.   

 

 Present: Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Absent: None 

 

Agenda Motion by Gorman second by Marlovits to approve the agenda as presented. 

  

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Consent Agenda      Motion by Perry second by Penar to approve the consent agenda as presented.  

  

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

 



  

 

Paper Bid Motion by Perry second by Schmitt to award the paper bid to Midland Paper  

 as presented. 

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

  

ELL Textbook Motion by Schmitt second by Gorman to approve the adoption of the ELL textbook 

as presented. 

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Wheelchair Bus Motion by Perry second by Gorman to approve the lease of a 54+2 wheelchair bus as 

presented. 

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Executive Session  Motion by Penar second by Perry to adjourn open session and enter into executive 

session at 9:04 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Open Session Motion by Gorman second by Schmitt to adjourn executive session and return to 

open session at 9:37 p.m. 

   

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Personnel Report Motion by Perry second by Gorman to approve the personnel report for April as 

presented.   

  

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Resolution Motion by Gorman second by Penar to approve the resolution to dismiss a first year 

teacher as presented. 

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 



  

 

Settlement Motion by Schmitt second by Gorman to approve the Wyman settlement as 

presented. 

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

Adjourn Motion by Perry second by Schmitt to Adjourn at 9:50 p.m.  

 

 Voting yes:   Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger 

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: None 

 

BOE Meeting  

1. Roll Call 

2. Pledge of Allegiance  

 

3. Public Open Forum 

 3.1 Recognition of Visitors –President Kellenberger and Dr. Stirn welcomed guests and 

thanked everyone for coming to the meeting.  President Kellenberger thanked Members 

Perry and Schmitt for their service on the Board. 

 3.2 Public Comment – No public comment. 

  

4.0 Action Items 

4.1 Consent Agenda –Impact fees have not been received for March, only one home was 

permitted for $2,946.60 in impact fees and no transition fees were received in February.  

Expenditures are in line with the budget, total expenditures for the month are 59.78% 

compared to 58.49% last year.  Total revenues are 79.2% compared to 44.15% a year 

ago.  The difference in revenue is due to the 22 million dollars in referendum bonds.  The 

district received notification from the State that it will receive a categorical payment, 

likely the last one this year.  The district should receive four categorical payments a year 

but has only received one payment that was due to the district during the last school year 

and one out of the four payments due this school year. In past years, the State has made 

up some of its missed payments but it is not likely that will happen this year.  Member 

Perry asked if it would be appropriate for the Board to send legislators a letter stating 

their dis-satisfaction.  Currently Illinois has one of the nation’s highest property taxes, 

with state funding for education the lowest, and is one of the states with the highest 

number of people moving to a different state. 

 

4.2 Paper Bid – The paper bid went out to five companies, Midland Paper came in with the 

lowest bid.  We have worked with Midland before and have been happy with their 

product and service. 

 

4.3 ELL Textbook – This textbook has been on display for thirty days and approval is 

recommended for the new book. 

 

4.4 Wheelchair Bus – This additional bus is needed to transport two wheelchair bound 

students who will share the same bus route for the next school year.   

 



  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

5.0 Information Reports –  

5.1 Committee Reports – CCC – The following course proposals were brought forward:  

Social Studies—Pre-requisites will be changed for AP Social Studies to allow more 

access for students to AP Government and AP U.S. History courses.  Global Studies will 

change from a semester to a year-long course. This will allow sufficient time to cover 

standards and allow students to volunteer for different high school and community 

projects. AP Human Geography is a new AP course that will replace AP Modern World 

History. 

  English – Journalism I & II Journalism can now be repeated, to better prepare students 

for a career pathway in media.  Journalism II will now include journalism production.  

Advanced Journalism Production and career internship courses have also been added. 

  CTE – Central collaborates with three other school districts though Kane County EFE 

and the dollars are funded out of U-46.  When an audit occurs, they make sure there is a 

strand to follow within the CTE curriculum called CIP.  CIP requires three levels: level 

one is beginner or introductory, level two is skill based, and level three could be an 

internship or a cooperative program.  In order to be eligible for more grant money we 

need a solid CIP program; Kelly Green is working on a new CIP plan.  Our agriculture 

program is strong, but our business classes are struggling. In order to strengthen the 

business strands the following changes will be made: The Keyboarding/Software 

Applications course will be dropped. Entrepreneurship will change from a semester to a 

year-long course.  The longer course term will allow students to brainstorm 

business/product ideas, and develop a market plan and present their plans as a mini-Shark 

Tank model for seed money to begin their business. A new course called Mobile App 

Maker will teach students how to code and create apps for Apple devices. This class will 

follow Introduction to Programing.  Introduction to Programming will no longer be 

repeatable.  Computer Networking/Hardware has not run consistently and will be 

removed from the course catalog. 

  Last Spring the high school course approval process was reviewed.  The course approval 

process currently takes 18 months.  The high school would like this process compressed 

but they were not successful with finding a way to shorten the timeframe.   

  Foundation – The Foundation is developing a new grant application, after researching 

other districts to see how they give money back to the schools.  Guidelines for the new 

grant process will be out in the spring and applications will be due in the fall.  Students 

can also apply for the grants (they will need to be sponsored by a staff member).  The 

grant winners will report back to the Foundation on how the money was used.  Trivia 

Night is November 11, 2017, and the theme is Celebrate Central. After the field house 

opens they will host a Harlem Wizards game. Last, they are still looking for a date for 

Pizza Wars and the community vendor show. 

 

 5.2 Construction Update – The project is on schedule, and block and interior work has begun 

on the second floor.  In May, the Board will see paving bids for Prairie View and Lily 

Lake, as well as for cafeteria work.  Dirt is being moved from Phase II to the Ellithorpe 



  

 

Road area for practice fields.  We are still working with KDOT on the turn lanes for the 

high school. 

 

 5.3 Central High School Graduation – Graduation is Friday, June 2, 2017, at Northern Illinois 

University in the Convocation Center.  ECC was not an option this year because their 

buildings are closed by June 2nd, and we could not move graduation up to Memorial Day 

due to the CHS band trip to Washington DC.  Seating will not be limited at NIU.  

 

 5.4 Upcoming Bids – Bids going out in May include the fuel bid, refuse bid, and classroom 

furniture bid.   

 

 5.5 School Improvement Plan Reports – Administrators and staff members from each school 

presented information on their individual school improvement plans.  SIP plans range 

from goals, academic growth, organizational strategies, 5Essentials, RtI implementation, 

and AP availability. 

 

 5.6 School Board Election Results and Board Organization – April 26, 2017 – A special 

board meeting will be held on April 26, 2017 to thank retiring Board members and seat 

the new Board members. 

   

 5.7 Social Studies Textbook Adoption – Dr. Mongan reviewed the social studies textbook 

requests with the Board.  The three textbooks are from Houghton Mifflin and have online 

resources. 

 

 5.8 Enrollment Report – April is the first month this year a decrease in student enrollment 

has occurred.  The total is down seven students, however, we have increased 264 students 

from last April. 

  

6.0 Executive Session 

 6.1 Adjourn Open Meeting 

6.2 Return to Open Session 

 6.3 Action Items from Closed Session 

 

7.0 ADJOURN 
 

 

 

 

 

Jeff Kellenberger, President                                                 Janet Marlovits, Secretary 
 

 

 

Next Meeting:  May 15, 2017 



 
 

   

 
  

 Central Community Unit School District 301 

 Special Meeting Minutes 

 

Where: Central High School LMC Meeting: Special 

Date: May 4, 2017 Time:                          5:36 p.m. 

 

Board Members Present  Administrators Present 
Jeff Gorman N Todd Stirn Y 

Christine Johnson Y   

Tina Johnson Y     

Janet Marlovits Y   

Mitch Penar  Y  

Laura Rabe Y   

Jeff Kellenberger Y 

  

 

1. Meeting Call to Order  

 

1.1 Motion by Penar second by T. Johnson to call meeting to order at 5:36 p.m 

. 

 Voting yes:     C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe,   

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Gorman, Kellenberger 

  

2. Executive Session 

 

2.1 Motion by Penar second by T. Johnson to enter into executive session at 5:39 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes:     C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe,   

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Gorman, Kellenberger 

 

3.  Open Session 

 

3.1 Motion by Penar second by C. Johnson to adjourn closed session at 6:27 p.m. 

 

 Voting yes:     C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe,   

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Gorman, Kellenberger 

 

4 Action Items from Closed Session 

 

 4.1 Student #509385 

  Motion by Penar second by T. Johnson to uphold the administrations recommendation 

and expel student #509385 with a recommendation to attend safe school. 

 

 4.2 Student #13407 

Motion by Penar second by Rabe to uphold the administrations recommendation and 

expel student #13407 with a recommendation to attend safe school. 



 
 

   

 
  

 

4. Adjournment  

 3.1 Motion by Penar second by C. Johnson to adjourn closed session at 6:31 p.m 

  

 Voting yes:     C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe,   

 Voting no: None 

 Absent: Gorman, Kellenberger 

 

BOE Meeting  

1. Roll Call 

1.1  Approve Agenda 

 

Executive Session 

 The Board met in executive session to review the hearing officers’ report for two student 

discipline cases. 

 

Return to Open Session 

  

Action Items from Closed Session 

The Board upheld the administrations recommendation to expel two students and recommend 

they attend safe schools for the duration of the expulsion. 

 

 

    

 

 

 

 

 

 

     Recording Secretary 

 



 

 Central Community Unit School District 301 

 Special Meeting Minutes 

 

Where: Central High School  Meeting: Special 

Date: April 26, 2017 Time:                          6:12  p.m. 

 

Board Members Present  Administrators Present 

Jeff Gorman Y Stirn, Todd Y 

Jeff Kellenberger Y Mongan, Esther Y  

Janet Marlovits Y 

Mitch Penar Y     

Maggie Perry  Y  

Laura Rabe Y 

Duane Schmitt Y 

  

 

Meeting Call to Order - President Kellenberger 

 

Roll Call  Roll call was taken at 6:12 p.m. 

 

Agenda  Motion by Schmitt second by Gorman to approve the agenda as presented. 

 

  Voting yes:     Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

Canvass  Motion by Perry second Gorman to approve the canvass from the Kane 

County Elections. 

 

  Voting yes:     Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

Oath of Office 

 

Adjourn  Motion by Schmitt second by Perry to adjourn the meeting at 6:20 p.m. 

 

  Voting yes:     Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

 

 

 

 

 



President Motion by Marlovits second by Gorman to appoint Member Kellenberger as President 

Pro Tem Pro Tem    

   

  Voting yes:     Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

Secretary Motion by Penar second by Gorman to appoint Member Marlovits as Secretary Pro      

Pro Tem Tem 

 

  Voting yes:     Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

   

 

President Member Marlovits nominated member Kellenberger for the office of President.  

 

  Voting yes:     Gorman, Marlovits, Penar, Perry, Rabe, Schmitt, Kellenberger  

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

  Member Kellenberger shall act as President 

 

Vice President Member Kellenberger nominated member Marlovits for the office of Vice President.  

Member Rabe nominated member Gorman for the Office of Vice President.  

 

  Voting yes for Marlovits – C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Kellenberger 

  Voting yes for Gorman – Gorman, Penar, Rabe, 

   

  Member Marlovits shall act as Vice President 

 

Secretary President Kellenberger nominated member C. Johnson for the office of Secretary.  

Member Penar nominated member Gorman for the office of Secretary. 

 

  Votes for C. Johnson – C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Kellenberger 

  Votes for Gorman – Gorman, Penar, Rabe 

 

Adjourn Motion by Gorman second by Stirn to adjourn at 6:58 p.m. 

 

  Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

Executive Motion by Gorman second by Marlovits to enter into Executive session at 6:3p.m.

 Session   

  Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

 

 



Open Session Motion by Gorman second by Stirn to adjourn Executive Session at 6:58 p.m. 

 

  Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

 

Adjourn Motion by Kellenberger second by Gorman to adjourn 8:07 p.m. 

 

  Voting yes: Gorman, C. Johnson, T. Johnson, Marlovits, Penar, Rabe, Kellenberger 

  Voting no: None 

  Absent:  None 

  

 

 

  

BOE Meeting  

 

1. Roll Call 

2. Pledge of Allegiance  

 

3 Action Items 

 

 3.1 Canvass of the Election – The Board approved the official canvass of votes from the April 4, 

2017 election.   

3.2 Oath of Office - Superintendent Stirn administered the oath of office for the newly elected 

Board members.  

 

Adjournment to re-organize the Board of Education – President Kellenberger adjourned the 

school board meeting. 

 

3.3 Organizational Meeting of the New Board – Dr. Stirn called the meeting of the new School 

Board of Central Community Unit School District No. 301 to order.  Member Kellenberger 

was nominated as President Pro Tem and Member Marlovits was nominated as Secretary Pro 

Tem. 

 

 President Pro Tem asked for nominations for Board President: 

 

Board Member Marlovits nominated Jeff Kellenberger for President, no other nominations 

were made. 

 

 Jeff Kellenberger shall act as Board President. 

 

President Kellenberger asks for nominations for the office of Vice President: 

 

President Kellenberger nominated Member Marlovits, and Member Rabe nominated Member 

Gorman. 

Member Marlovits received four votes and Member Gorman received three votes. 

Member Marlovits shall act at Vice President    

 

   



  President Kellenberger asked for nominations for the office of Secretary. 

 

Member Marlovits nominated Member C. Johnson, Member Penar nominated Member 

Gorman. 

 

  Member C. Johnson received four votes, Member Gorman received three votes.   

  Member C. Johnson shall act as Secretary. 

 

4.0 Information Reports 

 

 4.1 Board of Education Meeting Calendar – Dr. Stirn reviewed the dates of meetings scheduled 

for the remainder of the 2016-2017 School year and the 2017-2018 school year.  Meetings are 

typically held on the third Monday of each month except where otherwise noted.  A board 

member contact list will be sent to Board Members. 

 

5.0 Executive Session 

 Informational session regarding student discipline – No action was taken 

  

6.0 Adjournment 

 

 

 

 

 

Recording Secretary 





























































































 

    BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: DR. TODD STIRN SUPERINTENDENT 

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION FOR ACCEPTANCE OF FUEL BID 

DATE: MAY 15, 2017 

 

 
Bid specifications were sent to eight companies for the 2017-2018 fuel bidding process.  
Two companies submitted formal bids.  PetroChoice withdrew their bid due to an error 
in the LUST fund tax.  Feece Oil Co. was the lowest responsible bidder and Feece has 
supplied fuel in previous years, including the current school year.  We continue to be 
pleased with their product and service.  Please see the accompanying bid comparison 
summary. 



Bid Summary: Fuel Bid
Date: 5/1/2017
Time: 9:30 a.m.

100,000 31,000
COMPANY #1 DIESEL #2 DIESEL Reformulated
Hintzsche  Oil Wholesale Price Per gallon  
Bid Price Bid price bid gallon

Motor fuel tax
LUST fund
Total

Feece Oil Co.   Wholesale Price Per gallon 2.0235 1.518 1.6025
Bid Price Bid price bid gallon 0.0950 0.0950 0.0950

Motor fuel tax 0.2150 0.2150 0.1900
LUST fund 0.0120 0.0120 0.0120
Total 2.3455 1.8400 1.8995
Low OPIS Bid Price 2.0235 1.5180 1.6025

Total Bid 234550.0000 184000.0000 58884.5000 477434.5000

Conserve FS Wholesale Price Per gallon
Bid Price Bid price bid gallon

Motor fuel tax
LUST fund
Total

PetroChoice Wholesale Price Per gallon 2.0235 1.518 1.6025
Bid Price Bid price bid gallon 0.1 0.1 0.11

Motor fuel tax 0.215 0.215 0.19
LUST fund 0.0010 0.0010 0.0010
Total 2.3395 1.834 1.9035
Low OPIS Bid Price 2.0235 1.518 1.6025

Total Bid 233950.00000 183400.00000 59008.5000 476358.50000





Item
Descriptio

n Vendor
Product
Number

Substitute
/No

Substitute Qty
Manufactur
er

BOS Per
Spec Extension

BOS Alt 1
Mfr

Conjuction
Table35x32
1/2",
uniquely
shaped,
can group
into bigger
shapes for
collaborativ
e
work/intera
ction in the
classroom,
*(preferred
shape in
WAVE),
floor glides
and casters
for each
table

Paragon MCSD-115

yes
accepting
also bids
for
backpack
hook and
ganging
device to
equal or
superior
quality
product 150 Paragon $170.00 $25,500.00

K-Log
Conjunction
Table

Cantilever,
Poly Back
Stack
Chairs
20"Wx19
1/2"D x 18"
Hplastic
seat, lumbar
support,
integrated
handle

Paragon PAF-C8

Yes equal
or superior
quality
product 150 Paragon $93.00 $13,950.00

Mein C. with
the ability to
rock gently
candilevers
to the desk
well



THX Vinton
Wave 3-
Piece
Teacher
Station:  

HMU X-
Base Sit-2-
Stand Side
Table 

Adjustable
Height: 28” -
35”h 
via set
screw 
Standard
Widths:
54”w,
60”w,
66”w, 
72”w 
Overall
Depth: 35”d 
Mobile
Caddy with
Worksurfac
e: 
35.4”w x
19.7”d 
HMU X-
Base Side
Table  
35.3”d x
34.4”w; 
29”-44”h via
hand lever 

Mien CompanyTGJ - 5435

Yes equal
or superior
quality
product 10 Mein $1,838.00 $18,380.00



OAR
Pneumatic
Swivel
Chair
MATERIALS

DIMENSION
S OPTIONS
Padded
seat SHELL
Arms:
without arm
rests
Paddedseat
Bloom
polyester
fabrics
Base: 5-
point
injection-
molded
black
polyproylen
e
Mechanism:
Die-cast
aluminum
Hillie Box
finished
with black
paint Lever:
Painted
steel with
molded
polypropyle
ne handle
Standard
Casters:

Mien CompanyOAR-3250

Yes equal
or superior
quality
product 10 Mein $224.50 $2,245.00 K-Log

Table
Ganger
Book Hook













































BOS Alt 1

BOS
Alternate 1
Extension

BOS Alt 2
Mfr. BOS Alt 2

BOX Alt 2
Ext. KI Alt

KI - all
alternate KI Extension KI #2 KI Extension

$320.00 $48,000.00 National $328.00 $49,200.00

Alt # 1 no
casters,
Alternate #2
Rectangular
Activity
Table $108.78 $16,317.00 $147.39 $22,108.50

$67.50 $10,125.00 Paragon $85.00 $12,750.00 $63.83 $9,574.50



$844.00 $8,440.00 No Bid Mein



$224.00 $2,240.00 No Bid Mein

$4.44
$7.21













































School
Speciality

Per Bid

School
Speciality
Extension

Tiles in
Style
Manufactur
er

Tiles In
Style

Tile in Style
Ext

LMC
Manufactur
er LMC LMC Ext

$253.89 $38,083.50 Paragon $235.90 $35,385.00
Scholarcraf
t no casters $90.33 $13,549.50

$65.91 $9,886.50 Paragon $119.90 $17,985.00
Scholarcraf
t $58.00 $8,700.00



$1,757.28 $17,572.80 Mein $758.00 $7,580.00 Mein $1,776.68 $17,766.80



$199.41 $1,994.10 OAR $607.23 $6,072.30 Mein $295.47 $2,954.70





































































































4949 Harrison Avenue, Suite 100, Rockford, IL 61108 / P.O. Box 5207 Rockford, IL 61125-0207
Tel. 815.484.0739, Fax 815.229.9867                                                         www.larsondarby.com

May 8, 2017

Dr. Todd Stirn
Superintendent
Central School District 301
275 South Street
Burlington, Il. 60109

Re: Bid Results
Prairie View and Lily Lake Elementary Schools Repaving
L&D #27061

Dear Dr. Stirn:

The District received bids for the above referenced project at 1:30 p.m. on May 4,
2017. There were six (6) official bidders of record holding plans and Four (4) bids
were received. Larson & Darby reviewed the four official bid submittals for this
project and determined that the four official bids met the bidding requirements for
this project and can therefore be considered responsive bids.

The project included a base bid scope of work for each school and alternates at each
facility. Please see the attached bid tabulation form. We recommend that you accept
the low responsive total combined bid from Geneva Construction Co., in the amount
of $225,070.00. This includes, the base bid work at Lily Lake and both parts of the
base bid work for Prairie View as well as a $15,000 general contingency allowance.
The base bid work includes the complete removal and repaving of everything at
Prairie View and the completion of the surface course at Lily Lake. We are not
recommending acceptance of any alternates at this time. We have discussed the bids
directly with the lowest combined total bidder, Geneva Construction Co. and they
have a complete and comprehensive bid submittal, and positive references.

If you have questions, or need additional clarification regarding the information
included in this letter, please contact me at 815.484.0739 or e-mail at
snelson@larsondarby.com.

Sincerely,

Stephen Nelson, AIA, LEED® AP
Director of Educational Architecture

P:\27061 Central School District 301 Prairie View & Lili Lake Repavement\Correspondence\Letters\27061 Recommendation
letter. 5-8-17.doc

ARCHITECTS

ENGINEERS

INTERIORS

Celebrating Over 50
Years in Business!



Abbey Paving Accu-Paving Builder's Paving Geneva Cons. Meyer Paving Schroeder Asphalt

$34,965.00 $38,750.00 NO BID $47,050.00 NO BID $30,500.00

$3,015.00 $3,300.00 $5,020.00 $4,750.00

$91,255.00 $78,800.00 $72,175.50 $88,500.00

$128,980.00 $93,590.00 $91,824.50 $117,500.00

($17,765.00) $58,550.00 $78,164.00 $64,000.00

($46,160.00) $74,420.00 $79,836.00 $75,000.00

$250,000.00 $226,140.00 $225,070.00 $236,500.00

√ √ √ None

√ √ √ √

√ √ √ √

Crack filler, per lineal foot
ADD

DEDUCT

Remarks:

ADDENDUM RECEIPT (2 OF 2):

SUBSTITUTIONS:

TIME OF COMPLETION

Geotextile fabric, per lineal  

foot

ADD

DEDUCT

Furnish,  place and compact 

aggregate base, per cubic 

yard

ADD

DEDUCT

BID GUARANTEE

DEDUCT

Thursday, May 4, 2017 @ 1:30 p.m.

BASE BID Lily Lake Grade School

General Contractors

UNIT PRICES

ALTERNATE BID Lily Lake Grade School

BASE BID PART 2 Prairie View Grade School

BASE BID PART 1 Prairie View Grade School

ALTERNATE BID PART 1 PV Grade School

ALTERNATE BID PART 2 PV Grade School

COMBINED TOTAL BASE BID

BID TABULATION

Central School District 301

Repaving Prairie View & Lily Lake Grade Schools

Elgin, Illinois & Maple Park, Illinois

L&D #27061

Surface course, per cubic 

yard

ADD

Binder course, per cubic yard
ADD

DEDUCT



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: SOCIAL STUDIES TEXTBOOK   

DATE: 5/15/2017 

 

Textbook for Civics 2018– estimated total cost $25,391.10 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS –  250 e-licenses for 6-years @ $75.18 - $18,795.00            
- 90 hardcover textbooks @ $73.29 - $6,596.10 

Building citizenship Civics; Economics Students Learning Center – ISBN       

978007676833-2 

Building Citizenship Civics and Economics Student Edition – ISBN 9780076680535 

 

TEACHER MATERIALS - 4 Teacher Editions Teacher edition Building Citizenship 

Civics and Economics with 6 yr. subscription to online resources and Building 

Citizenship and Economics Quizzes and Tests - Free 

 

Textbook for Psychology– estimated total cost $10,980.00 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS –120 e-licenses for 6-years @ $71.79 - $8614.80 

         30 student hardcover textbooks @$78.84 - $2,365.20 

 Understanding Psychology 6-year digital  - ISBN 9780076640799 

 Understanding Psychology hardcover textbook  – ISBN 9780076631940 

TEACHER MATERIALS - 2 Teacher Editions 

 Psychology Teacher Suite -  6 yr. subscription to online resources- Free 

 

Textbook for Sociology– estimated total cost $10,980.00 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS –120 e-licenses for 6-years @ $71.79 - $8614.80 

         30 student hardcover textbooks @$78.84 - $2,365.20 

 Sociology Student Learning Center - 6 year digital -  ISBN 9780076640652 

 Sociology and You hardcover textbook  – ISBN 9780076631933 

 

TEACHER MATERIALS - 2 Teacher Editions 

 Sociology Teacher Suite -  6 yr. subscription to online resources- Free 



 

 

 

Rationale:  The social studies department has extensively looked throughout samples 

provided.  The department has selected the three textbook and appreciated the 

incorporation of overarching and topical essential questions in the layouts of their texts, 

along with considering the vast online resources provided by McGraw Hill, especially 

since we have gone 1:1.  The books align with the district philosophy for curriculum. 

 

 

 



               BOARD OF EDU CATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: STEVE DIVERSEY, ATHLETIC/ACTIVITIES DIRECTOR   

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF VOLLEYBALL SUMMER TOURNAMENT OVERNIGHT TRIPS 

DATE: 4/13/17 

 

I would like to recommend the approval of two overnight trips for our volleyball team. 

The team would like to attend two volleyball summer tournaments that require staying 

overnight.  The trips include a two-day tournament that the Junior Varsity and Varsity 

teams will attend at the Dunes Volleyball Club in Rolling Prairie, Indiana. The additional 

trip would be for the Varsity team only to Eastern Illinois University in Charleston.  The 

teams would travel by CCUSD #301 activity buses. The Central Volleyball coaching 

staff will attend as chaperones with the team. The itineraries for both trips are included 

with this memorandum.  





               BOARD OF EDU CATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: STEVE DIVERSEY, ATHLETIC/ACTIVITIES DIRECTOR   

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF CENTRAL HIGH SCHOOL WRESTLING TEAM - ISI SUMMER  
CAMP OVERNIGHT TRIP 

DATE: 4/13/17 

 

I would like to recommend the approval of an overnight trip for our Wrestling Team.  

The team will travel to Illinois Wesleyan University for the ISI Wrestling Camp.  The 

camp will be held from July 9-12, 2017. The Central Wrestling coaching staff will attend 

as chaperones. The team will be transported to camp via CCUSD #301, transportation. 

The trip itinerary and information packet are included with this memorandum.  



Central High School Rocket Wrestling 
 2017 ISI Camp  

Illinois Wesleyan University JULY 9th-12th    
Itinerary and Information guide 

 
 Day 1 Camp Schedule 
8:30……………………………………..Buses leave CHS  
9:00-12:00 .............................Check-in and Weigh-in 
12:00-2:00 .............................Technique 
2:00-4:00 ...............................Duals 
4:00-4:40 ...............................Team Olympics 
5:00-6:00 …………………………….Optional Practice 
5:00-6:30 ...............................Supper 
6:00-8:00 ...............................Night Activity 
8:00-10:00 .............................Free Time 
10:00 ......................................Lights Out!! 
Day 2 & 3 Camp Schedule 
7:00-9:00................................Elite Technique Session 
9:00-11:00 .............................Technique 
11:00-12:00 ...........................Duals 
12:00-1:00 .............................Lunch 
1:00-2:00 ...............................Technique 
2:00-4:00 ...............................Duals 
4:00-4:40 ...............................Team Olympics 
5:00-6:00 …………………………….Optional Practice 
5:00-6:30 ...............................Supper 
6:00-8:00 ...............................Night Activity 
8:00-10:00............................. Free Time 
10:00 ......................................Lights Out!! 
Day 4 Camp Schedule 
8:30-9:00................................T-shirt exchange 
9:00-11:00 .............................Technique 
11:00-12:00 ...........................Duals 
12:00-1:00 .............................Lunch 
1:00-3:00 ...............................Takedown Tournament 
7:00……………………………………..Bus Arrives back at CHS 
Meal Plan:  
We will be selecting the meal plan that provides only lunch and supper $60/person. It includes:  
Sunday: Supper  
Monday: Lunch, Supper  
Tuesday: Lunch, Supper  
Wednesday: Lunch 
We will be bringing our own food for breakfast. See the last paragraph at the bottom of the “Packing 
List” for how I plans to supply these items.  
 
*If your wrestler plans to opt out of this meal plan please let me know immediately.  



 

Packing List: 
 
Each wrestler is permitted one large suitcase and one backpack. The suitcases will be packed in the back 
of the bus, while the boys will be able to sit with their backpack in their respective vehicle. In addition, 
each boy is REQUIRED to bring a sleeping bag and pillow. Linens will not be provided at the University. 
Everything else must fit into one of the two bags. We discourage taking anything of true value. We are 
not responsible for any lost, stolen, or damaged items on the trip. As a bonus to all parents, the boys will 
be doing their laundry at least one time before returning home. If they don’t know how, then they will 
learn. 
 
Wrestling Shoes 
Singlet (If needed campers may borrow one from the high school) 
Headgear (optional) 
Mouthpiece 
Running Shoes 
Sleeping Bag 
Pillow 
(10) Pairs of Socks 
(6) Pairs of Shorts 
(8) Pair of Underwear 
(10) T-shirts 
(2) Towels 
Bathing Suit 
Light Jacket 
Backpack 
Toothbrush 
Toothpaste 
Shampoo 
Soap 
Deodorant 
Phone 
Phone charger 
Sunscreen 
Spending Money (for food and souvenirs) 
 
In addition to the list above, we also encourage a few other items as well. We selected the lunch/supper 
meal option, which means we will be on our own for breakfast. I will be asking each wrestler to provide 
bring a non-perishable breakfast or cooking wear item ($5 or less); paper bowls, utensils, box of cereal, 
granola bars, dried fruit, etc. We will provide the perishable items; milk, fruit, etc. also asked that each 
wrestler provide a case of something to drink. They were able to create a nice assembly of drinks and 
cut down on the road expenses greatly. 
 



 

 
 
 
Tentative Night Activities:  
We will have an optional activity each night. These activities do cost money but we have worked great 
prices through area businesses.  
We have done the planning for you. As a team, decide what works best and on what night.  
Choose between the following options:  
- Fairview Waterpark  
- Pheasant Lanes  
- Starplex Theaters 
 
NIGHTLY ACTIVITIES (Are not paid to the camp. These are optional activities that kids should have cash 
for. $20 would be enough to satisfy all of the activities.) 

 



               BOARD OF EDU CATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: STEVE DIVERSEY, ATHLETIC/ACTIVITIES DIRECTOR   

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF CENTRAL HIGH SCHOOL FOOTBALL SUMMER CAMP TRIP 

DATE: 4/24/17 

 

I would like to recommend the approval of an overnight summer camp trip for the 

Central High School Varsity Football Team.  The team will attend camp at Elmhurst 

College from July 24-27, 2017.  The team attended this same camp last summer and it 

was a great success.  The team will check into Cureton Hall at Elmhurst College on the 

morning of July 24, and check out after dinner on the evening of July 27.  A note from 

Coach Brian Melvin and the camp itinerary is included.   







 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
To:  Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent, Board of Education 
 
From:  Daina Pflug 
 
Subject:  Appointment of Persons to Prepare Tentative Budget 
 
Date:  May 15, 2017 
 
The school code requires a school district to designate person(s) to prepare in tentative form the annual 
budget for the new fiscal year. It is recommended those persons be:  
 
Daina Pflug 
Ron Cope  
Esther Mongan 
 
 

 

 
 

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 
Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent 

275 South St., P.O. Box 396  Burlington, IL 60109 
847-464-6005 847-464-6021 Fax  www.burlington.k12.il.us 

  

http://www.burlington.k12.il.us/


Draft April 19, 2017 
 

 

 

 

 
 

 

CENTRAL COMMUNITY UNIT SCHOOL DISTRICT 301 
Board of Education Meeting Dates for 2017-2018 

 
All meetings begin at 6:00 p.m.  Regular meeting dates are the third Monday of each month at the Central 
High School LMC unless otherwise stated.   
 
Remaining Dates for 16-17: 
 
May 15, 2017 
 
June 19, 2017 
 
Dates:  
  
July 17, 2017 
 
August 21, 2017 
   
September 25, 2017 
 
October 16, 2017 
   
November 27, 2017 
 
December 18, 2017 
 
January 16, 2018 (Tuesday) 
 
February 20, 2018 (Tuesday) 
 
March 19, 2018 
 
April 16, 2018 
 
May 21, 2018 
 
June 18, 2018 

 

Central Community Unit School District 301 
Dr. Todd Stirn, Superintendent 

275 South St., P.O. Box 396  Burlington, IL 60109 
847-464-6005 847-464-6021 Fax  www.burlington.k12.il.us   



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: SCIENCE TEXTBOOKS – BIOLOGY AND CHEMISTRY  

DATE: 5/10/2017 

 

 

Textbook for Miller Levine Biology 2017 -  total cost $33,793.90 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 120 textbooks with digital license 

 Miller Levine Biology 2017 Student Textbook (grade 9/10)  – ISBN 

9781323205846 – 120 hardcover textbooks with 6-year digital license - 

$101.47@ 120  = $12,176.40   

 Miller Levine Biology 2017 Digital Courseware 6-year license  – 250 licenses @ 

$86.47 = 21,617.50 

Miller Levine Biology 2017 Teacher Edition – Free (4) 

 

The 120 hardcover textbooks allow 30 copies for 4 classrooms, in addition to the digital 

students texts.  

 

Textbook for Pearson Chemistry 2017 -  total cost $8,412.30 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 6 textbooks with digital license 

 Pearson Chemistry Student Textbook (grade 10/11) – ISBN 9781323205891 – 30 

hardcover textbooks with 6-year digital license - $101.47 = $3,044.10   

 Pearson Chemistry 2017 Digital Courseware 6-year license  (REALIZE)  – 60    

6-year license $89.47 = 5,368.20 

Chemistry 2017 Teacher Edition – Free (1) 

 

Shipping and Handling - $1,222.12 

Total cost - $43,428.32 

 

Rationale: Textbooks for both biology and chemistry need to be updated to match the 

Next Generation Science Standards. Department Chair Hovious and team have reviewed 

and selected these texts for your courses. The textbooks are aligned nicely with the NGSS 

standards and the online tools provide for excellent resources for both students and 

teachers.  



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: COLLEGE PHYSICS/AP PHYSICS 

DATE: 5/10/2017 

 

Textbook for College Physics/AP Physics  -  total cost $8,230.75 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 60 Digital Bundles 

 College Physics, 11 e-Student Edition + WebAssign (6 year access) – 30 - 6-year 

license, 30 physical textbooks @ $180.00 per unit = $5,400 

 

 College Physics, 11e Web Assign (6 year access) – Serway 11th Edition [STM, 

2018] – 10 digital seats for 6-years. @ $140.00 per unit = $1,400.00 

 

 K12HS Fast Track to 5 College Physics – 35  @ $19.50 per unit $682.50 

 

 Teacher Resource Guide - Free 

 

Estimated Shipping and Handling - $8,230.75 

 

 

Rationale: Update textbooks to meet the new NGSS standards and College Board. 

Current AP Physics textbooks are out dated and have not been replaced for 11 years. The 

current book is a 2006 version.  



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: FUNDAMENTALS OF BUSINESS 

DATE: 5/10/2017 

 

 

Introduction to Business -  Total Cost $7,921.89 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 31 textbooks  

 

 McGraw Hill Introduction to Business – 31 textbooks  @ $83.31 = $2,582.61   

 McGraw Hill Introduction to Business online 6-year Subscription  - 60 licenses @ 

$83.31 = $4998.60 

 McGraw Hill Introduction to Business Teacher 6-year - free 

 

Shipping and Handling - $173.27 

Total cost - $7,921.10 

 

 

Rationale: The textbooks are out-of-date and the department chair and teachers have 

selected this textbook because it allows connection to all the transition courses within this 

strand within the business cluster.  

 

 



               BOARD OF EDUCATION M EMORANDUM 

TO: DISTRICT 301 BOARD OF EDUCATION 

FROM: ESTHER MONGAN, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT   

SUBJECT: CHILD DEVELOPMENT 

DATE: 5/10/2017 

 

Textbook for Child Development  -  total cost $12,700.77 

 

STUDENT MATERIALS – 31 Digital Bundles 

 Child Development:  Early Stages through Age 12 - 8th Edition – 31 units @ 

$110.94 = $3,439.14 

ONLINE STUDENT CENTER – 111 units @ $82.80 = $9,190.80 

 

ONLINE TEACHER RESOURCE – 2 units - Free 

 

Estimated Shipping and Handling - $70.83 

Total cost - $12,700.77 

 

Rationale: Currently we do not have enough textbooks to provide one for each student 

taking the course. Additionally, the textbooks for the class are from two different years. 

In lieu of purchasing old textbooks, the department chair is requesting an updated 

textbook for the course.  

 



Central Community Unit School District 301
Student Enrollment Report Date  May 11, 2017

School Count EE KDG 1st 2nd 3rd 4th 5th 6th 7th 8th 9th 10th 11th 12th Current Last Month Change
Total Total

Country Trails 2016 113 100 120 111 95 97 636 636 0
2015 93 113 107 90 90 83 576

H.B. Thomas 2016 99 98 86 93 72 81 80 609 605 +4
2015 81 82 81 71 84 73 90 562

Lily Lake 2016 23 48 32 34 36 31 204 198 +6
2015 39 31 32 32 32 52 218

Prairie View 2016 120 109 107 103 112 83 634 633 +1
2015 98 100 107 110 77 76 568

Prairie Knolls MS 2016 324 336 660 660 0
2015 321 287 601

Central MS 2016 279 279 279 0
2015 268 267

Central HS 2016 289 256 257 240 1042 1044 -2
2015 256 253 255 239 1003

TOTAL DISTRICT Head 99 354 343 352 320 324 291 324 336 279 289 256 257 240 4064 4055 +9
81 312 325 317 316 272 301 321 287 268 256 253 255 239 3795

Special Education 
Out-of-District 1 5 2 4 1 8 2 6 2 1 3 2 3 10 50

 
Contract Class Size Language Aide/Split 6th Day Enrollment Year to Date +/-
Kindergarten - 2 23/26 *6th day 2015/2016 - 3783
Grade 3 - 5 25/28 4005 59
Grade 6-8 30 split

Grades 9th -12th 31 split
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