
Board of Education Regular Meeting
Thursday, April 14, 2016 8:00 PM Central

Board Room
1301 Centennial Avenue
Utica, NE 68456-0187  

  
Mark Avery:   Present   
Jodi Cast:   Present   
Wayne Heine:   Present   
Larry Paxson:   Present   
Jason Richters:   Present   
Doug Tonniges:   Present   
Present: 6.
 

1. MEETING CALL TO ORDER

1. Reading of Public Meeting Notice

1. Open Meetings Act

2. Roll Call

3. Consent Agenda

1. Additions/Deletions and Agenda Approval

2. Consider Minutes of Previous Meeting(s) and Their Approval

3. Consider Current Bills and Their Approval

4. Consider Activity Accounts and Treasurer's Report

4. Introduction of Guests; Invite Comments

2. OLD BUSINESS

3. NEW BUSINESS

1. CONSIDER REQUEST OF CENTENNIAL FCCLA
Motion to approve the request to participate in the FCCLA National Leadership 
Conference Passed with a motion by Wayne Heine and a second by Doug Tonniges.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

2. CONSIDER REQUEST OF CENTENNIAL FBLA
Motion to approve the request to participate in the FBLA National Leadership 
Conference Passed with a motion by Jason Richters and a second by Doug Tonniges.



Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

3. CONSIDER APPROVAL OF THE 2016-2017 SCHOOL CALENDAR
Motion to approve the 2016-2017 school calendar Passed with a motion by Mark 
Avery and a second by Jodi Cast.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

4. CONSIDER APPROVAL OF TEXTBOOK PURCHASES FOR 2016-17
Motion to approve the textbook purchases for 2016-17 Passed with a motion by 
Wayne Heine and a second by Mark Avery.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

5. CONSIDER NEW HIRES
Motion to approve the new hires as presented Passed with a motion by Doug 
Tonniges and a second by Jason Richters.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

6. CONSIDER COURSE APPROVAL FOR HORIZONTAL MOVEMENT
Motion to approve the courses for horizontal movement for Mrs. Boss, Mr. Polk, 
Mrs. Barjenbruch & Mr. Barjenbruch Passed with a motion by Jason Richters and a 
second by Mark Avery.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

7. APPROVE AMENDMENT TO INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT WITH SEWARD & 
YORK PUBLIC SCHOOLS FOR AN AGRONOMY ACADEMY

Motion to approve the Amendment to the Agronomy Academy Interlocal Agreement 
Passed with a motion by Jodi Cast and a second by Doug Tonniges.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

8. CONSIDER ROOF BIDS
Motion to approve the bid from ___McKinnis Roofing____________. ____________ 
Passed with a motion by Wayne Heine and a second by Larry Paxson.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea



Yea: 6, Nay: 0

9. CONSIDER TECHNOLOGY PURCHASES
Motion to approve the technology requests as presented Passed with a motion by 
Jason Richters and a second by Mark Avery.
Mark Avery: Yea, Jodi Cast: Yea, Wayne Heine: Yea, Larry Paxson: Yea, Jason 
Richters: Yea, Doug Tonniges: Yea
Yea: 6, Nay: 0

10. DISCUSSION OF LEGISLATIVE ISSUES

11. BOARD MEMBER REPORTS

12. ADMINISTRATOR REPORTS

4. ADJOURN



















The Centennial FBLA Chapter attended the State Leadership Conference in Omaha on April 7th-9th. The 
students did an excellent job of representing Centennial.  Jesse Hartshorn, Nolan Hahn, and Tiffany 
Scheele created a business plan which placed 5th and qualified them to compete at the FBLA National 
Leadership Conference in Atlanta this summer from June 29th – July 3rd.  The state of Nebraska FBLA 
organization organizes a travel package for all state members and advisers who qualify for nationals that 
include transportation and lodging to and from Atlanta.  The approximate cost of this conference would 
be $1,500/person for a total of $6,000.  We ask that you consider providing the funds to allow us to 
represent Centennial at the national level. Centennial FBLA has qualified students for national events for 
the past 4 years and this would be another excellent opportunity for our students to represent our 
school at the national level.  These three students spent a lot of time working on this 25 page business 
plan and I am very proud of their accomplishment and their award is well deserved.  The students would 
greatly appreciate if you would allow them to pursue this opportunity.  Thank you for your 
consideration. 
 
Mr. Barjenbruch 





4/14/2016

Social Studies Courses Cost

US History (7th Gd) $4,700.00

Geography (8th Gd) $4,700.00

World History (9th Gd) $4,700.00

7-9th Gd - shipping $1,057.50

American History (10-12th Gd) $3,884.00

American Government (11-12th $6,121.54

10-12th Gd - shipping $820

TOTAL SS REQUEST $25,983.07

Century 21® Jr. Computer
Applications with Keyboarding $1,880

Reading Consumables $1,000

Total Amount Requested $28,863.07

Secondary Textbook Requisitions

Updating our JH
keyboarding curriculum -
this will allow us to do
keyboarding along with
some applications

7th, 8th, & 9th grade
reading materials
(workbooks, etc.)
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 AMENDMENT TO AGRICULTURAL ACADEMY INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 

 
 This Amendment is made and entered into on this ___ day of 

__________, 2016, between Seward County School District 80-0567, 
commonly known as Centennial Public Schools (“Centennial”), Seward County 

School District 80-0009, commonly known as Seward Public Schools 
(“Seward”), and York County School District 93-0012, commonly known as 

York Public Schools (“York”).  This is an amendment to the Agricultural 
Academy Interlocal Agreement (“Agreement”) entered into in July 2013, a 

copy of which is marked as Exhibit A, attached hereto, and incorporated herein 
by this reference.   In consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein, 

it is agreed by the parties as follows: 
 

Section 5 of the Agreement is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the 
following Section 5: 

 

5. Employment of Teacher.  
 

A. One of the Districts shall employ a teacher for the Academy on a 
full-time or part-time basis as determined by the Board.  The 

Board shall determine which District shall responsible for paying 
the teacher’s salary and providing fringe benefits in accordance 

with the applicable negotiated agreement with the selected 
District’s education association and/or its policies.  The Districts 

(or their foundations, if any) expect to receive donations from 
private entities to fund the cost of the teacher, and such private 

donations shall first be used to reimburse the employing District 
(or its foundation) for any teacher-related costs and expenses.  In 

the event that private donations are insufficient to pay all teacher-
related costs and expenses, the Districts shall share the total 

remaining cost of the teacher equally, including but not limited to 

salary or compensation, state and federal taxes, retirement, and 
mileage (if any).  The non-employing Districts shall reimburse the 

employing District for the cost of the teacher no later than the 
employing District’s last day of each semester unless agreed 

otherwise in writing. 
B. The employing District’s Superintendent shall have the general 

responsibility for supervising and overseeing teacher’s work; for 
seeing to the payment of teacher's salary and fringe benefits; for 

administering appropriate discipline; for adjusting teacher's 
grievances; and for managing and supervising teacher in 

accordance with the employing District’s policies and subject to 
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the direction of its Board of Education. 

 
The address for Steve Williams in section 20 of the Agreement is replaced with 

the following: 
 

  Steve Williams, Legal Counsel 
  KSB School Law, P.C., L.L.O. 

  301 S. 13th Street, Suite 210 
  Lincoln, NE 68508 

  steve@ksbschoollaw.com 

 Except as provided above, all other terms of the Agreement shall remain 
in full force and effect. 

 
SEWARD COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 80-0567,  

A/K/A AS CENTENNIAL PUBLIC SCHOOLS  
 

 
_________________________________  Date:  April ___, 2016 

President, Board of Education 
 

SEWARD COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 80-0009,  

A/K/A SEWARD PUBLIC SCHOOLS  
 

 
_________________________________  Date:  April ___, 2016 

President, Board of Education 
 

 
YORK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 93-0012,  

A/K/A YORK PUBLIC SCHOOLS  
  

 
_________________________________  Date:  April ___, 2016 

President, Board of Education 
 



Centennial Public Schools 2016

Contractor Base Bid Alternate Bid Deck Repair Add- Base Add-Alternate Bond

Standard Color Premuim Color Tectum Standard Color Premium Color

Independent Roofing no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Roof Masters 155,000$           161,500$           17.50$        85,000$         93,750$         x

Riverside Construction no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Weathercraft Roofing no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

McKinnis Roofing 122,800$           127,200$           15.00$        99,000$         102,570$       x
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To: Dan Tesar, Technology Coordinator, Centennial Public Schools 

From: Chris Wall - The Garland Company 

Date: March 25, 2016 

Re: Recommendation for District Re-Roof Project(s) 

Mr. Tesar, 

Upon reviewing the bid results for the 2016 District Re-roof project(s), I am recommending that the 
contract be awarded to lowest bidder for “Base Bid” or “Alternate Bid” as well as “Add Bid”. The school 
district should accept the “Bids” provided by McKinnis Roofing.   I have summarized the bid scenarios 
below: 

McKinnis Roofing is determined to be lowest bidder in every scenario: 

Base Bid- McKinnis is low by $32,200, total bid of $122,800 

Alternate Bid- McKinnis is low by $34,300, total bid of $127,200 

When including the “Add-Base” McKinnis in low by a combined $18,200, with a total bid of $221,800 

When including “Add-Alternate”- McKinnis is low by a combined $25,480, with a total bid of $229,700 

**The difference between the ”Base Bid’ and “Alternate Bid” is color category 

** The “Base Bid” includes 130 sq. ft. of Tectum Deck replacement (of which is the replacement of the 
insulation fallen down that was once adhered to the concrete block). Any additional tectum replacement 
determined to be necessary, will be done on a square foot basis at a cost of $15.00/ sq. ft. 

The contracting firm that has been determined to be the “Low Bidder” on this project has been 
contacted, is satisfied with the results of the bid, and is prepared to complete the project per 
specification. Please refer to bid tabulation form. 

If you have any further questions, please do to hesitate to contact me. 

 

Sincerely, 

 

Chris Wall 

The Garland Company       



 
 

April 2016 – Board Technology Request 
D. Tesar – 4/11/2016 

Ref. Qty Item Vendor Budget Subtotal 

A 20 Dell Optiplex 7440 AIO Desktop Computers Insight Public Sector Hardware $19,504.60 
 Desktop computers to replace those in the east business lab (Mrs. Pankoke) which will be seven years-old this summer.  $975.23/ea 

   

B 5 Dell Optiplex 7440 AIO Desktop Computers Insight Public Sector Hardware $4,654.35 
 Desktop computers to replace the secretaries’ computers which will be six years-old this summer.  $930.87/ea 

   

      
  

   

      

  

     
  

   

      
  

      
  

      
  

   

      

  

     

  

   

      
  

   

  Total Request: $24,158.95 
 



Description
OptiPlex 7440 AIO XCTO (210-AFLX)
16GB (2x8G) 2133MHz DDR4 Memory (370-ACHW)
Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Keyboard English Black (580-ADJC)
Intel Integrated Graphics, Dell OptiPlex (490-BBFG)
Intel DB WLAN 8260 Software (555-BCOG)
SSD as first boot drive (340-ABIG)
M.2 256GB SATA Class 20 Self Encrypting Solid State Drive (400-AIVN)
Screw for M.2 Device (773-BBBE)
Win 10 Pro 64 English, French, Spanish (619-AHKN)
US Order (332-1286)
7440 AIO 23.8, FHD NonTouch with Camera, Integrated Graphics, Platinum PSU (329-BCSP)
Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black (275-BBBW)
ENERGY STAR Version 6.0 7440 AIO (387-BBKP)
8x Slimline DVD+/-RW Drive (429-AAWF)
Intel Dual Band Wireless 8260 (802.11ac) + Bluetooth (555-BCOY)
System Power Cord (Philipine/TH/US) (450-AAOJ)
Windows 10 OS Professional Recovery 64bit - DVD (620-AAYW)
Desktop BTO Standard shipment (800-BBIO)
Not Selected in this Configuration (817-BBBC)
Kace K1000 Express (525-0057)
Safety/Environment and Regulatory Guide (English/French/Dutch) (340-AGIK)
Dell Limited Hardware Warranty Plus Service (997-6870)
Onsite/In-Home Service After Remote Diagnosis 4 Years (997-6873)
No UPC Label (389-BCGW)
TPM Enabled (329-BBJL)
No Out-of-Band Systems Management (631-AAUO)
No Diagnostic/Recovery CD media (340-ABJI)
Placemat Documentation (340-ASPK)
Intel Core i5-6500 Processor (Quad Core, 6MB, 4T, 3.2GHz, 65W) (338-BHUF)
No DDPE Encryption Software (954-3465)
Shipping Label for DAO (389-BBUU)
Ship Material for OptiPlex 7440 AIO (389-BHTB)
Height Adjustable Stand for OptiPlex 7440 (575-BBHR)
No FGA (817-BBBB)
No Accessories (461-AABV)
No DDP|ESS Software (634-BENZ)
PowerDVD Software not included (632-BBBJ)
No Additional Hard Drive (401-AADF)
Regulatory Label Opti 7040 AIO Non Touch (389-BHSV)
No Intel Rapid Start or Smart Connect (409-BBCF)
Intel Core i5 Processor Label (389-BHIB)
Non-Touch LCD, Dell OptiPlex AIO (391-BBDM)
Microsoft Office 30 Day Trial (658-BCSB)
Kickstart Product Registration (340-AJFC)
Dell Data Protection System Tools Digital Delivery/DT (422-0008)
SupportAssist (525-BBCL)
Dell(TM) Digital Delivery Cirrus Client (640-BBLW)
Dell Client System Update (Updates latest Dell Recommended BIOS, Drivers, Firmware and Apps),OptiPlex (658-BBMR)
Waves Maxx Audio Royalty (658-BBNF)
OS Recovery (658-BCUV)
OS Recovery (658-BCUV)
NO RAID (817-BBBN)

atesar
Text Box
Office Desktops
Quantity: 5



Description
OptiPlex 7440 AIO XCTO (210-AFLX)
16GB (2x8G) 2133MHz DDR4 Memory (370-ACHW)
Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Keyboard English Black (580-ADJC)
AMD Radeon R7 A370, 2GB (490-BCTH)
Intel DB WLAN 8260 Software (555-BCOG)
SSD as first boot drive (340-ABIG)
M.2 256GB SATA Class 20 Self Encrypting Solid State Drive (400-AIVN)
Screw for M.2 Device (773-BBBE)
Win 10 Pro 64 English, French, Spanish (619-AHKN)
US Order (332-1286)
7440 AIO 23.8, FHD NonTouch with Camera, Discrete Graphics , Platinum PSU (329-BCSW)
Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black (275-BBBW)
ENERGY STAR Version 6.0 7440 AIO (387-BBKP)
8x Slimline DVD+/-RW Drive (429-AAWF)
Intel Dual Band Wireless 8260 (802.11ac) + Bluetooth (555-BCOY)
System Power Cord (Philipine/TH/US) (450-AAOJ)
Windows 10 OS Professional Recovery 64bit - DVD (620-AAYW)
Desktop BTO Standard shipment (800-BBIO)
Not Selected in this Configuration (817-BBBC)
Kace K1000 Express (525-0057)
Safety/Environment and Regulatory Guide (English/French/Dutch) (340-AGIK)
Dell Limited Hardware Warranty Plus Service (997-6870)
Onsite/In-Home Service After Remote Diagnosis 4 Years (997-6873)
No UPC Label (389-BCGW)
TPM Enabled (329-BBJL)
No Out-of-Band Systems Management (631-AAUO)
No Diagnostic/Recovery CD media (340-ABJI)
Placemat Documentation (340-ASPK)
Intel Core i5-6500 Processor (Quad Core, 6MB, 4T, 3.2GHz, 65W) (338-BHUF)
No DDPE Encryption Software (954-3465)
Shipping Label for DAO (389-BBUU)
Ship Material for OptiPlex 7440 AIO (389-BHTB)
Height Adjustable Stand for OptiPlex 7440 (575-BBHR)
No FGA (817-BBBB)
No Accessories (461-AABV)
No DDP|ESS Software (634-BENZ)
PowerDVD Software not included (632-BBBJ)
No Additional Hard Drive (401-AADF)
Regulatory Label Opti 7040 AIO Non Touch (389-BHSV)
No Intel Rapid Start or Smart Connect (409-BBCF)
Intel Core i5 Processor Label (389-BHIB)
Non-Touch LCD, Dell OptiPlex AIO (391-BBDM)
Microsoft Office 30 Day Trial (658-BCSB)
Kickstart Product Registration (340-AJFC)
Dell Data Protection System Tools Digital Delivery/DT (422-0008)
SupportAssist (525-BBCL)
Dell(TM) Digital Delivery Cirrus Client (640-BBLW)
Dell Client System Update (Updates latest Dell Recommended BIOS, Drivers, Firmware and Apps),OptiPlex (658-BBMR)
Waves Maxx Audio Royalty (658-BBNF)
OS Recovery (658-BCUV)
OS Recovery (658-BCUV)
NO RAID (817-BBBN)

atesar
Text Box
East Business Lab
Quantity: 20

atesar
Highlight

atesar
Text Box
Upgraded graphics card



Secondary Principal’s Report 

April 14, 2016 

 

 

1. Several spring events on the horizon… 

a. This week 

i. Tomorrow – Last 2-hour late start inservice of 2015-16 

ii. 4/16 – Prom at York CC 

b. Coming soon 

i. Home Track Meets 

1. Centennial HS TR Inv. - 4/19 

2. Seward Co. JH TR Meet - 4/21 

3. Centennial JH TR Inv. - 4/25 

ii. Athletic Banquet – Friday, 4/29 

c. Calendar is pretty full from here on out! 

 

 

2. NeSA testing is underway… 

a. Assessing math this week & will be assessing science and reading over the 

next couple weeks 

 

 

3. Graduation preparations are underway… 

a. Letters to seniors went out this week, working w/ PJ on ordering flowers, 

etc. 

b. Making final preparations with seniors over next week or so… 

 

 

4. Update on secondary secretary position… 

a. Kara Fehlhafer accepted the secondary secretary position and has started 

training with Velma… 

 

   



SUPERINTENDENT’S REPORT 
 
April 14, 2016 
 
 
 
1. The 2015 Nebraska School Law Seminar will be held on Friday, June 10th in Kearney at the Holiday Inn.  Registration 

begins at 7:30 a.m., conference at 8:00 a.m. and it should be finished up around 4:00 p.m.  If you would like me to 
register you, just let me know.  They will also hold a NASB Member Golf Outing on Thursday, June 9th at the Kearney 
Country Club at 11:00 a.m. 
 

2. We will be celebrating Staff Appreciation Week on April 25th through the 29th. 
 
3. Graduation will be held on Saturday, May 14th.  We need to decide who will hand out diplomas.  As a reminder, John 

graduates from Hastings College on that day as well. 
 

4. The NSBA Conference in Boston was exceptional!  Some of the best sessions that I have went to and the selection of 
sessions was very good.  I would encourage you to think about attending next year in Denver, March 25th through the 
27th. 

 
5. Fairbury was accepted into the Southern Nebraska Conference last week starting next year.  They will take the place of 

Tri County. 
 

6. Just a reminder that we have tentatively set the board retreat for June 20th. 
 



   

   

   

Board of Education Meeting    

Special Education Summary   
April 14, 2016   

   

     

   

I. April 1 Childfind – Birth to 3 Screening / Results 

 3 children attended with parents 

 Partnership with Sixpence 

 Collaboration with St. Paul Preschool 

 

II. Autism Conference / Next Steps 

 Staff Priorities 

 Continue planning with Lenette Sprunk (Assistive Technology)  

and Mary Flory (Autism Network) 

 Develop activities and provide equipment to benefit verified students with 

sensory processing difficulties.   

 

III. Preschool   

 May 13 / New Student Welcome Activities 

 Social Play 

 Explore the preschool classrooms 

 Meet teachers and staff  

   
   
   
   

 

 



Elementary Principal’s Report 
Marni Parrack 
April 14, 2016 
 

1. Elementary Activities from 3/15 - 4/14 
a. :Elementary students attended Musical Dress Rehearsal 
b. Interviews for Special Education and Kindergarten opening 
c. Reading Data Meetings 
d. York Children’s Theater Performance 
e. NeSA  Assembly 
f. Mr. Polk attended National PE Conference 
g. Bronco PRIDE Assembly 
h. NeSA Testing 
i. DARE Graduation 

 
2. Upcoming Elementary Activities 
a. April 15 - Kindergarten Visitation Day (no school for kindergarten) 
b. April 18 - Math Data Meetings 
c. April 22 - Kindergarten Grandparents Day 
d. April 26 - Reading Data Meetings 
e. May 3 - Elementary Music Program 
f. May 4 - Good Touch/Bad Touch Presentation by Hope Crisis Center 
g. May 13 - Elementary Track and Field Day 
h. May 16 - Kindergarten Graduation 

 
3. Enrollment as of 4/14/16: 

 Preschool 3s:  17 
 Preschool 4s:  25 
 Kindergarten:  29 
 1st Grade:       21 
 2nd Grade:     33 
 3rd Grade:     29 
 4th Grade:     29 
 5th Grade:     30 
 6th Grade:     27 

 
Total Enrollment:  PreK-6 - 240 
Total Enrollment:  K-6 - 198 
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