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AGENDA
April 7, 2026

Please silence all cell phones

Pledge of Allegiance and Prayer

Roll call

Inform public of the posting of the open meeting laws

The meeting notice was published in the Columbus Telegram on March
31st and the Humphrey Democrat on April 1, 2026.

Approve the agenda as written

Approve the minutes for March 24th, 2026 as written
Discussion and possible action on the following:
County Treasurer - Jenny Reppert

9.a. Consideration of accepting delinquent tax list presented by the
Platte County Treasurer

Consideration to Remove from the Table Northern Hills Second
Subdivision

10.a. Consideration of Preliminary & Final Plat

10.b. Consideration of Adopting Resolution 26-08 for Northern Hills
Second Subdivision

Highway Department

11.a. Consideration of Utility Permits
11.a.1.  Frontier Communications
11.a.2. Larry Rasmussen & Sons
11.a.3. Casey Rasmussen

11.b. Consideration of Culvert Bids

I1.c. Road report

Committee Reports

Motion to accept, file, and credit the proper accounts on
correspondence: Nebraska Bankers Insurance and Services Company —
Bank Compliance Report for 1/31/26 and 2/28/26, Cancel General Fund
check no. 3724 in the amount of $880.28 to Security Equipment Supply
- double payment by IT Department, Department of Water, Energy and
Environment - NPDES General Permit for CAFOs Confining Cattle for
Went Llvestock, LLC Concentrated Animal Feeding Operation, Stanton
County Planning Commission Notice of Public Hearing regarding the
amendment of the Zoning Matrix, Charter Communications - Upcoming
Changes, Treasurer Receipts $154,663.66

Motion to approve all claims except for Trouba Law.
14.a. To approve the Trouba Law claim



15. Public Comments
16. Motion to Adjourn to April 21, 2026

The agenda for the meeting subject to change, is kept continuously current and is available for
public inspection at the office of the County Clerk in the Platte County Courthouse, Columbus,
Nebraska.



04/03/2026 Platte Page 1
10:51 AM DELINQUENT TAX LISTING
For Tax Years 2021 - 2024
RealEstate

Name Perm ID Statement # District Total Delinquent
AERNI, CARLE & LOIS J 0710030149 2023-015825-RealEstate 105 492.07
AERNI, CARLE & LOIS J 0710030149 2024-016070-RealEstate 105 788.18
ALBA-ARCADIA, ALEJANDRO 0710019544 2024-010525-RealEstate 16 152.24
ANDERSON/THOMAS A & DONNA J 0710035777 2022-011910-RealEstate 24 3,546.42
ANDREASEN/MICKEY R & PEGGY J 0710058422 2022-019116-RealEstate 177 11,245.56
APPLIED CONNECTIVE TECHNOLOGIES 0710135768 2024-010829-RealEstate 16 60.66
AREVALO, KEYZEE AALIHA 0710104909 2024-005267-RealEstate 1 173.76
BIDON, CLINTON J 0710017822 2024-010359-RealEstate 16 4.62
BOSCH/PAMELA E 0710113624 2022-006425-RealEstate 1 618.58
BROCK/MARILYN L 0710048293 2022-018213-RealEstate 154 3,306.82
CAMPBELL, TYLER J 0710069041 2024-014690-RealEstate 65 10.50
CERROS lll, FRANCISCO A 0710154626 2024-010874-RealEstate 16 307.78
CHOHON/DAVID J & MARY E 0710071505 2022-017168-RealEstate 134 642.46
CHOHON/DAVID J & MARY E 0710071505 2023-017235-RealEstate 134 457.44
COLUMBUS HOUSING PARTNERS Il LLC 0710139520 2023-008319-RealEstate 1 290.40
COLUMBUS HOUSING PARTNERS Il LLC 0710139520 2024-008303-RealEstate 1 214.46
ESCOBAR MARROQUIN, ERVIN GEOVANY 0710019138 2024-010473-RealEstate 16 134.70
FISHER, MARQUITA APODAC 0710018613 2022-010223-RealEstate 16 36.46
FISHER, MARQUITA APODAC 0710018613 2023-010211-RealEstate 16 33.98
FISHER, MARQUITA APODAC 0710018613 2024-010420-RealEstate 16 34.70
FUNEZ LOPEZ, JOSE L 0710169291 2024-011675-RealEstate 18 287.70
GARAY GOMEZ, GUILLERMO ANTONIO 0710089782 2024-003324-RealEstate 1 177.48
HERNANDEZ, MARIBEL 0710104846 2024-005260-RealEstate 1 237.42
HERNANDEZ, VERONICA 0710127645 2024-007887-RealEstate 1 143.60
HOLLMAN/FREDRICK G & SHARON M 0710133514 2022-018275-RealEstate 154 756.66
KAPELS/ELDEN H & LOIS A 0710108185 2022-005720-RealEstate 1 3,073.48
KUNNEMAN/RICHARD K & MARY LOU 0710092806 2022-003723-RealEstate 1 2,919.40
LEON RAMIREZ, CELENE 0710019782 2024-010555-RealEstate 16 58.10
LUCE/DALE G & LINDA J 0710007231 2022-000903-RealEstate 1 1,059.58
LYDAY, LEAH 0710021511 2024-010749-RealEstate 16 51.04
MANUEL, REGINO 0710161325 2024-010900-RealEstate 16 86.36
MARTINEZ, AURELIO 0710131323 2024-007989-RealEstate 1 231.22
MENDOZA RAMIREZ, NESTOR A 0710019929 2024-010574-RealEstate 16 90.31
MOORE, MICHAEL 0710165756 2024-017755-RealEstate 135 392.16
MUHLE/CLARENCE R 0710089593 2022-003308-RealEstate 1 1,410.20
OVERTURF/EDGAR E & DONNA M 0710097076 2022-004228-RealEstate 1 1,632.42
POWERS, JEANETTE 0710127554 2024-017882-RealEstate 140 54.30
SANCHEZ, AHUDEL 0710018802 2024-010433-RealEstate 16 4.40
SANCHEZ, AHUDEL & MARTHA 0710018802 2021-010140-RealEstate 16 6.92
SANCHEZ, AHUDEL & MARTHA 0710018802 2022-010236-RealEstate 16 7.06
SANCHEZ, AHUDEL & MARTHA 0710018802 2023-010224-RealEstate 16 6.58
SIMMERMAN/JERRY D & CONNIE R 0710110243 2022-005987-RealEstate 1 2,656.60
SWANSON/KENNETH E & DIANE C 0710031794 2022-016890-RealEstate 127 291.86
THOMPSON, ALIKA M 0710030639 2023-016832-RealEstate 127 268.62
THOMPSON, ALIKA M 0710030639 2024-017084-RealEstate 127 254.48
VEIK, JAMES A & JENNIFER LYNN GAYLEN 0710049672 2024-013693-RealEstate 56 21.96
WATCHORN/MARY ELLEN 0710008379 2022-001066-RealEstate 1 98.98
ZYWIEC/MARGO A 0710006916 2022-000858-RealEstate 1 723.12

Total Delinquent Taxes 2021 6.92

Total Delinquent Taxes 2022 34,025.66

Total Delinquent Taxes 2023 1,549.09

Total Delinquent Taxes 2024 3,972.13

Total RealEstate Delinquent 48
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R’S OFFICE
P.0O. Box 967, Columbus, NE 68602 - 402.563.4913 - FAX 402.563.0750
Jcnng Kepper’c, Treasurer Amanda Gilber’c Deputg Co Treasurer
April 7, 2026

Platte County Board of Supervisors
Columbus, Nebraska 68601

Dear Board Members,

Attached you will find a list of delinquent taxes. The figures are the 2021-2024 real estate taxes
that are unpaid as of April 7, 2026. This report is submitted per LB 77-1918.

77-1918. Delinquent taxes; annual report by county treasurer; duty of county board; duty of county attorney; fees; failure to perform duty; penalty; removal, when. On or
before October 1 of each year, the county treasurer shall make a report in writing to the county board setting out a complete list of all real property in the county on which any
taxes are delinquent and which was not sold for want of bidders at the last annual tax sale held in such county. It shall be the duty of the county board, at its first meeting
held after the making of such report, to carefully examine the same, and while it may direct the issuance of tax sale certificates to the county upon any real
property upon which there are any delinquent taxes, it shall, as to all real property upon which taxes are delinquent for three or more years, either enter an order directing
the foreclosure of the lien of such taxes as provided in section 77-1901 or enter an order for the county treasurer to issue tax sale certificates to the county covering the
delinquent taxes upon such real property, to be foreclosed upon in the manner and at the time provided in sections 77-1901 to 77-1918.The county board shall have authority
to direct the county attorney to commence foreclosure of such liens or certificates or it may designate another attorney to commence such actions, and the county board is
authorized to pay any reasonable fee for such foreclosures to be assessed as costs. In the event the county attorney is designated to bring the action, the fee shall be fifty
dollars for each cause of action in addition to his or her salary to be retained by him or her, but it shall not be paid to the county attorney until the decree is entered and the
property sold pursuant to such decree. No fee shall be allowed the county attorney for such foreclosures in counties having a population of more than one hundred thousand
inhabitants. Any county treasurer, county attorney, or member of the county board who willfully fails, neglects, or refuses to perform the duties imposed by such sections shall
be guilty of official misdemeanor and subject to removal from office as provided in sections 23-2001 to 23-2009. If the county board fails to dismiss the county attorney for
failure to foreclose liens, the county board shall be removed. Any member of a county board who, upon a motion duly made by one member of such board to remove a county
attorney from office who has failed to foreclose liens, does not vote for such motion or any member who votes to retain a county attorney in office after it has been brought to
the board's attention that he or she has failed to foreclose liens shall be subject to removal from office as provided in sections 23-2001 to 23-2009. SourceLaws 1943, c. 176,
§ 18, p. 619; R.S.1943, § 77-1918; Laws 1961, c. 388, § 1, p. 1183; Laws 1971, LB 743, § 2; Laws 1986, LB 531, § 4; Laws 1992, LB 1063, § 179; Laws 1992, Second Spec.
Sess., LB 1, § 152; Laws 1995, LB 488, § 1. AnnotationsPursuant to this section, a county must choose to foreclose real estate tax liens under either the lien method set forth
at section 77-1901 or the certificate method set forth in section 77-1902. County of Seward v. Andelt, 251 Neb. 713, 559 N.W.2d 465 (1997).Laws 1971, L.B. 743, which
amended this section was effective so far as compensation was provided for county attorneys as soon as it could become operative under the Constitution, but fee not
payable until property sold pursuant to decree. State ex rel. Nebraska State Bar Assn. v. Holscher, 193 Neb. 729, 230 N.W.2d 75 (1975).County attorney is obligated to
institute and prosecute actions by county to foreclose tax lien. State ex rel. Nebraska State Bar Assn. v. Conover, 166 Neb. 132, 88 N.W.2d 135 (1958).

Tax Sale/20160ct1SaleUnsold.doc

Respectfully Submitted,

Jenny Reppert
Platte County Treasurer

STATE OF NEBRASKSA )
PLATTE COUNTY )

We, the Board of Supervisors of said County hereby
accept and approve of the within

Dated this day of , 2026

, Chairperson




RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF PLATTE COUNTY, NEBRASKA
TO APPROVE THE PLAT OF NORTHERN HILLS SECOND SUBDIVISION, PLATTE
COUNTY, NEBRASKA, WHICH IS LOCATED IN THE WEST 1/2 OF THE SOUTHWEST 1/4
OF SECTION 25, T18N, R1W OF THE 6™ P.M., PLATTE COUNTY, NEBRASKA

WHEREAS, J Z & B, LLC, a Nebraska limited liability company, is the owner of real estate,
which is a tract of land located in part of the West 1/2 of the Southwest 1/4 of Section 25, T18N, R1W
of the 6" P.M., Platte County, Nebraska, more particularly described as follows:

Atract of land located in the West 1/2 of the Southwest 1/4 of Section 25, T18N, R1W
of the 6th P.M., Platte County, Nebraska, more particularly described as follows:
Beginning at the Northwest Corner of the Southwest 1/4 of Section 25, T18N, R1W of
the 6th P.M., Platte County, Nebraska; thence N 88°07'28" E on the North line of the
West 1/2 of said Southwest 1/4, 1329.71 feet to the Northeast Corner of the West 1/2
of said Southwest 1/4; thence S 01°41'39" E on the East line of the West 1/2 of said
Southwest 1/4, 1739.55 feet to the Northeast corner of Lot 1, Block D, Northern Hills
Subdivision; thence S 88°09'23" W on the North line of said Lot 1, Block D, 169.94
feet; thence S 88°16'49" W, 60.00 feet; thence S01°37'02" E on the West Right-of-Way
line of Hillside Plaza, 20.00 feet to the Northeast Corner of Lot 8, Block C, Northern
Hills Subdivision; thence S 88°10'24" W on the North line of said Lot 8, Block C,
170.03 feet to the Northeast Corner of Lot 1, Block C, Northern Hills Subdivision,
170.21 feet to the Northwest corner of said Lot 1, Block C; thence N 01°54'26" W on
the East Right-of-Way line of Grandview Plaza, 20.04 feet; thence S 88°05'46" W,
59.78 feet to the Northeast corner of Lot 9, Block B, Northern Hills Subdivision;
thence N 01°41'49" W on the East line of Tract 2 as surveyed by Eric M. Breuer,
LS#586, dated February 22, 2021, 383.62 feet to the Northeast corner of said Tract 2;
thence S 88°10'57" W on the North line of said Tract 2, 331.94 feet to the Northwest
corner of said Tract 2; thence N 00°41'20" E on the East line of a tract of land
previously surveyed by Clyde R. Flowers, Jr., LS#357, dated April 27, 2020, 34.10 feet
to the Northeast corner of said previously surveyed tract of land; thence S 88°14'43"
W on the North line of said previously surveyed tract, 337.02 feet; thence S01°39'14"
E, 556.31 feet to the Southwest corner of said previously surveyed tract of land;
thence S 88°24'17" W, 32.99 feet to a point on the West line of said Southwest 1/4;
thence N 01°39'19" W on said West line, 1876.37 feet to the Point of Beginning,
containing 47.22 acres more or less.

all of which is situated within the boundaries of Platte County, Nebraska, and not within the
boundaries of any incorporated city or village; and

WHEREAS, said Owner has laid out said land into lots, streets, and roadways, with
appropriate utility easement areas under the name of Northern Hills Second Subdivision, and has
caused an accurate plat thereof to be made, designating the land so laid out and particularly
describing the lots, streets and roadways belonging to said subdivision, as provided by law, a copy of
which plat is submitted herewith; and



WHEREAS, said Owner has executed an instrument of dedication, all as provided by law, a
copy of which is submitted herewith; and

WHEREAS, said plat has attached thereon a certificate of Terry L. Schulz, PLS#550,
Registered Land Surveyor, a competent land surveyor, dated March 18, 2026, certifying the same as
provided by law; and

WHEREAS, the Owner, is platting the area and will impose covenants, conditions, and
restrictions against future owners of lots in said subdivision.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF PLATTE COUNTY,
NEBRASKA, that said plat for Northern Hills Second Subdivision, certified by Terry L. Schulz,
PLS#550, a competent land surveyor, dated March 18, 2026, be and the same hereby is in all things
approved; and the lots, streets and roadways, with appropriate utility easements, appearing on said
plat and described in said Deed of Dedication be approved.

INTRODUCED BY SUPERVISOR:

SECONDED BY SUPERVISOR:

PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS DAY OF , 2026.

Chairman of the Board of Supervisors of
Platte County, Nebraska

County Clerk of Platte County

STATE OF NEBRASKA )
) sS.
COUNTY OF PLATTE )

| the undersigned, Platte County, Nebraska Clerk, do hereby certify that the foregoingis a
true copy of the original record as the same appears in my office.

WITNESS my hand and official seal this day of , 2026.

County Clerk of Platte Count



DEED OF DEDICATION
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS:

That JZ & B, LLC, a Nebraska limited liability company, is the Owner of a tract of land
legally described as:

A tract of land located in the West 1/2 of the Southwest 1/4 of Section 25,
T18N, R1W of the 6th P.M., Platte County, Nebraska, more particularly
described as follows: Beginning at the Northwest Corner of the Southwest 1/4
of Section 25, T18N, R1W of the 6th P.M., Platte County, Nebraska; thence N
88°07'28" E on the North line of the West 1/2 of said Southwest 1/4, 1329.71
feet to the Northeast Corner of the West 1/2 of said Southwest 1/4; thence S
01°41'39" E on the East line of the West 1/2 of said Southwest 1/4, 1739.55
feet to the Northeast corner of Lot 1, Block D, Northern Hills Subdivision;
thence S 88°09'23" W on the North line of said Lot 1, Block D, 169.94 feet;
thence S 88°16'49" W, 60.00 feet; thence S 01°37'02" E on the West Right-of-
Way line of Hillside Plaza, 20.00 feet to the Northeast Corner of Lot 8, Block C,
Northern Hills Subdivision; thence S 88°10'24" W on the North line of said Lot
8, Block C, 170.03 feetto the Northeast Corner of Lot 1, Block C, Northern Hills
Subdivision, 170.21 feet to the Northwest corner of said Lot 1, Block C; thence
N 01°54'26" W on the East Right-of-Way line of Grandview Plaza, 20.04 feet;
thence S 88°05'46" W, 59.78 feet to the Northeast corner of Lot 9, Block B,
Northern Hills Subdivision; thence N 01°41'49" W on the East line of Tract 2 as
surveyed by Eric M. Breuer, LS#586, dated February 22, 2021, 383.62 feet to
the Northeast corner of said Tract 2; thence S 88°10'57" W on the North line of
said Tract 2, 331.94 feet to the Northwest corner of said Tract 2; thence N
00°41'20" E on the East line of a tract of land previously surveyed by Clyde R.
Flowers, Jr., LS#357, dated April 27, 2020, 34.10 feet to the Northeast corner
of said previously surveyed tract of land; thence S 88°14'43" W on the North



line of said previously surveyed tract, 337.02 feet; thence S 01°39'14" E,
556.31 feet to the Southwest corner of said previously surveyed tract of land;
thence S 88°24'17" W, 32.99 feet to a point on the West line of said Southwest
1/4; thence N 01°39'19" W on said West line, 1876.37 feet to the Point of
Beginning, containing 47.22 acres more or less.

Said Owner has caused the above-described real estate to be laid out into lots,
blocks, streets, roads, drives, and avenues, with appropriate utility easements under the
name of NORTHERN HILLS SECOND SUBDIVISION, designating explicitly the land so laid
out and particularly describing lots, blocks, streets, roads, drives, avenues and utility
easements belonging to said SUBDIVISION, a final plat of which bearing the survey date of
March 18, 2026, and certified by Terry L. Schulz, PLS#550, is attached hereto.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Owner named herein has executed these presents this
___dayof , 2026.

JZ & B, LLC, a Nebraska limited liability company

By:

Chad Anderson, Authorized Representative

STATE OF NEBRASKA )

) sS.
COUNTY OF PLATTE )
The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me on the day
of , 2026, by Chad Anderson, authorized representative of JZ & B, LLC, on

behalf of the limited liability company.

Notary Public

INTRODUCED BY SUPERVISOR:

SECONDED BY SUPERVISOR:

PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS DAY OF , 2026.

Chairman of the Board of Supervisors of
Platte County, Nebraska




County Clerk of Platte County

STATE OF NEBRASKA )
) sS.
COUNTY OF PLATTE )

| the undersigned, Platte County, Nebraska Clerk, do hereby certify that the foregoingis a
true copy of the original record as the same appears in my office.

WITNESS my hand and official seal this day of , 2026.

County Clerk of Platte County



CULVERT BIDS —-rroee e March 26, 2026 CULVERT BIDS ~—--—--——-- iarch 2026 CULYE March 26, 2026
' MIDWEST SALES AND SERVICE ACE/EATON - METAL CULVERTS
OFTION 1 —-—- ANNULAR RIVETED QPTION 1 -—- ANNULAR RIVETED OPTION 1 - ANNULAR RIVETED
Dlameter Price Per Prics Per Foot Diameter Price Per lee Par Foot Dlameter Price Par Price Per Faot
Inches | Gauge | Quantlty | Lenath | Foot Delivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered County Pickup
13 15 480 40" 24.43 24.01 18 i6 480 40 17.60 16.72 18 16 480 40 22.60 2148
24 18 200 a0 31.51 30.97 24 16 200 ad 23,60 22.40 24 16 200 40 30.25 28.73
30 14 280 40" 48.85 48.02 El 14 280 ag* 34,60 32.87 30 14 280 40' 46.75 44.43
36 14 520 40" 58.62 57.63 36 14 520 40 42,60 40.47 36 14 520 40' 55.75 5.
48 12 400 4c' 108.68 106.84 48 12 400 40" BO.60 76.57 a8 12 400 a0 104.40 99.20
60 10 480 40 174.35 171.38 &) 10 L 40" 143.60 14117 60, 10 480 40 167.45 156.10
72 10 80 40 222.08 218.31 72 10 80 40 .60 164.52 72 10 80 A0 159.93 185,33
TOTAL 5207,115.20 TOTAL $162,464,00 TOTAL $197,108.40
CPTION 2 —-SPIRAL QPTION 2 -----5P|RAL OPFTICH 2 ---—f SPIRAL
Dlameter Price Per Price Per Foot Diameter Price Per Prlce Per Foot Diameter Price Par Price Par Foot
Inches | Gawge | Quantity | Length | Foot Delivered County Pickup hes Gauge Quantity Length Fout Delivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantlty Length Foot Dellverad County Pickup
18 16 480 40 24,63 $24.01 18 16 ABD 10 17.10 16,25 18| 16 480 40 22.50 21.48
24 i6 200 40' 30.94 53042 24 16 200 40° 23.10 2195 24 16 200 40' 30.25 28.73
30 14 280 4an' 48.85 $48.02 30 14 280 40 34.10 32.40 30 14 2B0 40" 44.43
38 14 520 4 58,62 $57.63 E] 14 520 40" 42,10 40.00 35 14 520 40" 52.95
48, 12 400 40' 105,85 $104.05 48 12 400 40' 80.10 76.10 48] 12 400 40 99.20
60 10 480 40 167.73 $154.88 G0 10 4180 40' 140.10 133.10 60| 10 480 40 159,10
72 10 80 40' 200,29 5196,90 72 10 80 40 173,10 72 10 BG 40 189,53
TOTAL $201,044.40 TOTAL $157,404.00 $197,108.40
OFTION 3 --—SPOT WELDED OFPTION 3 —-SPOT WELDED OPTION 3 ----SPOT WELDED
Diameter Price Par Price Per Foot Diameter Pilca Par Price Per Foot Dlameter Price Par Price Per Foat
Inches | Gauge | Quantity | Length | Foot Delivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Deliverad County Plekup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foat Dellvered County Plckup
18 16 480 40" Mo 8ld No Bld 13 16 480 40' 17.00 16.15 12 16 480 40" No Bid No Bld
24 16 200 a0 No Bid No 8id M.a_ 16 200 ao' 23.00 21.85 29 16 200 40 No Bld No Bld
30: 14 280 40" Na Bld No Bld un_ 14 280 a0’ 34.00 32.30 30 14 280 40" No Bld No 8ld
36 14 520 40 No Bid Mo Bid wm_ 14 520 40" 42.00 39.20 38 14 520 40" No Bld Mo Bld
48 12 400 40 Ne Bld No Bid 48 12 400 40" $0.00 76.00 48 12 400 40" No Bld Na Bld
€0 10 480 40' Na Bld No Bid 60 10 480 40 148.00 140,60 60 10 480 40' Mo Bid No 21d
72 10 80 40 No Bid o Bid 72 10 40 175.00 166,25 72 0 80 4p' Mo Bld Na Bld
TOTAL HVALUEI TOTAL $161,160.00 TOTAL HYALUE|
BANDS - 2' WiTH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2* WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2' WITH WELRED LUGS
Diameter Price Each Each Diameter Price Each Price Each Diamneter Price Each Price Each
Inches | Gauge | Quantity | Width Dellvered County Plekup Inchas Gauge Quantity Width Delivered County Plekup Inches Galige Quantity Width Dellvered County Plckup
18| 16 1 2' $47.88 $46.86 18 15 1 2" $51.00 $48.45 1a 16 1 2! $45,20 $42.96
24| 16 4 $64.08 $63.02 24 16 4 2' $685.00 $65,55 24 16 q 2! $60.50 $57.46
30| 14 H 2 $99.00 $97.70 3| 14 E] 2 $102.00 $96.90 El 14 5 2 $93.50 $88.86
36 14 11 2' $118.08 $117.24 36, 14 11 2 $126.00 $118.70 36 14 11 2 411150 $105.90
10 14 8 2 $354.60 $348.70 10 14 8 2 $444.00 542180 10 14 a 2 $334.90 $318.20
10 12 1 2 $451.68 $444.15 10| 12 1 2 $525,00 4498,75 10 12 1 2' 5399.86 5379.86
TOTAL $5,386.56 ) $6,300.00 TOTAL $5,060.26

NOTE: Totals are all based on delivered FOB Platte Center.

MIDWEST ACE META;L
$11,726.40  58,443.00 $10,848.00
$6,302.00 $4,720,00  $6,050.00
$13,676.00  59,683.00 $13,090.00
$30,482.40  $22,152.00 $28,990.00
543,472.00  $32,240.00 $41,760.00
$83,688.00 $71,328.00 $80,376.00
$17,766,40 $13,8R8.00 $15,994.40

§207,115.20 $162,464.00 $197,108.40
$11,822.40 $8,208,00 $10,848.00
$6,188.00  $4,620.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00 $9,548.00 $13,090.00
530,482.40  $21,892,00 $28,990.00
$42,340.00  $32,040.00 $41,760.00
480,510,440 $67,248.00 $80,376.00
$16,023,20 $13,848.00 $15,994.40

$201,044.40 $157,404.00 $197,108.40
HVALUEI $8,160.00  HVALLE!
HVALUE! $4,600.00 #VALUE!
HVALUE! $9,520.00  #VALUE!
H#VALUEI 521,840.00 #VALUE!
HVALUEL $32,000.00 #VALUEI
HVALUE! $71,040.00  #VALUE!
HVALUE| $14,000.00 #VALUEI
HVALUE! $161,160.00  #VALUE!
$47.88 451.00 $45.20
$256.,32 $276,00 5242.00
$495.00 $510.00 $467.50
$1,298.88 $1,386.00  §1,226.50
$2,836.80 $3,552.00  52,679.20
$451.68 $525.00 $399.86
$5,386.56 $6,300.00  $5,060.26



CULVERT BIDS —~ Marth 26, 2026 CULVERT DIDS - - March §,2026 CULVERT BIDS —-me-memeeeeeeme Maych 26, 2026
MIDWEST SALES ANC SERVICE ACE/EATON - METAL CULVERTS
0PTION 1 - ANNULAR RIVETED OFTION 1 ——- ANNULAR RIVETED OPTION 1 — ANNULAR RIVETED
Dlameter Price Per Prlce Per Foot Dlameter Prica Par Price Par Foot Dlameter Prica P Price Per Foot
inches | Gauge | Guantity | Length | Foot Delivered |  County Pickup fnches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered | County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity ' Length Foot Dellvered County Plckup
12 16 480 40 2443 24.01 18 480 40 17.60 168.72 18, 16 480 40" 22.60 21.48
24 15 200 40 31,51 30.97 24 200 [Dg 23.60 2240 24| 16 200 A0 30,25 28,73
anl 14 280 10 48.85 48,02 30 14 280 a0 34.60 32.87 30 14 280 40' 46.75 44.43
kL 14 530 4an' 58.62 35| i4 520 40 42.60 4047 6! 14 520 40 55.75 52,95
48 12 400 4 108.68 42 12 A0G 40' BD.60 76.57 48! 12 400 40" 104.4D 99.20
¢ 10 480 40 174,35 &0 10 480 40' 148.60 14117 60 10 480 40 16745 159,10
72 10 80 40 222.08 21831 72 10 80 40" 173,60 2 72 10 80 Ll 199,93 188,93
TOTAL $207,115.20 TOTAL $162,464.00 TOTAL $187,108.40
OFTION 2 ——----SPIRAL OFTION 2 ——-5PIRAL OPTION 2 ——-5PIRAL
Diameter Price Par Price Per Foot Olameier Price Per Prica Per Foot Diameter Price Per Price Per Foot
Inches | Gauge | Quanthy | Lengih | Foot Dellvered has Gauge Quantiy Length Foot Deliverad Inches Gauge uantity Length Foot Dellvered County Pickup
18 16 480 A0 24,63 18 16 480 a0' 17.10 18 18 480 40' 22,50 2148
24 16 200 40 30.34 24 15 200 40" 23.10 24 15 200 40 30.25 23.73
30| 14 280 40 4 30| 14 280 40 34.10 £l 14 280 40' 46.75 4443
36 14 520 40 58.62 36 14 520 40 42.10 kL 14 520 40' 358.75 52.45
48 12 400 a0 105.85 a8 12 400 40" 80,10 48 12 400 a0' 29.20
a0 10 480 40 167.73 $164.88 (3] 10 480 40° 140.10 60 10 480 40' 159,10
72! 10 a9 40" 200.29 $196.90 72 10 80 40' 173.10 T2 10 BG 40 189.93
TOTAL $201,044.40 TOTAL $157,404.00 $197,108.40
OFTION 3 —-SPOT WELDED OPTION 3 —5POT WELDED OPTION 3 —SPOT WELDED
Dlameter Prlce Per Price Per Foot Dlameter Price Per Price Per Foot Diameter Price Per Price Per Faot
Inches | Gauge | Quantity | Length | FootDelivered Inches Gauge Cuantity Langth County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Le County Plckup
18 18 480 40" 18 16 480 40' 18 15 480 40 No Bld
1 16 200 A 24 15 200 40" 24 15 200 40' No Bld
an 14 280 40' 30, 14 280 40 a0 14 280 40 Na Bld
36 14 520 10 36 14 520 a0 36 14 520 40" Na Bld
48 12 400 40 48 12 400 40 80.00 76,00 48 12 400 A0' Bid
a0 10 480 10 60| 10 480 ap' 145,00 140.60 60 10 450 40 Na Bid
72 10 80 40' 72 10 8D 40 175.00 166.25 72 10 80 40" o Bid
TOTAL RVALUEI TOTAL $151,160.00 BVALUET
BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2 WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2' W/TH WELDED LUGS
Diarneter Price Each Price Each Dlameter Price £ach Price Each Dlameter Pilee Each Ptica Each
Inches | Gauge | Quantlty [ Width Dellverad County Pickup Inches Gauge Width County Plckup tnches Gauge Quantity Width Delivered Counby Plckup
18| 16 1 2! $47.88 $46.86 15 16 1 2' . $48.45 18 16 1 2! 545.20 $412.96
24 16 4 2 $64.08 $63.02 M 16 4 2' $69,00 §65.55 24 15 4 ' $60.50 357.46
3 14 5 2 599,00 $97.70 30 14 5 2 $102.00 $96.90 30 14 5 2 §493.50 588,86
36 14 11 2 $113.08 $117.24 26| 14 1 2 $126.00 $119.70 36! 14 11 2 511150 $105.90
10| 14 8 2 $354.60 $348.70 o 1 a 2 $444.00 §421.80 10, 14 B 2 3334.90 $313.20
10 1 2 5451.68 544415 16| 12 1 2' $525.00 $498.75 10 12 1 2 $395,85 $379.86
TOTAL 55,386,56 TOTAL 56,300.00 TOTAL $5,060.26

NCTE: Totals are all based on deliverad FOB Platte Center.

MIDWEST ACE METAL
$11,726.40 $8,448.00 $10,848.00
$6,302.00  $4,720.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00  $9,688.00 $13,050.00
$30,482.40 522,152.00 528,980,00
$43,472.00  $32,240,00 $41,760.00
$83,688.00 571,328.00 $80,376.00
$17,766.40  $13,888.00 $15,994.40

$207,115.20 $162,464.00 $157,108.420
§11,822.40  $8,208.00 $10,848.00
56,188.00  $4,620.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00-.  $9,548.00 $13,090.00
$30,482.40  $21,892.00 $28,980.00
$42,340.00  $32,040.00 $41,750.00
880,510.40  $67,248.00 $30,376.00
$16,023.20 $13,843.00 515,994,40
$201,044.40 $157,404.00 $197,108.40
HVALUEI $8,160.00 HVALUEI
HVALUE! $4,600.00  #VALUEI
H#VALUEI $9,520.00  HVALUEI
#VALUE| $21,840,00  #VALUEI
H#VALUE! §32,000.00  HVALUE!
HVALUE! $71,040,00  HVALUE!
H#VALUE! $14,000.00 HVALUE!
HVALUEL $151,160.00  HVALUE|
547.88 $51.00 $45.20
$256.32 $276.00 $242,00
$495.00 $510.00 %467.50
§1,298.88  51,386.00  $1,226.,50
$2,836.80 $3,552,00  $2,679.20
$451.68 $525.00 4399.85
$5,386.56 56,300,000  5$5,060.26



CULVERT BIDS ——-———-—mnen March 26, 2026 CULVERT BIDS -——rremree e March 6,2026 CULVERT BIDS ~--mmmmeremmmmane - March 26, 2026
MIOVWEST SALES AND SEAVICE ACE/EATON - METAL CULVERTS
OPTION 1 --—-- ANNLULAR RIVETED OPTION 1 -wemmm ANNULAR RIVETED TION 1 —-- ANNULAR RIVETED
Diameter Price Par Price Per Foot Dlamater Price Per Price Per Foot lamater Price Per Price Per Foot
Inches | Gauge | Quantlty | Length | Foot Dellvered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantlty Length Foot Delivered Ceunly Plckup Inches Galge Quantity Length Foot Delivered County Pickup
18| 16 480 40' 24.43 24.01 18 16 480 40' 17,60 16.72 18 16 480 a0 22.50 21.48
24 16 200 40' 31,51 24 16 200 40" 23.60 22.40 24| 16 200 40 30.25 2B.73
30 14 280 4p' 48.85 3o, 14 280 40' 34.60 32.87 30| 14 280 40' 46.75 44.43
36 14 520 4¢' 58,62 36 14 520 40 42,50 40.47 36| 14 520 40 55.75 52.95
48 12 400 40' 108.68 48 12 400 40 80.60 76.57 48| 12 400 L 104.40 99,20
60 10 480 40 174.35 ED) 10 480 40' 148.50 141.17 60| 10 AR 40 167,45 158,10
72 10 80 40' 222.08 218,31 72 10 80 40' 173.60 164.92 72 10 80 a0 198,23 185.93
TOTAL $207,115.20 TOTAL 5162,464.00 TOTAL $197,108.40
OPTION 2 -—5PIRAL GPTION 2 —--SPIRAL OPTION 2 --—S5PIRAL
Diameter Price Per Price Per Foot Diametar e Per fce Per Foot Dlareter Price Per Prlce Per Foot
Inches | Gauge | Quantity ngth Foot Delivered County Plckup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Dellvered County Pickup
18 16 480 40" 24,63 $24.01 18 16 480 40' 17.10 16.25 18| 15 480 ag' 22.60 21.48
24 16 200 40' 30.94 530,42 24 16 200 an' 23.10 21,85 24 16 200 a0 30.25 28,72
30 14 280 40' 48.85 $48.02 30 14 280 40" 34.10 340 30 14 280 A0 46.75 44.43
36| id 520 40" 58,52 $57.63 36 14 520 40 42,10 40.00 36 14 520 40 55.75 52.95
48| 12 400 40 105.85 $104.05 48 12 490 a0 80,10 76.10 48, 12 400 104.40 93,20
&0 10 480 40" 167.73 $164.58 60| 10 480 40 140,10 133.10 50| 10 480 16745 155.10
72, 10 8O A 200,29 $196.90 72 10 40 173.10 16445 72 10 80 40' 199.93 185.93
TOTAL $201,044.40 TOTAL $157,404.00 TOTAL $187,108.40
OPTION 3 —-5POT WELDED OPTION 3 ——SPOT WELD OPTION 3 ---.-5P0T WELDED
Price Par Prlce Per Foot Diamater Price Per Prlee Per Foot Dlametar Price Per Price Par Foot
Gauge | Quantity | Length County Plekup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Dellveret County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantlty Lenath Foot Delivered County Pickup
18| 18 480 40" No Bld 16 480 40" 17.00 18 16 480 40' Mo Bid
24 15 200 40 No Bid 24 16 200 40" 23.00 24 16 200 40' No Bl
30 14 280 A40' No Bid 30 14 280 40 34.00 an 14 280 40" No Bld
36 14 520 40' N Bfd 36| 14 520 40' 42.00 36 14 520 40" No 8ld
48 12 400 40 Na Bld a8 12 400 40° BO.OO 48 12 400 40 No Bld
60 10 480 40' Mo Bld 60 10 480 40 143.00 60 10 480 40 No 8id
72 10 80 4 Mo Bld 72 10 BO 40" 175,00 166.25 72 10 40" No 8ld
TOTAL VALUE! TOTAL $161,160.00 TOTAL HVALUE|
ANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BAMDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BANOS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS
Dlameter Price Each e Each Diameter Price Each Prlee Each Dlameter Price Each Price Each
tnches | Gavge | Ouantity | Width Delivered County Plckup lnches Gauge Quantity Width Dallvered Counly Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Width Delivered County Plckup
18 i6 1 £47.88 $46.86 18 16 1 2! $51.00 $48.45 i8 16 1 2' 545,20 $42,96
24| 16 4 $64.08 563,02 4 16 4 $69.00 $65.55 24 16 a4 2' $60.50 $57.46
30| 14 5 z' $99.00 $97.70 30 14 5 2 $102.00 30, 14 5 2 $93.50 $88.86
36| 14 11 2 08 $117.24 36, 14 11 3 $126.00 $119.70 36 14 2 $111.50 $105.80
1] 12 8 2 $351.60 $348.70 6] 14 8 2 $444.00 $421.80 10 14 8 2 $334.50 $318,20
10 12 1 2 $451.68 $444.16 10 iz 1 2' $525.00 5498.75 10 12 1 2' $392.86 5379.86
TOTAL $5,386.56 TOTAL $5,300.00 TOTAL $5,060.26

NOTE: Totals are all hased on delivered FOB Platte Center.

MIDWEST ACE META;L
$11,726.40 $8,448.00 $10,848.00
$6,302.00 $4,720.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00 $0,688,00 $13,090.00
$30,482.40  $22,152.00 $28,990.00
$43,472,00 $32,240.00 $4%,760.00
$83,688.00 $71,328.00 $80,376.00
$17,766.40  $13,888.00 $15,994.40

$207,115.20 $162,464.00 $197,108.40
$11,822.40 $8,208.00 $10,848.00
$6,188.00 $4,620.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00  $9,548.00 $13,090.00
530,482.40  $21,892.00 $28,990.00
$42,340.00  $32,040.00 $41,760.00
$80,510.40  $67,248.00 $80,376.00
$16,023.20 $13,848.00 $15,994.40
$202,044.40  $157,404.00 $197,108.40
HVALUE! $8,160.00  #VALUEI
HVALUE! $4,600.00  #VALUEI
HVALUEL $9,520.00  #VALUE|
HVALUE] $21,840.00  HVALUEI
HVALUEL $32,000.00  #VALUE!
HVALUE! $71,040.00  #VALUEI
HVALUE| $14,000.00  HVALUE]
HVALUE] $161,160.00  #VALUEI
$47.88 $51.00 $45.20
$256.32 $276.00 $242.00
$495.00 $510.00 $467.50
51,298.88 $1,386.00  $1,226.50
$2,836,80 $3,552.00  $2,679.20
$451.68 $525.00 $399.86
$5,386.56  36,300.00  $5,060.26



CULVERT BIDS wsemervessrmems — Warch 26, 2026 CULVERT BIDS ———-——-— March 56,2026 CULVERT BIDS —--————- March 26, 2026
MIDWEST SALES AND SERVICE ACE{EATON - METAL CULVERTS
OFTION 1 -eeeem ANNULAR RIVETED OPTION 1'— PTION 1 —~-— ANNULAR RIVETED
Diameter Price Per Prlce Per Foot Diamater Price Per Foot Dlame Prlce Per Price Per Foot
fnches | Gauge | Quantity | Length | Foot Dellvered County Plckup frches. Gauge Quantity County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Leng! Foct Dellvered County Plckup
16 480 40 24.43 24.01 13 480 16.72 16 480 40' 22.60 21.48
24 16 200 40" 31.51 30.97 24 200 2240 24 16 200 40' 30.25 28.73
30 14 280 40' 48.85 48.02 36 14 280 32.87 30 14 280 40 46,75 44.43
36 14 520 a0 58.52 57.63 36 14 520 40.47 36 14 520 40' 55.75 52.95
AB| 12 400 40 108,58 106,89 48 12 400 76.57 4B i2 400 40 104 40 99.20
60 10 480 a0 174.35 171.35 6l 10 480 a0 141.17 it ABD 40' 167.45 159,10
72 10 80 40' 222.08 218,31 72 10 80 40 173.60 164.92 72 10 80 40' 199.93 189,93
TOTAL $207,115.20 TOTAL $5162,464.00 TOTAL $197,108.40
OPTIGN 2 ——SPIRAL QPTICON 2 ---—SPIRAL OPTION 2 --—-SPIRAL
Diameter Price Per Price Per Feot Diameter Price Par Prica Per Foot Dizmeter Prlce Per Prica Per Foot
Inches | Gauge | Quantity | tength | FootDelivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Cuantity Length Inches Gauge Quantity Lengt Foot Dellverad County Plckup
18| 16 480 A0 24,63 524,01 18| 16 0 40 16 480 40" 22.60 2148
24 16 200 40" 30.94 53042 24 156 200 L 24 16 200 40° 30.25 28,73
30 1B0 A0' 48.85 548.02 30| 4 280 ag 30 14 280 40' 16.75 44.43
36 14 520 4¢' 5B.62 $57.63 36 14 520 35 14 520 40' 55.75 52.95
4B, 12 400 40 105,85 $104.05 48 12 400 a0 48 12 400 40 104,40 99,20
6D 10 480 40" 167.73 $164.88 60 10 480 40 6il 10 480 40' 16745 154,10
72 10 80 40 200,23 519590 72 10 8O 40" 173,10 164.45 72 10 80 40' 199.53 125.93
TOTAL 4201,044.40 TOTAL $157,104.00 TOTAL $197,108.40
QPTION 3 —--5POT WELDED OPTION 3 --—SPOT WELDED OPTION 3 -—SPOT WELDED
Diameter Price Per Price Per Foot Diameter Price Per Prlce Per Foot Diamater Pilce Per Prlce Per Foot
Inches | Gauge | Quantity | Llength | FootDelivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered County Plckup inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Dellvered County Plckup
18 15 430 40' No Bld Mo Bld 18; 16 480 406" 17.00 16,13 18 156 480 40 No Bld Nao Bi
24 18 200 40 No Bid No Bld 24| 16 200 40 23.00 21.85 24 16 200 40' N 8l
kL 14 280 40" No Bid 30 14 280 a0 34,00 32,30 30 14 288 40' No 8id
EL] 14 520 40 No Bid 36| 14 520 40' 42.00 35,90 14 520 40' No Bld
48 12 400 40' No Bid 43 12 400 40" 80.00 76,00 A 12 400 40' No Bid
&0 10 480 40" o Bid 60 10 480 40’ 148.00 140.60 60 10 488 40 No 8ld
72 10 80 a0' Mo Bid 72 10 80 40' 175.00 166.25 72 10 80 40' No Bid
TOTAL EVALUE| TOTAL $161,160.00 TOTAL HVALUE|
BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS
Diameter Prica Each Price Each Diamater Price Each Price Each Diameter Price Each Price Each
Inches | Gauge | Quantlty Width Delivererd County Fickup Inches Gatrge Quantity Width Dellvered County Pickup Inchas Gauge Quantity ’ Width Delivered County Pickup
18 16 1 2! $47.88 $46.86 18 16 1 2! £51.00 $48.45 18 156 1 2' $45.20 $42.96
24 16 4 z* $64.08 563,02 24 16 4 2! $69,00 565,55 4 16 4 2! $60.50 $57.46
30 14 5 2 $92.00 $97.70 0] 14 5 2 $102.00 $96.90 30 14 5 2 $93.50 $BR.8E
a6 19 11 2 $118.08 $117.24 36| 14 11 2 $126.00 5119.70 36 14 11 2! $111.50 $105.50
10| 14 8 2' $354.60 $348.70 10 14 B 2 4444.00 $421.80 10 14 8 2 £334.50 $318,20
10| 1z 1 2 $451.68 $444.16 0] 12 1 2 $525.00 $498,75 10 12 1 2 $399.86 $379.86
TOTAL $5,386.56 TOTAL $6,300.00 TOTAL $5,060.26

NGTE: Totals are all based on delivered FOB Platte Center,

MIDWEST ACE METAL
$11,726.40 $8,448.00 $10,848.00
$6,302.00 54,7200 $6,050.00
$13,5678.00 $9,688.00 $13,000.00
$30,482.40  $22,152.00 $24,990.00
$43,472.00  $32,240.00 $41,760.00
483,688.00 §71,328.00 $8C,376.00
$17,766.40  $13,888.00 $15,994.40

$207,115.20 5162,464.00 $197,108.40
$11,822.40 $8,208.00  510,848.00
$6,188.00 $4,620.00  56,050.00
$13,678.00 $9,548,00 $13,090.00
$30,482.40  $21,892.00 $28,990.0C
$42,340.00  $32,040.00 $41,760.00
$80,510.40  $67,248,00 $80,376.00
$16,023.20  $13,848.00 515,994.40
$201,044.40 5157,404.00 $197,108.40
H#VALUE! $8,160.00 HVALUEI
#VALUE! $4,600.00 #VALUEI
HVALUEI $9,520.00 #VALUE!
HVALUE! $21,840.00 #VALUEI
HVALUE! $32,000,00 #VALUE|
HVALUE! $71,040.00 HVALUEI
H#VALUEL $14,000,00 HVALUEI
HVALUE! $161,160.00  #VALUE!
547.88 $51.00 545.20
$256.32 $276.00 $242,00
$495.00 $510.00 546750
51,298.88 $1,386.00  $1,22650
$2,836.80 53,552.00 $2,679.20
$451,68 $525.00 $395.86
$5,386.56  $6,300.00  $5,060.26



CULVERT BIDS —vesemmes e -~ March 26, 2026 CULVERT 2105 — e barch §,2026 CULVERT BIDS ---rmmmmrase-—ne - March 26, 2026
MIDVWEST SALES AND SERVICE ACE/EATON - METAL CULVERTS
OPTION 1-—— ANNULAR RIVETED OPTION 1 —-—- ANNULAR RIVETED OPTION 1 —- ANNULAR RIVETED
Diameter Price Per Prica Par Foot Dlametar Price Per Price Per Foot Diameter Prlce Per Price Per Foot
fiiches | Gauge | Quantlty | Length | Foot Delivered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foat Dellivered County Piekup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered Caunty Plckup
18 16 480 40" 24,01 18 16 48D 40" 17.60 16,72 18 156 480 40 22.60 21.48
24 16 200 40' 30,97 24 16 200 40' 23.60 2240 24| 16 200 ap 30.25 28.73
30 4 280 40' 48.02 30, 14 280 40" 34.60 3287 30 14 280 40 46.75 44.43
36 14 520 40 57.63 36 14 520 40 43,60 4047 35| 14 520 40" 55.75 52.95
48 12 400 40" 106.84 48 12 400 A 80.60 76.57 48 12 400 40" 104.40 98.20
&0 10 40' 171.39 60| 10 480 40 148.60 141,17 60| 10 480 40" 157,45 159,10
72 10 80 40' 218,31 72 10 0 40' 164.92 72 10 B0 40 139,93 189,93
TOTAL $207,115.20 TOTAL $162,464.00 TOTAL $197,108.4¢
OPTION 2 ——SPIRAL OFTION 2 —-—SP[RAL OFTION 2 —~--—5PIRAL
Dlameter Price Per Price Pet Foot Dlameter Price Per Price Per Foot Dlamater Price Per Price Per Foot
Inches | Gauge | Quantity | Length | Foot Delivered County Pickup hes Gauge Quantity Length Foot Delivered County Plckup Inches Gauge QuanHly length Foat Dellvered County Plckup
18] 16 480 4p' 24,63 524.01 18 16 480 40' 17.10 16.25 18 16 4BQ ag' 22,60 21.43
24 15 200 40 30.54 $30.42 24 16 200 a0’ 23.10 21.95 24 16 200 40 30.25 28.73
30 14 280 40 48.85 $48.02 30 14 280 40 a4.10 32,40 30 14 280 4 4675 44.43
36 14 520 40' 58.62 £57.63 36 14 520 40 42.10 40,00 35 14 520 40 55.75 52.05
A8 12 400 40 10585 $104.05 48 12 400 40' 20.10 76.10 48, 12 400 o 104.40 99,20
60 10 480 40" 167.73 51564,88 60 10 480 40' 140,10 133.10 B0 10 480 40! 16745 159.10
72 10 80 40" 200,29 $196.00 72 10 80 40' 173.10 154.45 72 10 BO 40! 199.93 189.93
TOTAL $201,044.40 TOTAL $157,404.00 TOTAL $197,108.40
OFTION 3 --—5POT WELDED OPTION 3 —SPOT WELDED OFTION 3 -----5P0T WELDED
Dlametar Price Per Price Per Foat meter Price Per Price Per Foot Dlameter Price Per Prlce Per Fang
Inches | Gauge | Quanlity | Length County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Deliverad County Pickup Inches Gauga Quantlty Length Faot Dellvered County Plckup
18 16 480 10" No Bid 13 16 480 40' 17.00 16.15 18 16 480 40" No Bid No Bid
24 16 200 40 No Bid 24 16 200 &0 23.00 21.85 24 16 200 40' No Bld No Bld
30 14 280 40' No Bld 30 14 280 40" 34.00 32.30 30 14 280 40" No Bld No Bld
36 14 520 40' No Bld 36 14 520 40" 42.00 39.50 36 14 520 A0 No Big No Bld
48 12 400 40" No Bid 48 12 400 40" B80.00 76.00 48 12 400 4 No Bld No Bld
B0, 10 480 40" No Bid 60 10 480 Ag' 148.00 140.60 &0 10 480 40" No 8id No Bid
72 10 80 40' No Bid 73 10 " 175,00 166,25 72 10 80 40" Mo Bld Mo Bld
TOTAL #VALUE! TOTAL $161,160.00 TOTAL fIVALUEL
BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2" WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2' WiTH WELDED LUGS
Dlameter Price Each Price Each Diameter Price Each Prlce Each Dlameter Price Eath lce Each
inches | Gauge | Quantity Delivered County Plckup Inches Gauge Quantity Width Dellverad County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Deliverad Caunty Pickup
18 15 1 $47.88 $46.86 18 15 1 2! $51.00 $48.45 18 16 1 2° 545.20 842,96
24 16 4 $64.08 453,02 2q 16 4 2' $69.00 $65.55 24, 16 4 2' $60.50 $5746
E 14 3 2! $92.00 59270 30 14 5 2 $102.00 $96.80 30! 14 5 2' $93.50 $88.36
36 14 11 2' $118.08 $117.24 36 14 11 2 $126.00 511570 36! 14 2 511150 £105.90
10 14 8 2 $354.60 $348.7¢ 10 14 a 2 5444.00 542180 10 14 8 2 $334.90 $318.20
10 12 1 2 3451.68 $444,16 1Q 12 1 2 $525,00 $498.75 10| 12 1 2' $399.86 $379.96
TOTAL $5,386.56 TOTAL $56,300.00 TOTAL $5,060.26

NQTE: Totals are all basad on delivered FOB Platte Center.

MIDWEST ACE
$11,726.40 $8,448.00 $10,848.00
$6,302.00 $4,720.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00 $9,688.00 $13,090.00
$30,482.40  %22,152.00 $28,990.00
$43,472.00  5$32,240.00 $41,760.00
$83,688.00 571,328,00 $80,376.00
$17,766.40  513,888.00 $15,994.40
§207,115.20 $162,464.00 $157,108.40
$11,822.40 $8,208.00 $10,848.00
$6,188.00 $4,620.00  $6,050.00
$13,678.00.  $9,548.00 $13,090.00
$30,482.40  $21,892.00 $28,990.00
$42,340,00  $32,040,00 $41,760.00
$80,510.40  567,248.00 $80,376.00
$16,023.20 $13,848.00 $15,994.40
$201,044.40 $157,404.00 $197,108.40
#VALUE! $8,160.00 #VALUEI
H#VALUE! $4,600.00 #VALUE!
HVALUEI $9,520.00 #VALUE!
#VALUE! $21,840,00  #VALUEI
H#VALUE( $32,000.00 #VALUE!
HVALUE! $71,040.00  #VALUEI
#VALUE! $14,000.00  #VALUE!
H#VALUE| $161,160.00  #VALUEI
$47.88 551,00 $45.20
$256.32 $276.00 $242.00
$495.00 $510.00 $467.50
$1,298.88 51,386.00  $1,226.50
$2,836.80 $3,552,00  $2,679.20
$451.68 $525.00 $399.86
$5,386.56  5$6,300.00  $5,060.26



CULVERT 8IS ——mmomeeoeee. March 26, 2026 CULVERY BIDS ——-——----—-- March 65,2026 CULVERT BIDS —————— March 25, 2026 \
MIDWEST SALES AND SERVICE ACE/EATON - METAL CULVERTS
OPTION 1 — ANNULAR RIVETED TION 1~ ANNULAR RIVETED OPTION 1 —— ANMULAR RIVETEDR
Dlameter Price Par Price Per Foot Dlameter Prlce Per Price Per Foot Dlameter Price Per Prce Per Foat
Inches | Gauwge | Quantity | Lemgth | Foot Dellvered County Pickup Inches Gauge Quantity Length Foot Del County Pltkup Inches Gauge Quantlty Length Foot Dellvarad Ceunty Plekup
18 16 ABD 40 24.43 24.01 18 480 40' 17.60 16.72 18 15 480 40' 22,60 2148
24 16 200 A 3151 ..mo.mu 24 200 40' 23.60 224D 24 15 200 40 30.25 28.73
30] 14 280 40 48,85 48.02 3D 14 280 40' 34.50 32.87 30| 14 280 40 46.75 44.43
Xl 520 40 58,62 57.63 36| 14 520 40' 42,60 047 36 14 520 40' 55.75 52,95
481 12 400 40 108.68 106.84 43 12 408 40 B0.60 76,57 48| 12 400 40' 104.40 99.20
60| 10 480 aa 174.35 171.39 60| 10 A80 40' 148.60 14117 60 10 480 40 15745 158,10
72 10 B0 aq' 222,08 218,31 72 10 80 40' 173.60 164.92 72| 10 80 40' 109.93 189.93
TOTAL $207,115.20 TOTAL $162,464.00 TOTAL $197,108.40
PTION 2 —---SPIRAL OPTION 2 —SPIRAL OPTION 2 ——5PIRAL
Dlamneter Prica Par Price fer Foot Dlameter Price Per Price Per Font Dlameter Price Per Pslce Par Foot
inches | Gawge | Quantity | Length | Foct Dallver: County Plckup Inches Gauge Quantity Leng! Foot Delivered County Plckup Inches Gavge Quantlty Length Foot Delivered County Plckup
18 16 480 a0' 24.53 $24.01 18 16 480 40" 17.10 16,25 18| 16 480 a0 22,60 2148
24 16 200 A0 30.94 $30.42 29 16 100 40° 23,10 21.95 24 16 200 40 30.25 2B.73
3] 14 280 40" 18.85 348.02 30 14 280 40 34.10 3240 30| 14 280 4p 46.75 44.43
34 14 520 46" 58.62 $57.63 36 14 520 40' 42.10 40.00 36 14 520 40" 55.75 52.95
48 12 400 40' 105,85 $104.05 48 12 400 40 80.10 76.10 A8 12 400 a0 104.40 99.20
60 1 ABQ 40" 157.73 $164.88 a0 10 480 40 140.10 13510 G0 10 480 a0 167.45 155,10
72 10 40 200.29 5196.80 72 10 280 40' 173,10 16445 72 10 20 40" 159.93 188,93
TOTAL $201,044.40 TOTAL $157,404.00 TOTAL $157,108.40
QPTIQN 3 ----SPOT WELDED OPTION 3 —SPOT WELDED QPTION 3 —SPOT WELDED
Dlameter Price Per Prlce Per Foot Dlameter Prica Per Price Per Foot Dlameter Price Per Prlcz Per Foot
Inches | Gauge } Quantity | Length | Foot Dellverad County Plekup Inches Gauge Quantity Foot Dellverad County Plckup Inches Gauge Quantity Le Foot Defivered County Pickup
18 16 A80 40 Mo Bid No Bid 18 480 17.00 16.15 18 16 480 40' No Bid Na Bl
24 16 200 40' Na Bid No Bid 24 200 23.00 21.85 24 16 200 40" No Bid Mo Bld
3Q 34 280 40 No Bid No Bld 30 i4 280 40' 34.00 230 30 14 280 40 Na Bld Nao Bid
6] 14 510 40' Na Bid No Bid 36| 14 520 40' 42,00 39.30 36 14 520 40" No Bld Mo gid
48 12 400 40' No Bid No 8id 48 12 A00 40' 80.00 76.00 48 12 400 40" o Bid No Bld
&0 10 480 40' Ne Bld No Bld 60 10 430 40" 148.00 140.60 6| 10 480 40" Na Bid Nao Bld
72 10 BO A0 Mo Bid No Bid 72 10 80 40' 175,00 166,25 72| 10 80 40 No Bld No Bld
TOTAL #VALUEL TOTAL $161,160.00 TOTAL IVALUEL
BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BAMDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS BANDS - 2' WITH WELDED LUGS
Blameter Prlce Each Prica Each Diameter Prlce Each Price Each Diameter Price Each lce Each
Inches | Gauge | Quantlty [ Width Delivered County Plckup Inches Gauge Quantity Width County Plckup Inches Gauge Quantity Width Dellvered Caunty Pickup
18 16 1 2' 547.88 $46.86 18] 16 1 2 $48.45 16 1 2' 545,20 $42.96
24| 16 a 2' 564.08 $63.02 24 18 4 2* $89.00 58555 24 16 4 2' $60.50 $57.46
30 14 5 2 59900 mwu...s 30 14 5 2* $102.00 $96.50 30 14 5 2 593,50 $88.86
36] 14 11 2' $118.08 17.24 36! 14 11 2 $126.00 $119,70 36| 14 11 2 $111.50 5105 90
0] 14 a F3 $354.60 $348.70 10 14 8 2 $444.00 $421.80 10 14 B 2 $334.50 §318.20
| 1z 1 2 $451.68 $444.16 10, 12 1 2' $525,00 $458.75 10 12 1 2 5399.86 §379.86
TOTAL $5,386.56 TOTAL $6,300.00 TOTAL 55,060.26

NOTE: Totals are al} based on delivered FOB Platte Center.

MIDWEST

$11,726.40
$6,302.00
$13,678.00
530,482.40
$43,472.00
$83,688.00
$17,766.40
$207,115.20

$11,822.40
$6,188.00
$13,678.00
$30,482.40
$42,340.00
$80,510.40
$16,023.2D
$201,044.40

#VALUE!
#VALUE!
HVALUE!
#VALUEI
#VALUEI
HVYALUE

HVALUE!
HVALUEI

§47.88
$256.32
$495.00
$1,298.88
$2,236,80

$451.68
$5,386.56

ACE

$8,448.00
$4,720.00
$9,688.00
$22,152.00
$32,240.00
$71,328,00
$13,888.00
$162,464.00

$8,208.00
$4,620.00
$9,548.00
$21,882.00
$32,040.00
$67,248.00

$13,848.00
$157,404.00

$8,160.00
54,600.00
$9,520.00
$21,840.00
$32,000,00
$71,040.00

$14,000.00
$161,160.00

$51.00
$276.00
$510.00
$1,386.00
43,552.00
5525.00
$6,300.00

METAL

$10,848.00
$6,050.00
$13,080,00
£28,990.00
$41,760.00
$80,376.00
$15,994.40
$197,108.40

$10,848.00
$6,050.00
$13,090.00
$28,990.00
$41,760,00
$80,376.00
$15,994.40
$197,108.40

#VALUE!
#YALUE!
#VALUE!
H#VALUEI
HVALUEI
H#VALUEI
EVALUE!
HVALUE!

$45,20
$242.00
$467.50
$1,226.50
$2,679.20
mwmw.mm
$5,060.26



	Agenda
	1. Please silence all cell phones
	2. Pledge of Allegiance and Prayer
	3. Roll call
	4. Inform public of the posting of the open meeting laws
	5. The meeting notice was published in the Columbus Telegram on March 31st and the Humphrey Democrat on April 1, 2026.
	6. Approve the agenda as written
	7. Approve the minutes for March 24th, 2026 as written
	8. Discussion and possible action on the following:
	9. County Treasurer - Jenny Reppert
	9.a. Consideration of accepting delinquent tax list presented by the Platte County Treasurer
	Treas DelinquentTaxListing_20260403_105150 2026
	Treas First Letter to Board Delinquent list 2026


	10. Consideration to Remove from the Table Northern Hills Second Subdivision
	10.a. Consideration of Preliminary & Final Plat
	10.b. Consideration of Adopting Resolution 26-08 for Northern Hills Second Subdivision
	Northern Hills Resolution 26-08


	11. Highway Department
	11.a. Consideration of Utility Permits
	11.a.1. Frontier Communications
	11.a.2. Larry Rasmussen & Sons
	11.a.3. Casey Rasmussen

	11.b. Consideration of Culvert Bids
	Highway Culvert Bids

	11.c. Road report

	12. Committee Reports
	13. Motion to accept, file, and credit the proper accounts on correspondence: Nebraska Bankers Insurance and Services Company — Bank Compliance Report for 1/31/26 and 2/28/26, Cancel General Fund check no. 3724 in the amount of $880.28 to Security Equipment Supply - double payment by IT Department, Department of Water, Energy and Environment - NPDES General Permit for CAFOs Confining Cattle for Went LIvestock, LLC Concentrated Animal Feeding Operation, Stanton County Planning Commission Notice of Public Hearing regarding the amendment of the Zoning Matrix, Charter Communications - Upcoming Changes, Treasurer Receipts $154,663.66
	14. Motion to approve all claims except for Trouba Law.
	14.a. To approve the Trouba Law claim

	15. Public Comments
	16. Motion to Adjourn to April 21, 2026

