
Regular Meeting of the Board of Education
Wednesday, November 12, 2025 6:00 PM
Independence Junior High School, 6610 W. Highland Dr., Palos Heights, IL 
60463

1. Call to Order

1.A. Pledge to the Flag

1.B. Roll Call

2. Superintendent's Report

2.A. Student Highlights: Grade 2 Writing 
• Griffin M. 
• Henry P.
• Peyton Q.
• Dottie S.

2.B. Illinois Principal Association Conference 
Presentation Recognition 

• Mary Lynn Duffy
• Kaitlin Settle
• Mary Kate Moroney
• Brigitte Sullivan

2.C. Board of Education - Board Recognition Day

2.D. State of the District Annual Report

3. Approval of the Consent Agenda Items
 

3.A. Minutes of the October 15, 2025 Regular Meeting

3.B. Approval of Bills & Payroll

3.C. Review of Schools' Activity Accounts
 

3.D. Library Book Purchases

4. Old Business

4.A. IASB Resolutions 
• Final Endorsement for Board Delegate

4.B. Illinois School Bus Contract Extension Proposal

4.C. District Maintenance Vehicle Purchase

4.D. Roof Bid Recommendation

5. New Business

5.A. Approval of the Tentative Tax Levy

5.B. 2025 Reciprocal Reporting Agreement with PHPD



6. Audience Participation
If you are coming up to speak, please identify 
yourself by name and connection to the district 
and we ask that comments remain brief to 
accommodate everyone wishing to speak. Policy 
ordinarily provides up to 3 minutes per speaker.

7. Information Items

7.A. YTD Financial Summary

7.B. Freedom of Information Act Items 
• S. Watts, received 10/16/25, answered 

10/17/25
• Mid-America Carpenters Regional Council, 

received 11/4/25, answered 11/6/25
7.C. Additional Information Items, if any

8. Closed Session

Discuss the appointment, employment, 
compensation, discipline, performance, or 
dismissal of a specific employee; collective 
negotiating matters or deliberations concerning 
salary schedules for classes of employees; 
discussion of possible litigation; and student 
disciplinary issues. The placement of individual 
students in special education programs and other 
matters relating to individual students. 

9. Return to Open Session

10. Adjournment



PHSD 128
State of the District

November 2025
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District 128 
Demographic 

Profile

2025 2024 2023 2022 2021

TOTAL 
ENROLLMENT 821 783 767 726 669

Attendance 
Rate 94% 94% 93% 94% 94%

Chronic 
Absenteeism 13% 16% 21% 13% 16%

Mobility Rate 7% 3% 4% 4% 10%



District 128 
Demographic 

Profile

TOTAL 
ENROLLMENT

2025
% to
Total

2024
% to
Total

2023
% to
Total

2022
% to 
Total

2021
% to 
Total

Low Income 
Students 13% 15%

125
18%
135

11%
108

11%
78

Students with 
IEPs 16% 15% 15% 15% 13%

English 
Learners

8%
72

9%
73

8%
59

7%
51

6%
46

Racial 
Diversity 26% 24% 25% 24% 23%
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5 Essentials 
Summary Data

Reporting Groups

● Family Engagement - Teachers
● Collaboration - Teachers
● Leadership - Teachers
● Environment - Students
● Academic Pressure - Students
● Personalization - Students



Equity Journey Continuum (Data is pulled from the 2023-2024 School Year)

*

*With our growing enrollment, this metric reads low. It is likely impacted by kindergarten students who may 
not have attended our preschool or have had limited preschool experiences, as one of the data points for 
this indicator is kindergarten readiness measured the first month of the school year.



Whole 
Child

Climate & 

Culture

Stu
den

t 

Lea
rning

MAP
D

is
tr

ic
t 1

28
 S

na
ps

ho
t



Transition to High School

Fo

Student 
Placements

Honors Core IEP

English 67% 23% 10%

Math
40%

Up 10% from 
previous year

48% 12%

Science 60% 40% NA

Shepard High School
Performance Data

Data represents 
Freshman Class 

2025-2026

Note: Steady placement 
trends with slight increases 
in English, Math and Social 
Studies honors level 
participation.



NWEA MAP Assessment Overview

Status 

How does our students’ 
average score compare to 
the average score of 
students in other schools? 

Growth 

Are our students growing 
more or less than 
students in other 
schools?

● Growth: >50th percentile = above average

● Status: >75th percentile is top performing quartile

● The higher the RIT score the lower the growth target



Status Percentile 
Band Performance

Assessment

14

Percentile Band Level of Performance

75th percentile 
& above

Well above average

55th - 74th percentile Above average

40th - 54th percentile Average  (Note: 50th percentile is 
expected national target MAP Norm)

25th - 39th percentile Low Average

25th percentile & 
below

At Risk 

MAP Performance Bands
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ACHIEVEMENT Spring 
2023

Spring 
2024

Spring
2025

All Grades 69

Grade 2 69 76 66

Grade 3  85 84 80

Grade 4 35 92 75

Grade 5 47 37 59

Grade 6 68 67 59

Grade 7 49 73 73

Grade 8 52 76 69

GROWTH Spring 
2023

Spring 
2024

Spring
2025

All Grades 85

Grade 2 57 92 79

Grade 3  60 99 95

Grade 4 2 99 87

Grade 5 4 60 64

Grade 6 51 99 85

Grade 7 12 95 88

Grade 8 71 99 89

MAP Performance - Mathematics



MAP Performance - Mathematics 
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 ACHIEVEMENT %tile

TOP QUARTILE 
(75th %tile and above)

Grade 3
Grade 4

3rd QUARTILE 
(51st to 74th %tile)

Grade 2
Grade 5
Grade 6
Grade 7
Grade 8

2nd QUARTILE 
(26th - 50th %tile)

BOTTOM QUARTILE 
(26th %tile and below)

TOP QUARTILE 
(75th %tile and above)

Grade 2
Grade 3
Grade 4
Grade 6
Grade 7
Grade 8

3rd QUARTILE 
(51st to 74th %tile)

Grade 5

2nd QUARTILE 
(26th - 50th %tile)

BOTTOM QUARTILE 
(26th %tile and below)

 GROWTH  %tile



MAP Performance - Reading 
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ACHIEVEMENT Spring 
2023

Spring 
2024

Spring 
2025

All Grades 62

Grade 2 64 59 45

Grade 3  63 63 57

Grade 4 30 57 60

Grade 5 68 28 55

Grade 6 83 86 61

Grade 7 55 86 70

Grade 8 63 78 75

GROWTH Spring 
2023

Spring 
2024

Spring
2025

All Grades 59

Grade 2 63 72 57

Grade 3  28 74 65

Grade 4 4 63 56

Grade 5 32 36 44

Grade 6 97 98 75

Grade 7 40 93 54

Grade 8 53 99 71



MAP Performance - Reading 

18

 ACHIEVEMENT %tile

TOP QUARTILE 
(75th %tile and above)

Grade 8

3rd QUARTILE 
(51st to 74th %tile)

Grade 3
Grade 4
Grade 5
Grade 6
Grade 7

2nd QUARTILE 
(26th - 50th %tile)

Grade 2

BOTTOM QUARTILE 
(26th %tile and below)

TOP QUARTILE 
(75th %tile and above)

Grade 6

3rd QUARTILE 
(51st to 74th %tile)

Grade 2
Grade 3
Grade 4
Grade 8

2nd QUARTILE 
(26th - 50th %tile)

Grade 5
Grade 7

BOTTOM QUARTILE 
(26th %tile and below)

 GROWTH  %tile



School Report Card Designations



School Report 
Card 
Designations

A subgroup count of 20 students in a 
given school will trigger a calculated 
metric. 



Explaining the Student Growth Percentile Metric



School Report Card Designations 2025

School Designation

Independence Jr. High EXEMPLARY

Navajo Commendable

Chippewa Commendable



Independence Jr. High

Performed in the 
Top 3% in IL

Exemplary Cut: 81.99

Summative 
Designation 
Breakdown



Exemplary Ranking 2025

School
# 4 of 456 Grade 5-8 or 6-8 Schools

Exemplary Score
Cut = 81.92 (Top 10%)

Independence Jr. High 89.21

Palos South Middle School D118, Palos Park, IL 83.52

Conrady Jr. High D117, Hickory Hills, IL 84.03

Old Quarry D113A, Lemont, IL 89.11

Hickory Creek Middle School D157C, Frankfort, IL 86.67

Hauser Jr. High D96, Riverside, IL 86.24

Hadley Jr. High D41, Glen Ellyn, IL 82.99

Bryan Middle School D205, Elmhurst, IL 82.82



Navajo Heights 
Elementary 

Note: Growth data compares FY25 
IJHS Grade 6 to FY 24 Navajo Grade 
5, along with FY 25 Grade 5 to FY 24 
Grade 4.

Summative 
Designation 
Breakdown



Chippewa Elementary

Note: Growth data compares FY25 
Navajo Grade 4 to FY 24 Chippewa 
Grade 3

Summative 
Designation 
Breakdown



DISTRICT DATA 

HIGHLIGHTS



IL State Assessment of Readiness Data
New Proficiency Cut Scores 2025 

ELA PHSD 128 STATE 

2025 78% 53%

MATH PHSD 128 STATE 

2025 54% 38%

ELA Subgroup Gap PHSD 128 STATE
Low Income/

Non Low Income
81%/58% 68%/37%

White/Hispanic 80%/62% 64%/40%

Math Subgroup Gap PHSD 128 STATE

Low Income/

Non Low Income
55%/38% 54%/22%

White/Hispanic NA NA



2024



2025



Grade 3 
78% Proficient

2024 43%

2023 44%

2022    37%

NEW FOUNDATIONAL 
CORE RESOURCES 
SINCE GRADE 1



ELA DIST (3-8) 2023 DIST (3-8)

2024

DIST (3-8)

2025 APPLES to 

APPLES

DIST (3-8)

2025

NEW CUT SCORES

ALL 57% 61% 67% 78%

  Gr 3* 44% 43% 65% 78%

Gr 4 39% 54% 44% 61%

Gr 5 54% 47% 55% 73%

Gr 6 69% 81% 78% 87%

Gr 7 57% 74% 81% 87%

Gr 8 78% 82% 87% 89%

ELA IAR Achievement
Every grade level cohort demonstrated higher percentage of students 
meeting and exceeding from 2023 to 2025



Grade 3 
85% Proficient

2024 43%

2023 45%

2022    53%

NEW CORE 
RESOURCES SINCE 
GRADE 1



MATH DIST (3-8) 2023
DIST (3-8)

2024

DIST (3-8)

2025 APPLES to 

APPLES

DIST (3-8)

2025

NEW CUT SCORES

ALL 33% 33% 41% 54%

Gr 3 45% 43% 63% 85%

Gr 4 32% 47% 31% 46%

Gr 5 25% 21% 35% 45%

Gr 6 31% 19% 27% 39%

Gr 7 24% 34% 43% 64%

Gr 8 34% 33% 46% 51%

MATH IAR Achievement



Explaining the 
Student Growth 
Percentile Metric



IL State Assessment of Readiness Data
Growth Percentile Rankings 2025

ELA PHSD 128 STATE 

2025 61.3% 50%

ELA Subgroup PHSD 128 STATE

Low Income 57.8% 47.4%

Hispanic 71% 48.4%

English Learners 57.5% 48.7%

MATH Subgroup PHSD 128 STATE

Low Income 52.6% 47.8%

Hispanic 57.7% 49.4%

English Learners 38.3% 48.8%

MATH PHSD 128 STATE 

2025 54.4% 50%



2024



2025



Illinois Science Assessment 
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School 
Highlights

Indian Hill
SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
The Indian Hill and Chippewa Non Negotiable & Rationale: 
To empower lifelong learning utilizing innovation, perseverance and respectful 
collaboration so that students grow to make a positive difference in our world.

41

EARLY CHILDHOOD ACADEMIC FOCUS GOALS
Perseverance, Communication, Innovation
 
SHORT TERM GOAL
Preschool students will demonstrate number sense by accurately counting to 10 and 
comparing sets to determine if they are equal or which has more.

Strategies: 

● Use daily counting routines (e.g., counting children at circle time, snacks, 
steps).

● Provide hands-on activities with manipulatives such as counters, blocks, or 
natural items.
Incorporate math-focused read-alouds and songs that reinforce number 
sense.

● Embed counting and comparing opportunities within play and transitions.



School 
Highlights

Indian Hill
SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
The Indian Hill and Chippewa Non Negotiable & Rationale: 
To empower lifelong learning utilizing innovation, perseverance and respectful 
collaboration so that students grow to make a positive difference in our world.

42

ACADEMIC FOCUS:
Perseverance, Communication, Innovation
ENGLISH LANGUAGE ARTS SHORT TERM GOAL:

● 80% of students will achieve grade-level proficiency on unit tests for 
identifying lowercase letters, with all students demonstrating growth 
towards proficiency.

● 80% of students will achieve grade-level proficiency on unit tests for 
producing letter sounds, with all students demonstrating growth 
towards proficiency. 

STRATEGIES
● Small group tiered instruction 
● Re-teaching focused skill 
● Repetition 
● Structured/scaffolded instruction 
● Visuals/manipulatives



School 
Highlights

Indian Hill
SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
The Indian Hill and Chippewa Non Negotiable & Rationale: 
To empower lifelong learning utilizing innovation, perseverance and respectful 
collaboration so that students grow to make a positive difference in our world.

43

ACADEMIC FOCUS:
Perseverance, Communication, Innovation
MATH SHORT TERM GOAL:

● 80% of students will achieve a proficiency goal of counting to 100 
by the end of the school year, with all students demonstrating 
growth towards the goal 

STRATEGIES
● Small group tiered instruction 
● Re-teaching focused skill 
● Repetition 
● Structured/scaffolded instruction 
● Visuals/manipulatives



School 
Highlights

Indian Hill
SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
The Indian Hill and Chippewa Non Negotiable & Rationale: 
To empower lifelong learning utilizing innovation, perseverance and respectful 
collaboration so that students grow to make a positive difference in our world.

44

ACADEMIC FOCUS:
Perseverance, Communication, Innovation

PBIS SHORT TERM GOAL:
● By the end of the year, the PBIS committee will establish a clear 

foundation for implementation by developing a school-wide 
expectations. 

STRATEGIES
● Trimester 1: Students will be able to identify what it means to Be Kind, 

Be Ready, and Be Safe
● Trimester 2: Students will begin to demonstrate the 3 Be Rules

● Trimester 3: Students will be able to master the 3 Be Rules



School 
Highlights

Chippewa
SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
The Indian Hill and Chippewa Non Negotiable & Rationale: 
To empower lifelong learning utilizing innovation, perseverance and respectful 
collaboration so that students grow to make a positive difference in our world.
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School 
Highlights

Navajo 

46

SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
NAVAJO NON NEGOTIABLE & RATIONALE
Together we will create an inclusive, collaborative community where all students 
feel safe, valued, and encouraged to be themselves, take risks, and reach their 
highest potential learning potential, so that students will gain a sense of 
empowerment to be accepting, open-minded leaders in a greater community.



School 
Highlights

Independence

47

SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT PLANNING
The Independence Junior High School Non Negotiable & Rationale: 
We provide an engaging, quality education in a safe and welcoming learning 
environment so that all students are prepared social emotionally and 
academically for an ever-changing world.



Summary 
● Successes

○ Exemplary status at the middle school level 
○ Large increases in overall proficiency and growth data in ELA and 

Mathematics
○ Continued subgroup improvement for Hispanic and Low Income students
○ Decreasing numbers of Tier 3 students requiring intensive intervention
○ Strong family engagement
○ Supportive school environments

● Opportunities

○ Focusing on small group instruction for high performing students to 
improve growth metric performance

○ Focused support for the English Learner subgroup to improve proficiency 
and growth performance in ELA and Mathematics. We have tripled the 
number of students receiving services over the last several years

■ Note: 4-8 EL Teacher was out on FMLA the majority of the 2024-2025 school year



QUESTIONS?





























































lnvoice
FOUR POINTO
A/ EAL]IFMElI ! W NDL]W TFEAIVENTS

New Lenox, lL 60451

Bill To

Palos Heights School Dist 128

Attn: Accounts Payable
12809 Mc Vicker
Palos Heights. IL 60463

Date 1l/6t2025

lnvoice # 14037

Ship To

Palos Heights School Dist 128

12809 Mc Vicker
Palos Heights, IL 60463

Attn: Jason Smit

P.O. Number Terms Rep Ordered S,O. NO

Verbal Nel 30 JA I I t6/2025 12951

Item Code Description Quantity Price Each Amounl

Misc 2O2I RAM PROMASI'I'R VAN (AS IS)

APPROX. CtIRRIIN'I MILI'AGE: 93.000

VIN # lC6l-RVA(;0Mti58.1240

jsmit,rtpalos l28.org

12.000.00 12.000.00

Thank You For Your Business.
Four Point O lnc

12641 Old Plank Ddve

New Lenox, lL 60451

815462-6622 Fax:815462-6623

fourpointo@juno.com
www.fouDoanto.us

Retum Policy
1 Return merciandise subjectto 20% restocking charge
2 All merchandise must be in original unopened box
3 No refunds after 30 days ofinvoice dale
4 Returns after 30 days of invoice date subiect to exchange only
5 No exchange after 120 days of invoice date
6 No refund on specialorders or shipping chaees

Subtotal $12.000.00

Sales Tax (9.0%) $0.00

Payments/Credits $0.00

Total $12,000.00



Seller’s Report of Sale

Secretary of State 
Vehicle Services Department 
Record Inquiry Section 
501 S. Second St., Room 629 
Springfield, IL 62756 

ilsos.gov

This space for use by 
Secretary of State.

When you sell or release interest in a vehicle that is titled or registered in Illinois, you must complete this form immediately and mail it 
to the Secretary of State Vehicle Services Department. This will release your responsibility for the vehicle. 

Note: Completing this form does not meet the legal requirements for transferring ownership. Illinois law requires the vehicle owner to 
complete and sign the “Assignment of Title” section on the Certificate of Title to the buyer. The buyer must then apply for a new title. 

Date of Sale __________________________________________________________________________________________________

Vehicle Year _____________________  Vehicle Make __________________________________________________________________

Vehicle Identification Number (VIN) ________________________________________________________________________________ 

Name of Seller ________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Address of Seller ______________________________________________________________________________________________

______________________________________________________________________________________________ 
City State ZIP 

Name of Buyer ______________________________________________________________________________________________

Address of Buyer   

______________________________________________________________________________________________ 
City State ZIP 

Mail To: Secretary of State 
Vehicle Services Department 
Record Inquiry Division 
501 S. Second St., Room 629 
Springfield, IL 62756 

Under penalties of perjury, I certify that the above information is true and correct according to U.S. laws. 

Executed on __________________________     ______________________________________________________________________ 
Date Signature of Seller 

____________________________________     ______________________________________________________________________ 
Printed Name of Seller

Printed by authority of the State of Illinois by union employees. June 2025 — 1 — VSD 703.3

______________________________________________________________________________________________

______________________________________________________________________________________________

PALOS HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 128

12809 S. McVICKERS AVE

PALOS HEIGHTS, IL 60462

Merryl Brownlow
Purchase Price:

Smit
11/18/2025

Smit
$12,000

Smit
2021

Smit
Ram Promaster Van

Smit
3C6LRVAG0ME584240

lisa athos

lisa athos
Four Point O Inc 

lisa athos
12641 Old Plank Dr

lisa athos
New Lenox                                                              IL

lisa athos
60451

lisa athos
James Athos     President

lisa athos



223 West Jackson Boulevard
Suite 1200
Chicago, IL 60606
Phone: (312) 253-3400

November 5, 2025

Palos Heights SD 128
Dr. Merryl Brownlow
Superintendent
12809 S. McVickers Ave.
Palos Heights, IL 60463

RE: Roof Replacement at Independence Jr. High School
Project No. 25022

Dear Dr. Brownlow:

Bids for the referenced project were received at 10:00 a.m. on Tuesday, October 14, 2025.
There were eight (8) bidders of record; three (3) bids were received. A bid tabulation sheet is
herein attached for your review.

We have analyzed the bids and the qualifications of the bidders and recommend that the
contract for the Roof Replacement at Independence Jr. High School project be awarded to the
lowest responsible, responsive bidder, Alloy Architectural Solutions. Their total base bid
proposal is $2,365,000. This includes allowance monies in the amount of $57,600 which will
be returned to the school district if not used at the end of the project.

Contractors were also asked to provide pricing for one alternate.  Alloy Architectural Solutions
provided the following:

1. Alternate Bid 1: State the amount to be ADDED to the lump sum base bid to remove
all existing soffit lights and provide new soffit lights. We recommend accepting this
alternate. ADD: $8,800

You may or may not choose to include this alternate with their bid. If you include the
recommended Alternate 1, the total bid amount is $2,373,800.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Nikki D. Bridges

Enclosure – Bid Tabulation
cc: Vicki Luczynski, StudioGC

P:\Palos Heights SD 128\25022 - Roof Replacement at Independence\F-Bid Negotiation\_Bids\25022_LOR Roof Replacement Independence
110525.docx

nikkib
Nikki D Bridges



223 W. Jackson Blvd. Client: Palos Heights School District # 128

Suite 1200 Project Name: Roof Replacement at Independence
Chicago, IL  60606 Jr. High School
P:  (312) 253-3400 Project No.: 25022

Bid Date: Tuesday, October 14, 2025 @ 10:00 a.m.
Project Architect: Gisela Patino

Total Bid Addendum Bid
Amount #1 #2 Bond

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No.1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1

Alt. No. 1:  State the amount to be ADDED to the lump sum base bid to remove all existing soffit lights and provide new soffit lights as detailed on updated Sheet A3.05 – Soffit Plan

BID TAB WORKSHEET

708-427-5654

Contractor Remarks

Alloy Architectural Solutions $8,800.00
$2,365,000.00

G.E. Riddiford Company

$3,101,615.00Bennet & Brosseau Roofing
630-759-0009

No Bid

X X

X XX

$2,958,350.00 X
$0.00

X

RZ Construction Services
708-932-1405

No Bid

No BidPatriot Contracting
708-612-6255

Taza Construction
877-817-2841

Wiesbrook
630-922-9050

$0.00

No Bid

No Bid

847-724-5400
L. Marshall

847-378-6010



Presentation of Tax Levy
2025 Levy Year

November/December 2025



Timetable for Tax Levy Adoption

November 12, 2025
Estimated aggregate tax levy presented to the School 
Board

December 10, 2025
Board of Education approves 2025 tax levy

December 30, 2025
District must file necessary documents with the County 
Clerk by the last Tuesday in December

2



Factors to Consider in 
Making Levy Decision
▪ Impact of the decision on the long-term financial 

condition of the district
How does the levy decision impact projected fund balance reserves?

▪ Impact of the decision on long-term quality of 
educational services in the district
Will the District be able to maintain fund balance reserve targets 
without adversely impacting staffing and programming?

▪ Impact of the decision on the condition of the 
district’s facilities
Will the District be able to address capital needs and wants while both 
maintaining fund balance reserve targets and desired educational 
services? 

3



Breakdown of Revenues - FY 2026 Budget
Real Estate Taxes Comprise 79% of D128’s Total Revenue Sources

Real Estate Taxes
79%

Evidenced-Based 
Funding

4%

State Grants
8%

Federal Grants
4%

Other Local
4%

4



CPI History (Applicable CPI is 2.9% for 2025 Tax Levy)
R/E Tax Revenue Growth Capped by Lessor of Rate of Inflation or 5%

0.00%

1.00%

2.00%

3.00%

4.00%

5.00%

6.00%

7.00%

History of Tax Caps in Illinois

5

Levy Year



New Taxable Property Growth in District
New Taxable Property Allows for Tax Revenue Growth to Exceed CPI

6

Rule of Thumb:  

Each $1 million in new property EAV ($3 million in market 

value) generates approximately $25,000 of additional revenues 

above tax cap limits to D128.

Estimated New Taxable Property:

For the 2025 Tax levy, new taxable property is estimated at 

$1,000,000 (County estimate).  This would generate 

approximately $25,000 in additional revenues to the District.

Levy 
Year

New Property 
EAV

2015 $ 474,000

2016 1,018,000

2017 646,000

2018 834,000

2019 2,090,000

2020 1,375,000

2021 322,000

2022 292,000

2023 152,000

2024 175,000



Recommended Tax Levy for Levy Year 2025
Captures Maximum Allowable Growth Within Tax Cap Restrictions (2.9%) Plus Additional 

Revenues Estimated from New Taxable Property

Fund Description 2025 Levy Request

Education Fund $ 7,840,000

Operations and Maintenance Fund 970,000

Transportation Fund 470,000

Working Cash Fund 149,000

IMRF Fund 260,000

Social Security Fund 320,000

Liability Insurance Fund -

Special Education Fund 355,000

Leasing Fund                     -

Total Levy $10,364,000

7

2025 tax levy request is 4.0% above prior year tax extension



Public Act 103-0394 Report
Annual Expenses

Operational Funds FY 2023 Audit FY 2024 Audit FY 2025 Unaudited 3-Year Average

Education (10) $  9,624,000 $10,442,000 $11,063,000 $10,376,000

Operations & Maintenance (20) 880,000 983,000 1,072,000 978,000

Transportation (40) 427,000 506,000 524,000 486,000

Total $10,931,000 $11,931,000 $12,659,000 $11,840,000

8

Unaudited Fund Balances – June 30, 2025

Operational Funds Fund Balance

Education (10) $4,417,000

Operations & Maintenance (20) 380,000

Transportation (40) 620,000

Total $5,417,000

Fund Balance / Average Expense

Operational Fund Balance (6/30/25) $ 5,417,000

Three-Year Expense Average $11,840,000

Fund Balance/Average Expense 45.7%



End of Presentation



INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT FOR RECIPROCAL REPORTING 
BETWEEN THE PALOS HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 128 

AND THE CITY OF PALOS HEIGHTS 
 

THIS INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT (“Agreement”) is made and entered into by and 
between the Palos Heights School District No. 128 ("District"), the Palos Heights Police Department 
(“Department”), and the City of Palos Heights, ("City") (collectively, the “Parties”). 
 
​ WHEREAS, schools within the District are located at 12402 South Oak Park Avenue (Navajo 
Heights Elementary School) and 6610 West Highland Drive (Independence Junior High) Palos Heights, IL 
60463, which is within the City’s jurisdiction; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City operates the Palos Heights Police Department which provides law 
enforcement services within the City’s jurisdiction; and 
 

WHEREAS, both the 1970 Illinois Constitution (Article VII, Section 10) and the Intergovernmental 
Cooperation Act (5 ILCS 220/1 et seq.) authorize and encourage intergovernmental cooperation; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City and the District are public agencies pursuant to Section 2 of the 

Intergovernmental Cooperation Act (5 ILCS 220/2); and 
 

​ WHEREAS, the Parties have mutually determined it would be in the best interest of the safety 
and welfare of students and employees of the District to have a reciprocal reporting system between the 
District and the Department regarding criminal offenses committed by students enrolled in the District;  

WHEREAS, Section 1-7(A)(8) and 5-905(1)(h) of the Juvenile Court Act, Sections 10-20.14, 
10-21.7, 10-27.1a, 10-27.1b, and 22-20 of the Illinois School Code, and Section 10/6(a)(6.5) of the Illinois 
School Student Records Act provide for and authorize agreements between local law enforcement 
agencies and school districts for reciprocal reporting of criminal offenses committed by students; and  

 
WHEREAS, the District, the City, and the Department are entering into this Agreement for the 

purposes of promoting safety, security, and order for the staff, the students, and the premises of the 
District, including parents, families, and community members, and in furtherance of maintaining a 
cooperative relationship between the District, the City, and law enforcement officials; and 

 
WHEREAS, this Agreement will be in full force and effect on the date signed below. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises, covenants and conditions contained in 
this Agreement and other good and valuable consideration, the District, the City, and the Department 
agree as follows:  
 
1)​ General Cooperation  

 
a)​ The Superintendent will provide the City and Department with a list of school administrators 

(“School Officials”) to be contacted as needed consistent with the terms of this Agreement. The 
list will contain regular and emergency telephone numbers and identify which administrators are 
to be contacted for various types of issues and the order in which the School Officials are to be 
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contacted. The School Officials identified shall be considered the “Appropriate School Officials” 
for purposes of § 1-7(a)(8) of the Juvenile Court Act. 
 

b)​ The City will provide the Superintendent with the names and titles of at least one primary and 
two back up contacts (“Police Officials”) responsible for implementing this Agreement. The 
Police Officials shall provide their regular and emergency telephone numbers.  
 

c)​ The Superintendent and City may, as they deem necessary and upon written notice, designate 
different persons to the respective positions of School Official and Police Official. 

 
d)​ School Officials and Police Officials will meet to facilitate and review implementation of this 

Agreement as often as may be necessary to fully effectuate the terms of this Agreement. 
 

e)​ Nothing in this Agreement is intended to limit or restrict the duty and authority of any District 
personnel to request police services for disturbances or other emergencies occurring in or 
around any school building, nor is it intended to limit or restrict the duty or ability of any person 
attending or employed by the District to provide information or otherwise cooperate in law 
enforcement investigations, including but not limited to, providing witness statements and 
testimony as may be necessary.  

 
2)​ Reporting of Student Activity By School Officials to Police Officials 

 
a)​ School Officials will promptly report to Police Officials the activity of students who attend a 

District school that involves or is suspected to involve: 
●​ Criminal gang activity; 
●​ Criminal sexual offenses;  
●​ Any violation of Article 24 of the Criminal Code, 720 ILCS 5/24-1 et seq, or weapons such 

as guns and knives, explosives, impact devices, or any item used as a weapon;  
●​ Sale of drugs or other intoxicants;  
●​ Possession of drugs or other intoxicants; 
●​ Fights or other violent activity which might reasonably carry over into the community;  
●​ Abuse, neglect, lock-out, and runaway situations;  
●​ Acts of vandalism; 
●​ Hate crimes;  
●​ Other activities involving students which threaten the safety of students or any other 

person on or off District property; or  
●​ Any state or federal crime occurring or which has occurred on school property or at a 

school event that might reasonably carry over into the community.  

b)​ Upon receipt of a written complaint from any school personnel, the Superintendent shall report 
all incidents of battery committed against a school employee to Police Officials. 105 ILCS 
5/10-21.7. 
 

c)​ School Officials will immediately report to Police Officials any time a report is made that a person 
with a firearm has been observed on school grounds. 105 ILCS 5/10-27.1a.  

 
d)​ School Officials will immediately report to Police Officials any time a report is made of a verified 

incident involving drugs on school grounds. 105 ILCS 5/10-27.1b.  
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e)​ Where violence or other activity poses an imminent threat to the safety of students or any other 

person, the information will be shared as soon as possible; otherwise, the information will be 
shared not later than two (2) business days after the information becomes known to School 
Officials.  

 
f)​ Information shared pursuant to this Agreement will be disclosed in accordance with Section 

10/6(a)(6.5) of the Illinois School Student Records Act. All information disclosed and 
communications made under this Agreement will remain confidential and will not be disclosed 
to any third party, except as provided by law or court order.  

 
g)​ Section 10/6(a)(6.5) of the Illinois School Student Records Act provides that the District may 

release school student records or information to juvenile authorities when necessary for the 
discharge of their official duties upon a request for information prior to adjudication of the 
student and if certified in writing that the information will not be disclosed to any other party 
except as provided under law or order of court. “Juvenile authorities” include probation officers, 
law enforcement officers and prosecutors, and others as defined in Section 10/6(a)(6.5). 

 
3)​ Reporting of Student Activity By Police Officials to School Officials  
 

a)​ As provided by Section 1-7(a)(8) of the Juvenile Court Act, Police Officials will share law 
enforcement records with School Officials that relate to the following offenses or suspected 
offenses for any minor enrolled in one of the District’s schools who has been taken into custody 
or arrested, when Police Officials believe there is an imminent threat of physical harm to 
students, school personnel, or others who are present in the school or on school grounds: 

 
●​ Any violation of Article 24 of the Criminal Code (720 ILCS 5/24 seq.) (weapons); 
●​ A violation of the Illinois Controlled Substances Act (720 ILCS 570/100, et seq.);  
●​ A violation of the Cannabis Control Act (720 ILCS 550/1, et seq.);  
●​ A forcible felony as defined in Section 2-8 of the Criminal Code (e.g., murder, criminal 

sexual assault, robbery, burglary, arson, kidnapping, aggravated battery and any other 
felony that involves the use or threat of physical force or violence), (720 ILCS 5/2-8);  

●​ A violation of the Methamphetamine Control and Community Protection Act (720 ILCS 
646/1 et seq.);  

●​ A violation of Section 1-2 (harassment through electronic communications) of the 
Harassing and Obscene Communications Act (720 ILCS 5/26.5);  

●​ A violation of the Hazing Act (720 ILCS 5/12C-50); or  
●​ A violation of Section 12-1 (assault), 12-2 (aggravated assault), 12-3 (battery), 12-3.05 

(aggravated battery), 12-3.1 (battery of an unborn child; aggravated battery of an 
unborn child), 12-3.2 (domestic battery), 12-3.4 (violation of an order of protection), 
12-3.5 (interfering with the reporting of domestic violence), 12-5 (reckless conduct), 
12-7.3 (stalking), 12-7.4 (aggravated stalking), 12-7.5 (cyberstalking), 25-1 (mob action), 
or 25-5 (unlawful contact with street gang members) of the Criminal Code of 1961 or the 
Criminal Code of 2012.  
 

b)​ Police Officials will share information with School Officials concerning a minor who is the subject 
of a current police investigation that is directly related to school safety. Such information may 
only be shared orally and shall be kept separate from and shall not become part of the official 
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school record of the student, nor shall it be a public record. For the purposes of this Agreement, 
“current police investigation” means an official, systemic inquiry by Police Officials into actual or 
suspected criminal activity. 
 

c)​ As required by Section 22-20 of the Illinois School Code, Police Officials shall report to the 
District’s Principal or designee whenever a student is detained for proceedings under the 
Juvenile Court Act or for any criminal offense or any violation of a municipal or County 
ordinance. The report shall include the basis for the detention, the circumstances surrounding 
the detention, and the status of the proceedings. Police Officials shall periodically update the 
report as significant stages of the proceedings occur and with the disposition of the matter. 

 
4)​ Confidentiality and Records  

 
a)​ Content of Criminal Activity Information. All criminal activity information shall include the names 

of all involved persons, including District students and minors, except in cases where the name 
of the victim is protected under the Rights of Crime Victims and Witnesses Act, 725 ILCS 120/1, 
et seq., as amended, or other applicable law. 
 

b)​ Confidentiality of Records and Criminal Activity Information. Any law enforcement and student 
records subject to disclosure under this Agreement shall not be disclosed or made available in 
any form to any person or agency other than as set forth in this Agreement or as authorized by 
law or court order. Police Officials and School Officials shall develop procedures to ensure such 
nondisclosure of criminal activity information. Such procedures shall be designed to also ensure 
that any criminal activity information is not available to other employees, or any persons other 
than as authorized by this Agreement or by law.  

 
c)​ Written Records.  

 
i)​ School Officials shall follow State and federal laws regarding the maintenance and 

confidentiality of student records.  
 

ii)​ All reports and records shared by Police Officials with School Officials shall be kept in a 
secure location and shall not be a public record. Such information shall be kept separate 
from and shall not become a part of the student’s official school record. The information 
shall be used by School Officials solely to aid in the proper rehabilitation of the student and 
to protect the safety of students and employees in the schools. If the designated law 
enforcement and school officials deem it to be in the best interest of the minor, the student 
may be referred to in-school or community based social services, if those services are 
available.  “Rehabilitation services” may include interventions by school support personnel, 
evaluation for eligibility for special education, referrals to community-based agencies such as 
youth services, behavioral healthcare service providers, drug and alcohol prevention or 
treatments programs, and other interventions as deemed appropriate for the student. 

 
5)​ Other Terms and Conditions 
 

a)​ Complete Agreement. This Agreement sets forth all the covenants, conditions, and promises 
between the parties. There are no covenants, promises, agreements, conditions or 
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understandings between the parties, either oral or written, other than those contained in this 
Agreement. 
 

b)​ Term and Renewal. This Agreement shall immediately take effect on the effective date, as set 
forth in this Agreement and shall be in full force and effect for a period of two (2) years 
thereafter. This Agreement shall automatically renew for successive two-year periods unless 
terminated as provided below.  
 

c)​ Termination. This Agreement may be terminated at any time upon 30 days advance written 
notice by any Party.  
 

d)​ Amendments and Modifications. This Agreement may be modified or amended from time to 
time provided, however, that no such amendment or modifications shall be effective unless 
reduced to writing and duly signed by an authorized representative of the parties. 
 

e)​ Provisions Severable. If any term, covenant, condition, or provision of this Agreement is held by a 
court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, void, or unenforceable, the remainder of the 
provisions shall remain in full force and effect and shall in no way be affected, impaired, or 
invalidated.  
 

f)​ Information. Information may be communicated verbally by the Parties to their designees at any 
time deemed necessary by the designee.  
 

g)​ Notice.   
 

i)​ Any and all notices required hereunder to be sent to the District shall be served in writing to 
the following address: 

 
Palos Heights School Dist. #128 
Attn: Superintendent 
12809 S. McVickers Avenue 
Palos Heights, IL 60463 
(708) 597-9040 
d128safety@palos128.org​  
 

Service shall be made by the United States certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt 
requested, by personal delivery of any such notice delivered to an employee of the District 
at its District administration office during the regular business hours of said office, or via 
email to the Superintendent or designee.  

 
ii)​ Any and all notices required hereunder to be sent to the Department shall be served in 

writing to the following address: 
 
Palos Heights Police Department 
Attn: Chief of Police 
7607 W. College Dr.  
Palos Heights, IL 60463 
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(708) 448-5060 
​ MYott@palosheightspd.org 
 

Service shall be made by the United States certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt 
requested, by personal delivery of any such notice delivered to designated Police Officials at 
the Police Station office during the regular business hours of said office, or via email to the 
Chief of Police or designee. 
 

h)​ Indemnification 
i)​ To the fullest extent permitted by law, the District agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the 

City, its officers, officials, agents, volunteers, employees, and their successors and assigns, in 
their individual and official capacities (the “City Indemnified Parties”) from and against any 
and all liabilities, loss, claim, demand, lien, damage, penalty, fine, interest, cost and expense, 
including without limitation, reasonable attorneys’ fees and litigation costs, incurred by the 
City Indemnified Parties arising out of any activity of the District in performance of this 
Agreement, or any act or omission of the District or of any employee, agent, contractor, or 
volunteer of the District (the “School Indemnitors”), but only to the extent caused in whole 
or in part by any negligent or willful and wanton act or omission of the School Indemnitors.  
 

ii)​ To the fullest extent permitted by law, the City agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the 
District, its Board and its members, employees, volunteers, agents, their successors, and 
assigns, in their individual and official capacities (the “School Indemnified Parties”) from and 
against any and all liabilities, loss, claim, demand, lien, damage, penalty, fine, interest, cost 
and expense, including without limitation, reasonable attorneys’ fees and litigation costs, 
incurred by the School Indemnified Parties arising out of any activity of the City in 
performance of this Agreement, or any act or omission of the City or of any employee, 
agent, contractor or volunteer of the City (the “City Indemnitors”), but only to the extent 
caused in whole or in part by any negligent or willful and wanton act or omission of the City 
Indemnitors.  

 
IN WITNESS THEREOF, the Parties have signed this Agreement on the date set forth below. If the 

dates differ, the latter date shall be considered the effective date of this Agreement.  
 

[Signature Page Below] 
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City of Palos Heights,  
Palos Heights, Illinois, 
 
 
By:  __________________________________ 
        Mayor                                               Date  
 
ATTEST: 
 
By: ___________________________________ 
       City Clerk                                                Date 
 
 
 
 
 

Palos Heights School District No. 128,  
Palos Heights, Illinois,  
 
 
By:  ____________________________________ 
        President                                                    Date 
 
ATTEST: 
 
By:  ____________________________________ 
        Secretary                                                    Date 
 
 
 
 

Palos Heights Police Department,  
Palos Heights, Illinois, 
 
 
By:  __________________________________ 
        Chief of Police                                       Date  
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Monthly Financial Report - October 2025
Palos Heights School District 128

Real Estate Taxes 0 97,000

Other Local Sources 25,000 113,000

Evidenced-Based Funding 57,000 172,000

Other State Sources 123,000 429,000

Federal Sources 17,000 227,000

Total All Funds $222,000 $1,038,000

Source Month YTD

Revenues Received During Month

Monthly Revenues and Expenditures for FY26

1.5M

1.0M

0.5M

0

July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb March April May June

Revenues Expenditures

Salaries 1,027,000 2,250,000

Benefits 281,000 623,000

Purchased Services 128,000 618,000

Supplies & Materials 37,000 224,000

Capital Outlays 134,000 839,000

Tuition and Other 14,000 207,000

Debt Payments 0 0

Total All Funds $1,621,000 $4,761,000

Object Month YTD

Expenses Paid During Month
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July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb March April May June
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0M 0M 0M 0M 0M 0M 0M 0M

Monthly Fund Balance - All Funds

October 2025 Report - Data as of November 6, 2025. All figures are rounded to the nearest thousand.



Budget Tracking Report

Total Revenues

Received 7.3% Remaining 92.7%

Total Expenditures

Spent 27.8%
Remaining 72.2%

Real Estate Taxes 97,000 11,276,000 0.86% 11,179,000

Other Local Sources 113,000 695,000 16.26% 582,000

Evidenced-Based Funding 172,000 620,000 27.74% 448,000

Other State Sources 429,000 1,205,000 35.60% 776,000

Federal Sources 227,000 482,000 47.10% 255,000

Total All Funds $1,038,000 $14,278,000 7.27% $13,240,000

Source YTD Budget % of Budget Budget Remaining

Revenues Received - Actual YTD vs. Total  FY Budget

Salaries 2,250,000 8,842,000 25.45% 6,592,000

Benefits 623,000 2,245,000 27.75% 1,622,000

Purchased Services 618,000 1,732,000 35.68% 1,114,000

Supplies 224,000 702,000 31.91% 478,000

Capital Outlays 839,000 1,484,000 56.54% 645,000

Tuition and Other 207,000 629,000 32.91% 422,000

Debt Service 0 1,508,000 0.00% 1,508,000

Total All Funds $4,761,000 $17,142,000 27.77% $12,381,000

Source YTD Budget % of Budget Budget Remaining

Expenses Paid - Actual YTD vs. Total FY Budget

$15,043,000 $1,038,000 $4,761,000 $11,320,000

Beginning Balance YTD Revenues YTD Expenditures Bond Proceeds - YTD Ending Balance

$15,043,000 $14,278,000 $17,142,000 $12,179,000

Beginning Balance Budgeted Revenues Budgeted Expenditures Budgeted Bond Proceeds Budgeted Ending Balance

% Actual vs. Budget

FY26 Actual YTD

FY26 Total Budget

October 2025 Report - Data as of November 6, 2025. All figures are rounded to the nearest thousand.



Current Year vs. Prior Year Tracking Report
15M

10M

5M

0
July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb March April May June

FY25 FY26

Monthly Fund Balance Comparison

YTD Revenues FY26 vs. FY25

Real Estate Taxes 97,000 5,180,000 (5,083,000)

Other Local Sources 113,000 190,000 (77,000)

Evidenced-Based Funding 172,000 169,000 3,000

Other State Sources 429,000 488,000 (59,000)

Federal Sources 227,000 395,000 (168,000)

Total All Funds $1,038,000 $6,422,000 $(5,384,000)

Source Current YTD FY25 YTD FY26 v. FY25

Salaries 2,250,000 1,746,000 504,000

Benefits 623,000 471,000 152,000

Purchased Services 618,000 463,000 155,000

Supplies 224,000 197,000 27,000

Capital Outlays 839,000 179,000 660,000

Tuition and Other 207,000 210,000 (3,000)

Debt Payments 0 0 0

Total All Funds $4,761,000 $3,266,000 $1,495,000

Object Current YTD FY25 YTD FY26 v. FY25

YTD Expenditures FY26 vs. FY25

Current YTD Revenues vs. Expenditures
$(3,723,000)

Prior YTD Revenues vs. Expenditures
$3,156,000

October 2025 Report - Data as of November 6, 2025. All figures are rounded to the nearest thousand.



Cash Flow Report
Revenues Received by Month vs. Prior Years
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FY24 FY25 FY26

Expenditures Paid by Month vs. Prior Years

October 2025 Report - Data as of November 6, 2025. All figures are rounded to the nearest thousand.



Education 4,417,000 870,000 3,224,000 2,063,000

Operations and Maintenance 380,000 108,000 464,000 24,000

Transportation 620,000 41,000 111,000 550,000

Working Cash 2,803,000 4,000 0 2,807,000

Total - Operating Funds $8,220,000 $1,023,000 $3,799,000 $5,444,000

Bond and Interest 844,000 12,000 0 856,000

IMRF/Social Security 223,000 2,000 128,000 97,000

Capital Projects 5,751,000 1,000 834,000 4,918,000

Tort Immunity 5,000 0 0 5,000

Health/Life Safety 0 0 0 0

Total - Other Funds $6,823,000 $15,000 $962,000 $5,876,000

Total - All Funds $15,043,000 $1,038,000 $4,761,000 $11,320,000

Fund Beginning Balance Revenues YTD Expenses YTD Transfers - Other Ending Balance

Fund Balance Report 

October 2025 Report - Data as of November 6, 2025. All figures are rounded to the nearest thousand.



Laura Kriha <lkriha@palos128.org>

Public Record Request Reply
1 message

Kim Anoman <kanoman@palos128.org> Fri, Oct 17, 2025 at 10:21 AM
To: steve.watts643@gmail.com
Cc: Merryl Brownlow <mbrownlow@palos128.org>, Laura Kriha <lkriha@palos128.org>

Mr. Watts,

Per your FOIA request below attached is the information that you requested.  Let me know if you have any questions.  

Good day Ms./Mrs. Brownlow,

I hope you're doing well.

I'm reaching out under the Illinois Freedom of Information Act (5 ILCS 140/1 et seq.) to kindly request public records for
all current employees at Palos Heights School District 128. Specifically, I’m looking for the following information:

Full legal name

Job title or role

Official work email address

Assigned worksite or campus

Current annual salary

If this information is already compiled in a report or spreadsheet, I’d really appreciate receiving the most up-to-date
version available. An electronic file—ideally in Excel (.xlsx) or CSV (.csv) format—would be perfect.

If anything in my request needs clarification or adjustment, please don’t hesitate to let me know. I’m happy to work with
you to make sure everything is clear and manageable. I’d also be grateful for a response within the timeframe outlined in
the Illinois FOIA statute.

Thanks so much for your time and help—I truly appreciate it, and I look forward to hearing from you.

Warm regards,
Steve Watts
1300 Buchta Rd, Angleton, TX 77515
steve.watts643@gmail.com

Kim Anoman
Business Manager
Palos Heights School District #128
708-597-9040

Position and Pay Records Export FOIA.xlsx
18K
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Laura Kriha <lkriha@palos128.org>

FOIA request
1 message

Kim Anoman <kanoman@palos128.org> Thu, Nov 6, 2025 at 9:45 AM
To: tmathis@carpentersunion.org, Laura Kriha <lkriha@palos128.org>

Mr. Mathis,

Per your request below, attached is the bid tabulation, the awarded contractor will be approved at our November 12th
board meeting.  I will send you an email the following day to let you know who was awarded. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: 'Tony Mathis' via D128 Board of Education <D128Board@d128.k12.il.us>
Date: Tue, Nov 4, 2025 at 7:47 AM
Subject: FOIA Request
To: d128board@palos128.org <d128board@palos128.org>

Roof Replacement- Independence Jr HS

Please send bid documents and which contractor was awarded the above-mentioned project.

Thank You in advance,

Tony Mathis
Roofing, Siding and Insulation Specialist
Mid-America Carpenters Regional Council
Local 250
Cell: 815-520-8820
Email: tmathis@carpentersunion.org
Kim Anoman
Business Manager
Palos Heights School District #128
708-597-9040

Roof Bid Tabulation .pdf
59K

mailto:D128Board@d128.k12.il.us
mailto:D128Board@d128.k12.il.us
mailto:d128board@palos128.org
mailto:d128board@palos128.org
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https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=97cf006468&view=att&th=19a59d8beb28c391&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_mhnlkmsi0&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=97cf006468&view=att&th=19a59d8beb28c391&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_mhnlkmsi0&safe=1&zw
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