
The City Council reserves the right to enter into an executive session at any time during the meeting, in accordance with the 
Nebraska Open Meetings Act, even though the closed session may not be indicated on the agenda. 

It is the intention of the City Council to take up the items on the agenda in sequential order.  However, the City Council reserves 
the right to take up matters in a different order to accommodate the schedules of the City Council members, persons having 
items on the agenda, and the public.  

AGENDA
VALLEY CITY COUNCIL

Tuesday, February 11, 2025
City Hall

203 North Spruce
Valley, NE 68064

7:00 PM

1. Call to Order 

2. Roll Call

3. Pledge of Allegiance 

4. Proof of Publication 

5. Visitors/Correspondence

Anyone desiring to speak on any item or issue not on the agenda or any item on the 
agenda that does not include a public hearing may do so; but shall be limited to three 
(3) minutes.  Persons should identify themselves by name and address.  Persons 
speaking should not expect the Council to engage in back-and-forth dialogue regarding 
their comments.  Unless an agenda item includes a public hearing, no person may 
speak during the business portion of the meeting; provided, however, persons speaking 
during a public hearing are limited to between five (5) and twenty (20) minutes.  
The public is advised that a copy of the Open Meetings Act is located on the north wall 
of the Council Chamber, and one copy of all reproducible written material to be 
discussed at this meeting is available for examination or copying.  

6. Approval of Agenda 

7. Consent Agenda

All agenda items on the consent agenda and will be acted on in a single 
motion.  Consent agenda items are being forwarded to the Council Members.  Any 
individual item may be removed by a council member for special discussion and 
consideration.

7.A.Approve Minutes of January 14, 2025 City Council meeting  

7.B.Approve Treasurer's Report 

7.C. Approve invoices and additional invoices presented for payment

                                  

7.D.Approve January Payroll $101113.53 and IRA $3602.82
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7.E. Accept January Keno Receipts $7977.88 

7.F. Accept PeopleService Inc., Report 

7.G.Accept minutes and/or statistics of the following boards and/or committees: 

• January Library statistics

• January 16 Cemetery minutes 

7.H.Twin Rivers Special Designated Liquor License for fundraiser March 14, 2025 

8. Jaime Kobs 28015 Heron Circle request No Parking signs along the curve around 
Valley Shores in front of the apartment complex between the stop sign and the 
entrance to the apartment complex 

9. Recognition of James Olmsted

10. Recognition of Doug Eggen

11. Open Meetings Act  - refresher by City Attorney

12. 2025 Fireworks Sale Applications

12.A. Resolution No. 2025-06 American Legion Post 58/Legion Baseball consideration 
and approval of application 

12.B. Resolution No. 2025-07 Valley Days Foundation consideration and approval of 
application 

13. Special Designated Liquor License - Shockwave Sports Assn. consideration and 
approval of SDL request for a fundraiser on March 1, 2025, at the Valley American 
Legion Post 58

14. Prominence Global (Catalina) consideration and approval of amending Ordinance No. 
823 detachment of Residential SID Parcel to include the streets Ordinance No. 834

15. Ordinance No. 830 consideration and approval of corrected water rates

16. Conditional Use Permit Jerry Smith accessory building or accessory structure 
exception 25050 Hwy 275 

• Review

• Open Public Hearing

• Close Public Hearing

• Resolution No. 2025-02

17. Discussion regarding retaining an outside attorney to render a second legal opinion 
regarding the role of City Council in appointing and/or terminating City Officers 
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18. Discussion regarding Executive Session confidentiality

19. Request to add the Ethical Contracting and Procurement Transparency Ordinance to 
the agenda for consideration and action (Hayden Draft Ordinance/Resolution 2025-1)

20. Request to add the City Administrator Accountability & Performance Standards 
Ordinance to the agenda for consideration and action (Hayden Draft 
Ordinance/Resolution 2025-2)

21. Request to add the Police Department Oversight Ordinance to the agenda for 
consideration and action (Hayden Draft Ordinance/Resolution 2025-3)

22. City Treasurer - audit update

23. Building Inspector - end of year wrap up

24. City Administrator - update

25. PeopleService - update

26. City Engineer 

26.A. Water Treatment Plant Expansion - Eriksen Construction 

26.A.1. Resolution No. 2025-08 Council consideration and action to approve 
Contractor's Application for Payment No. 1 in the amount of $77,775.75 to 
Eriksen Construction

26.B. Ginger Cove Bridge Repainting 

26.B.1. Review of Bids received

26.B.2. Council consideration and action Award of Contract 

26.C. Valley Landing - Sanitary Sewer, Water Main, Storm Sewer, and Paving 
Improvements

26.C.1. Review of Bids received

26.C.2. Council consideration and action award of Contract No. 1 and Contract 
No. 2

26.D. Other/Miscellaneous 

• Val-haven (Southwest No. 2) and Ginger Woods No. 2 Lift Station 
Improvements

• Valley Lakes Business Park

• FY2025 Street Projects 

27. City Attorney



The City Council reserves the right to enter into an executive session at any time during the meeting, in accordance with the 
Nebraska Open Meetings Act, even though the closed session may not be indicated on the agenda. 

It is the intention of the City Council to take up the items on the agenda in sequential order.  However, the City Council reserves 
the right to take up matters in a different order to accommodate the schedules of the City Council members, persons having 
items on the agenda, and the public.  

28. Mayor's Report 

29. Upcoming Items

• Valley Days Planning Meeting: Feb. 18, 2025 at 6:00 p.m. 

• Planning Commission: Feb. 18, 2025 at 4:30 p.m.

• Mid-Winter Conference in Lincoln, Feb. 24 and 25, 2025

• MAPA Elected Officials Training in Omaha Feb. 27, 2025 

• Doug Eggen Retirement Party Feb. 27, 2025 at 2:00-4:00 p.m.

30. Executive Session  - Linda Lewis complaint

31. Adjourn









































































Additional bills for Council:

Bamboo HR $350.20

Daily Record $29.33

JP Cooke $30.36

FiveNines $247.90

Trekk $12,647.00

Trekk $1,460.00

Wiese Plumbing $1,950.00



















Commission Summary
Date 1/21/2025

Paid to

City of Valley

For Period

1/1-1/15/2025

Description Amount
4,197.93

Amount $4,197.93



Commission Summary
Date 2/5/2025

Paid to

City of Valley

For Period

1/16-1/31/2025

Description Amount
3,779.95

Amount $3,779.95



 

 

 

Date: February 4, 2025 

To: City of Valley 

Report by: Jeremy Beam, Lead Operator 

O & M Report: January 2025 

 

 
Water Operation & Maintenance: 

 

 
➢ 136 locates were done for the month. 
➢ Meters were read on the 27th, we reread the locations that were not read on the 28th. 
➢ Shutoff Notices were handed out on the 27th. 
➢ Shutoffs were done on the 28th. 
➢ PeopleService has been working with the Utility Clerk to get non-read meters figured out and 

what is wrong with them, we have been going through a list of non-reads fixing MXU’s that are on 
the outside of the house. The ones inside the house will have to be contacted to set up an 
appointment. The top problem we are finding is that the wires are broken to the meter. We must 
get into the houses, then run new wires to the MXU’s. The other problem we are finding is the 
house has an old MXU’s, or the batteries are dead in the MXU. We are replacing them as we find 
them. 

➢ Until we get all of them fixed, we will have a person working on them every day, that person will 
be working close with the Utility Clerk to get this done. He will report to her every day on what he 
is finding and what ones have been fixed. The clerk is compiling a contact list for the house we 
must get into to fix. 

➢ Construction on the new water plant has started. They have been here every day getting ready. 
We are waiting for the City Office to sign and return the Standard Building Access Agreement to 
Great Plains so they can install the internet. Right now, Cox, our internet and phone provider runs 
through the area where the construction is being done. Cox charges a large fee to move the line 
so we switched our internet to Great Plains to have the installation done for free and have fiber 
optics. If this does not get moved and the Cox line is hit, we will lose the alarm system to the 
water plant and all the lift stations that call out when there is an issue. 

 

 

Wastewater Operation & Maintenance: 
 

 
➢ Meigs Street lift station is running on one pump, Electric Pump is coming Feb 4th to fix the number 

1 pump, the impeller on the pump has come off the drive shaft. They have the parts to fix it. 
These pumps take a crane to pull being in the lower level of the lift station. The number 2 pump is 
getting pulled because it is pulling 120 amps it should be 60 amps, they are going to pull this 
pump to see if it plugged up. 

➢ The grinder for Meigs Street lift station is being repaired and will be installed once the repairs are 
completed. Currently we are removing the debris daily from the bypass bar screen. 



 

 

Monthly Water Pumped Valley- In Gallons 
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  January-25 December-24 January-24 

Water Units    

Total Monthly Pumped Valley gallons 12,678,000 11,490,000 15,763,000 

Daily Average Pumped Valley gallons 414,709 377,366 436,290 

Average Fluoride Residual mg/L 0.00 0.00 0.00 

Fluoride used lbs 50.00 48.00 82.50 

Average Chlorine Residual mg/L 0.40 0.30 0.47 

Chlorine used lbs 1,670.00 1,397.00 243.40 

Potassium Permanganate lbs 378.00 338.70 607.00 

Wastewater     

Effluent Flow     

Total Flow Meigs Street gallons 14,763,000 23,302,000 8,375,000 

Avg Daily Flow Meigs Street gallons 476,000 751,000 270,000 

Total Flow Byarsville gallons 12,802,000 18,401,000 51,398,000 

Avg Daily Flow Byarsville gallons 413,000 593,000 16,580,000 

Total Flow Valmont gallons 358,000 366,000 428,780 

Avg Daily Flow Valmont gallons 11,500 11,800 13,831 

 

 



 

 

Total Flow Byersville - In Gallons 
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Total Flow Meigs - In Gallons 
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Item
Budgeted 

Amount
Amount Spent % of Budget % of Time

Maintenance Budget $32,162.00 $4,849.00 15% 33%

Total $32,162.00 $4,849.00 15% 100%

Contract True-Ups - Current Contract Year

 

 
January Work Orders Completed: 
 

Completed Equipment Location Task 

01/02/25 HIGH SERVICE PUMP #2 30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Service Equipment 

01/02/25 LADDERS 30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

01/02/25 PORTABLE GAS MONITOR 30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Calibrate 
Equipment 

01/02/25 TRIPOD 30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

01/02/25 FIRE EXTINGUISHERS 30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

Total Flow Valmont - In Gallons 
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Completed Equipment Location Task 

01/02/25 Chemical Feed Line  30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Service Equipment 

01/03/25 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 2  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/03/25 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 3  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/03/25 FIRST AID KIT  30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

01/03/25 HARNESS  30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

01/03/25 HOIST AND WINCHES  30029 WT Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

01/06/25 LIFT STATION #1-VALLEY, NE SYST  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Annual PM 

01/06/25 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 1  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/06/25 LIFT STATION #1-VALLEY, NE SYST  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Annual PM 

01/07/25 BYERSVILLE LS EMERGENCY 
GENERATOR 

 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 COUNTRY AIRE LIFTSTATION  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 DAIRY QUEEN LIFTSTATION  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 1 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 2 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 3 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 4 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 MEIGS LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 REGIOINAL LS EMERGENCY 
GENERATOR 

 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 VALHAVEN LIFTSTATION  30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 



 

 

Completed Equipment Location Task 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 1 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 2 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 3 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 4 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 5 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 6 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 7 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #1 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #2 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #1 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #2 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #3 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

01/07/25 2 INCH TRASH PUMP #3 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

Inspection 

01/07/25 LIFT STATION #1-VALLEY, NE SYST 30029 WW Valley, 
NE 

LS Monthly PM 

 



DAILY RECORDS  January 2025 
     This month  Last month  Last year 
LIBRARY VISITS:  
   Adults  426  457   305 
   Children 360  368   209 
  
Computers  Adults  51  58   20 
   Children 74  66   29 
 
Fax/Copies    26  36   43 
  
REFERENCE TRANSACTIONS 
Locating Library Materials   58   42   49 
Readers’ Advisory    19   18   27 
Account info and renewals  47  21   20 
Technology Assistance   40  79   92 
Local Info     46  25   40 
General Info     327  289   147 

Total 537  474   375 
 
TOTAL NUMBER OF LIBRARY PROGRAMS: 
   Adults  6  4   4 
   Teens  4  3   4 
   Children 8  7   9 
   Pre-K  1  1   1 
   Total  19  15   18 
 
TOTAL PROGRAM ATTENDANCE:  
   Adults  30  89   30 
   Teens  27  15   27  

Children 71  113   81 
   Pre-K  4  6   9 

Total   132  223   147 
  
NEW PATRONS 
Valley     10  7   6 
Douglas County   1  2   0 
Non-Douglas County   0  0   0 
Total     11  9   6 
 
Volunteers/hours   0/0  0/0   0/0 
 
MATERIALS CHECKED OUT: 
 
Adult      627  560   490 
 
Children    1277  910   909 
      
Overdrive    386  358   337  



Valley Cemetery Board 

Valley City Hall 

January 16th, 2025, 6:30pm 

Meeting Minutes 

 
Present: Members – Everett, Betty, Dean, Kurt, Krista, Lindi 
Guests: Bill Socha 

 

Meeting called to order at 6:47pm. 
Dean noted the Open Meeting Act on the north wall of the meeting room. 
 
Meeting minutes approved by: Kurt 
Seconded by: Lindi 
All in favor, motion carried. 

 

Old Business: 

Snide Property- Gerri contacted Douglas County attorneys office. Received message 
from Thereisa Urich that the Snide property is in the jurisdiction of Valley.  

Columbarium- Kurt will follow up with Hunter in the spring. 

Linda George Monument- Bulbs have been planted.  

Historic Log Book- Dean advised that cemetery board should contact Dave Williams 
about the need for book to be preserved and digitized. It would be useful for genealogy 
and cemetery research. Krista will reach out. 

Wreaths Across America- Kurt is learning new paperwork and processes. Will follow-up. 

Book flash drives- Dean spoke with Christie at city office. They are looking for them. 

Cemetery flag- Dean spoke with Christie about replacing the tattered flag. Have not 
heard follow-up. Bill will drive-out to verify if the flag is replaced. 

Digitizing cemetery records- Krista will continue to research costs and benefits of 
different options. Will present findings at next meeting. 

New Business: 

Omaha Daily Record- City has it at the office. Valley public notices are published in it. 



House Family Plot- Connie Salinas contacted the city about burying family ashes in 
family plot. Betty and Dean unable to find record of family name. Dean spoke with 
Reichmuth Funeral Home and the family plot is located in Prospect Hill Cemetery in 
Elkhorn. Reichmuth will handle. 

 

The next meeting will be March 27th, 2025, at 6:30pm. 
Kurt made a motion to adjourn, and Lindi seconded. 
The meeting was adjourned at 7:24pm. 
 
Meeting minutes recorded by secretary Krista Lewis. 

















R E S O L U T I O N   2 0 2 5 – 0 6
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA:

WHEREAS, the City of Valley, Douglas County, Nebraska, has received an Application 

for permit to sell fireworks within the Valley City Limits from American Legion Post 58/Legion 

Baseball, and 

WHEREAS, the Valley City Council in regular session on February 11, 2025 reviewed 

said Application. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Governing Body of the City of 

Valley, Douglas County, Nebraska, that the Application for a permit to sell fireworks submitted 

by American Legion Post 58/Legion Baseball is approved.  A fireworks permit will be issued to 

American Legion Post 58/Legion Baseball upon receipt of a copy of a certificate of insurance and 

payment of fees as set forth in Ordinance No. 620 and subject to any and all other reasonable 

conditions imposed by the City Building Inspector and/or City Code. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 11th day of February 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

_____________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor

ATTEST:

_________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk



































R E S O L U T I O N   2 0 2 5 – 0 7
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA:

WHEREAS, the City of Valley, Douglas County, Nebraska, has received an Application 

for permit to sell fireworks within the Valley City Limits from Valley Days Foundation, and 

WHEREAS, the Valley City Council in regular session on February 11, 2025 reviewed 

said Application. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Governing Body of the City of 

Valley, Douglas County, Nebraska, that the Application for a permit to sell fireworks submitted 

by Valley Days Foundation is approved.  A fireworks permit will be issued to Valley Days 

Foundation upon receipt of a copy of a certificate of insurance and payment of fees as set forth in 

Ordinance No. 620 and subject to any and all other reasonable conditions imposed by the City 

Building Inspector and/or City Code. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 11th day of February 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

_____________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor

ATTEST:

_________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk





















O R D I N A N C E   N O.   8 3 4

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 823, WHICH DETACHED CERTAIN 
REAL PROPERTY LOCATED WITHIN AND ADJACENT TO THE CITY OF VALLEY, 
NEBRASKA, PURSUANT TO NEB. REV. STAT. §18-3316, TO INCLUDE THE ENTIRETY 
OF ALL PUBLIC STREETS, HIGHWAYS AND PUBLIC RIGHTS-OF-WAY WITHIN OR 
IMMEDIATELY ADJACENT TO SAID ANNEXED AREAS; PROVIDING FOR AN 
EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE, PROVIDING FOR A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; 
AND PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF VALLEY, 
DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Elkhorn Athletic Association, a Nebraska non-profit corporation, owner of the real 
property legally described on Exhibit “A” attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference 
(the “Real Estate”) has submitted to the Mayor and City Council of the City of Valley, Douglas 
County, Nebraska requesting that the Real Estate be detached from the corporate limits of the City 
of Valley, Nebraska pursuant to Neb. Rev. Stat. § 18-3316.

Section 2. The Real Estate meets the requirements of Neb. Rev. Stat. § 18-3316.

Section 3. The Real Estate legally described on Exhibit “A” attached hereto and incorporated 
herein by this reference, including the entirety of all public streets, highways and public rights-
of-way within or immediately adjacent to said annexed areas, shall be and hereby is detached 
from the corporate limits of the City of Valley, Nebraska pursuant to Neb. Rev. Stat. § 18-3316. 

Section 4. That this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force after its passage and approval, as 
provided by law.

Section 5. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

PASSED AND APPROVED this 11th day of Feburary, 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, 
DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

 ________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor

ATTEST: 

________________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk
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DE-ANNEXATION BOUNDARY
PART OF THE NW1/4 AND ALSO PART OF
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DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

EXHIBIT "A"

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

A TRACT OF LAND BEING PART OF THE NE1/4 OF THE NE1/4, AND ALSO PART OF THE SE1/4 OF THE NE1/4, AND ALSO PART
OF THE SW1/4 OF THE NE1/4, AND ALSO PART OF THE NW1/4 OF THE NE1/4, AND ALSO PART OF THE NW1/4 OF THE SE1/4,
AND ALSO PART OF THE SE1/4 OF THE NW1/4, ALL IN SECTION 32, TOWNSHIP 16 NORTH, RANGE 10 EAST THE 6TH P.M.,
DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA, MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS:

BEGINNING AT THE CENTER OF SAID SECTION 32, SAID POINT ALSO BEING THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF LOT 2, LOVES
VALLEY, A SUBDIVISION LOCATED IN SAID SECTION 32; THENCE N89°59'47"W (BASIS OF BEARING: DOUGLAS COUNTY LOW
DISTORTION PROJECTION) ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID NW1/4 OF SECTION 32, SAID LINE ALSO BEING THE NORTH LINE
OF SAID LOT 2, LOVES VALLEY, AND ALSO THE NORTH LINE OF LOT 1, SAID LOVES VALLEY, A DISTANCE OF 294.56 FEET;
THENCE N00°09'31"E, A DISTANCE OF 451.74 FEET; THENCE N10°38'27"E, A DISTANCE OF 80.00 FEET; THENCE
SOUTHEASTERLY ON A CURVE TO THE LEFT WITH A RADIUS OF 560.00 FEET, A DISTANCE OF 102.45 FEET, SAID CURVE
HAVING A LONG CHORD WHICH BEARS S84°36'01"E, A DISTANCE OF 102.31 FEET; THENCE S89°50'29"E, A DISTANCE OF
588.74 FEET; THENCE N00°00'26"E, A DISTANCE OF 1795.71 FEET; THENCE N89°59'25"E, A DISTANCE OF 2178.96 FEET TO THE
WESTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF NORTH 252ND STREET; THENCE S00°07'51"E ALONG SAID WESTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY
LINE OF NORTH 252ND STREET, A DISTANCE OF 453.49 FEET TO THE NORTHERLY LINE OF LOT 1, NOYES SUBDIVISION, A
SUBDIVISION LOCATED IN SAID SECTION 32; THENCE S89°51'39"W ALONG SAID NORTHERLY LINE OF LOT 1, NOYES
SUBDIVISION, AND ALSO THE NORTHERLY LINE OF LOT 2, NOYES SUBDIVISION REPLAT 1, A SUBDIVISION LOCATED IN SAID
SECTION 32, A DISTANCE OF 524.21 FEET TO THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SAID LOT 2, NOYES SUBDIVISION REPLAT 1;
THENCE S00°10'59"E ALONG THE WESTERLY LINE OF SAID LOT 2, NOYES SUBDIVISION REPLAT 1, AND ALSO THE WESTERLY
LINE OF LOT 4, SAID NOYES SUBDIVISION, A DISTANCE OF 625.83 FEET TO THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF SAID LOT 4, NOYES
SUBDIVISION; THENCE S89°55'03"E ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID LOT 4, NOYES SUBDIVISION, A DISTANCE OF 495.50
FEET TO INTERSECTION OF SAID WESTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF NORTH 252ND STREET AND THE NORTHERLY
RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF MEGIS STREET; THENCE SOUTHWESTERLY ALONG SAID NORTHERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF
MEGIS STREET ON THE FOLLOWING FIVE (5) DESCRIBED COURSES; (1) SOUTHWESTERLY ON A CURVE TO THE RIGHT WITH
A RADIUS OF 1253.27 FEET, A DISTANCE OF 1531.92 FEET, SAID CURVE HAVING A LONG CHORD WHICH BEARS S44°10'01"W,
A DISTANCE OF 1438.31 FEET; (2) THENCE S79°25'17"W, A DISTANCE OF 772.07 FEET; (3) THENCE S77°32'51"W, A DISTANCE
OF 280.72 FEET; (4) THENCE S72°35'09"W, A DISTANCE OF 162.53 FEET; (5) THENCE S66°49'20"W, A DISTANCE OF 408.03 FEET
TO THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF SAID LOT 2, LOVES VALLEY, SAID POINT ALSO BEING ON THE WEST LINE OF SAID NW1/4
OF THE SE1/4, SECTION 32; THENCE N00°04'22"E ALONG SAID WEST LINE OF THE NW1/4 OF THE SE1/4, SECTION 32, A
DISTANCE OF 209.33 FEET TO  THE POINT OF BEGINNING.

SAID TRACT OF LAND CONTAINS AN AREA OF 4,498,725 SQUARE FEET OR 103.277 ACRES, MORE OR LESS.

AND ALSO INCLUDING THE ENTIRETY OF ALL PUBLIC STREETS, HIGHWAYS AND PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY WITHIN OR
IMMEDIATELY ADJACENT TO SAID ANNEXED AREA.

SEE PAGE 1 FOR LEGAL SKETCH

http://www.eacg.com
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O R D I N A N C E   N O.   8 3 0

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING SECTION 6-208 OF THE VALLEY MUNICIPAL CODE.  AN 
ORDINANCE ADOPTING REVISED SECTION 6-208, INCLUDING SETTING NEW 
WATER USAGE RATES SERVICES FOR CUSTOMERS OF THE CITY WATER 
DEPARTMENT BOTH INSIDE AND OUTSIDE THE CITY LIMITS; PROVIDING FOR AN 
EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; 
AND PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF VALLEY, 
DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 6-208 of the Valley Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 2. Section 6-208 of the Valley Municipal Code shall hereafter be as follows:

6-208 WATER USAGE RATES  

1. All water consumers shall be liable for the monthly base charge and the monthly 
usage charge set forth below unless and until the consumer shall, by written order, 
direct the City to shut off the water at the stop box, in which case the consumer shall 
not be liable thereafter for water service until the water service is re-established. 

Residential Property Inside City Limits:

Monthly Base Charge $22.50

Monthly Usage Charge (per 1,000 gallons) $2.50

Residential Users Outside City Limits:

Monthly Base Charge $29.50

Monthly Usage Charge (per 1,000 gallons) $3.00



Commercial and Industrial Users Inside or Outside of City Limits:

Monthly Base Charge $33.75

Monthly Usage Charge (per 1,000 gallons) $3.00

2. The rates fixed by this Section shall be reviewed periodically by the City Council and 
shall be adjusted for the purpose of providing for the payment of expenses of 
maintenance, operation, repair and replacement of the components of the water system. 

3. Bills for water charges shall be rendered following each month’s usage and shall 
become delinquent after the 15th of each month. A delinquency fee of Ten Dollars 
($10.00) shall be added to any delinquent bill to cover the additional expenses incurred 
by the City.

4. The mayor and City Council members hereby find and determine that the charges 
established by this section are just and equitable rates and charges to be paid to the City 
by each consumer using the system.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, 

approval and publication or posting as provided by law. 

Section 4. If any section, clause, provision or part or portion of any section, clause or 

provision of this ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstance is held 

unconstitutional, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or application 

of any other section, clause, provision or part or portion of this ordinance.

Section 5.  All ordinances or parts thereof in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 14TH DAY OF JANUARY, 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

_______________________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor

ATTEST:

____________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk





R E S O L U T I O N   N O.  2 0 2 5 – 0 2
WHEREAS, an Application for Conditional Use Permit has been filed by Centaur 

Development Corporation, a Nebraska corporation, requesting a Conditional Use Permit allowing 
Centaur Development Corporation to approve the construction of an accessory building on certain 
real property legally described as:

Lot 1, L & J Subdivision, s subdivision in Douglas County, Nebraska
(the “Property”)

WHEREAS, the Property is zoned Highway Commercial (C-3); and

WHEREAS, the Application for Conditional Use Permit was considered by the Valley 
Planning Commission on December 17, 2024, and the Planning Commission has recommended 
that the Conditional Use Permit should be denied; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has reviewed the Application for Conditional Use Permit 
and the recommendations of the Planning Commission, and has voted to approve the Conditional 
Use Permit as set forth in the Conditional Use Agreement attached hereto as Exhibit “A” and 
incorporated herein by this reference. 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA: 

1. A Conditional Use Permit is hereby issued to Centaur Development Corporation, a 
Nebraska corporation to approve the construction of an accessory building on certain 
real property legally described as:

Lot 1, L & J Subdivision, s subdivision in Douglas County, Nebraska
(the “Property”)

subject to the terms and conditions contained in the Conditional Use Agreement 
attached hereto as Exhibit “A” and incorporated herein by this reference. 

2. Rune van den Boogaart, Zoning Administrator, is hereby authorized and directed to 
execute the Conditional Use Agreement for and on behalf of the City of Valley. 

               PASSED AND APPROVED this 14th day of January, 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, 
DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

__________________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor 



ATTEST:

__________________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk



EXHIBIT “A”

CONDITIONAL USE AGREEMENT

This Conditional Use Agreement (“Agreement”) is made and entered into this ____ day 
of January, 2025, by and between the City of Valley, Nebraska and Centaur Development 
Corporation, a Nebraska corporation.

WHEREAS, an Application for Conditional Use Permit has been filed by Centaur 
Development Corporation, a Nebraska corporation, requesting a Conditional Use Permit allowing 
Centaur Development Corporation, a Nebraska corporation to approve the construction of an 
accessory building on certain real property legally described as:

Lot 1, L & J Subdivision, s subdivision in Douglas County, Nebraska
(the “Property”)

WHEREAS, the Property is zoned Highway Commercial (C-3); and

WHEREAS, the Application for Conditional Use Permit was considered by the Valley 
Planning Commission on December 17, 2024, and the Planning Commission has recommended 
that the Conditional Use Permit should be denied; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has reviewed the Application for Conditional Use Permit 
and the recommendations of the Planning Commission, and has voted to approve the Conditional 
Use Permit.

NOW THEREFORE, the parties agree as follows:

1. A Conditional Use Permit is hereby issued to Centaur Development Corporation, a 
Nebraska corporation to approve the construction of an accessory building on certain real 
property legally described as:

Lot 1, L & J Subdivision, s subdivision in Douglas County, Nebraska
(the “Property”)

2. The undersigned applicant, in consideration of the issuance of the Conditional Use Permit 
to approve the construction of an accessory building on the Property, agrees to comply with 
the terms and conditions of such permit and agrees that if there is a material breach of any 
condition, the Governing Body of Valley, Douglas County, Nebraska, is authorized to 
revoke such permit. 



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned hereby execute this Agreement on the date 
first above written.
  

CITY OF VALLEY, 

DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

ATTEST: 

_______________________ By: ____________________________
Christie Donnermeyer Rune van den Boogaart, 
City Clerk Building/Zoning Admin.

Centaur Development Corporation, a 
Nebraska corporation

ATTEST: By: ________________________________
Printed Name: _______________________

___________________________ Title: ______________________________
Witness

Upon execution by all parties this document becomes the permit.



R E S O L U T I O N   N O.   2 0 2 5 – 0 2

WHEREAS, an Application for Conditional Use Permit has been filed by Centaur 
Development Corporation, a Nebraska corporation, requesting a Conditional Use Permit allowing 
Centaur Development Corporation to approve the construction of an accessory building on certain 
real property legally described as:

Lot 1, L & J Subdivision, s subdivision in Douglas County, Nebraska
(the “Property”)

WHEREAS, the Property is zoned Highway Commercial (C-3); and

WHEREAS, the Application for Conditional Use Permit was considered by the Valley 
Planning Commission on December 17, 2024, and the Planning Commission has recommended 
that the Conditional Use Permit should be denied; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has reviewed the Application for Conditional Use Permit 
and the recommendations of the Planning Commission and has voted to deny the Conditional Use 
Permit. 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 
OF THE CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA: 

1. A Conditional Use Permit for Centaur Development Corporation, a Nebraska 
corporation to approve the construction of an accessory building on certain real 
property legally described as:

Lot 1, L & J Subdivision, s subdivision in Douglas County, Nebraska
(the “Property”)

Is hereby denied. 

               PASSED AND APPROVED this 14th day of January, 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

_______________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor 

ATTEST:

__________________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO. 2025-1 
 
TITLE: Contracting and Procurement Transparency Ordinance 
 
PURPOSE: 
To ensure transparent, ethical, and accountable contracting and procurement practices within the City of Valley. 
 
SECTION 1: DISCLOSURE OF PERSONAL CONNECTIONS 
 
A. Any city official, including the City Administrator, must disclose in writing any personal, financial, or business 
relationship with any individual or company recommended for a city contract, hiring decision, or consulting 
service. 
B. Failure to fully disclose relationships before presenting a proposal to the City Council shall be considered a 
violation of city policy and may result in disciplinary review. 
 
SECTION 2: COMPETITIVE BIDDING REQUIREMENTS 
 
A. Any contract or service agreement exceeding $10,000 must go through a public bidding process unless waived 
by a majority vote of the City Council. 
B. The City Administrator must provide a written justification for any contract award that does not follow a 
competitive bid process. 
C. City officials may not attempt to split contracts or misrepresent costs to circumvent bidding requirements. 
 
SECTION 3: ENFORCEMENT AND PENALTIES 
 
A. Any official found violating this ordinance shall be subject to: 
 
A formal reprimand (written warning) 
 
A public censure (formal statement of disapproval) 
 
Referral for further disciplinary action by the City Council 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 2025-2 
 
TITLE: City Administrator Accountability & Performance Standards Ordinance 
 
PURPOSE: 
To establish clear expectations for the City Administrator regarding response times, 
contract oversight, and general accountability. 
 
SECTION 1: TIMELY COMPLETION OF COUNCIL REQUESTS 
 
A. The City Administrator must respond to City Council requests within 4 business days, 
unless additional time is approved. 
B. Requests requiring less than 30 minutes of research must be completed within 1 
business day. 
C. If additional time is needed, the City Administrator must submit a written explanation 
for the delay. 
 
SECTION 2: ACCOUNTABILITY IN PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTING 
 
A. Any contract award exceeding $10,000 must include a written justification from the City 
Administrator. 
B. If the City Administrator fails to follow the proper contracting process, the Council may 
reject the contract and require a competitive bid. 
 
SECTION 3: PERFORMANCE REVIEW AND DISCIPLINE 
 
A. The City Council shall conduct quarterly evaluations of the City Administrator’s 
performance. 
B. Repeated failures to meet expectations may result in: 
 
A formal reprimand 
 
A request for disciplinary action from the Mayor 
 
Public censure or further review 



ORDINANCE NO. 2025-3 
 
TITLE: Police Department Oversight Ordinance 
 
PURPOSE: 
To ensure proper oversight of the Police Department and accountability in leadership. 
 
SECTION 1: POLICE CHIEF WORK HOUR ACCOUNTABILITY 
 
A. The Police Chief must submit weekly duty logs detailing: 
 
Total hours worked per week 
 
Breakdown of administrative vs. patrol duties 
B. The City Council will review these logs monthly to assess whether the Chief is fulfilling 
the required duties. 
 
 
SECTION 2: CHIEF’S RESPONSIBILITY FOR COMMUNITY POLICING 
 
A. The Police Chief is responsible for both administrative oversight and ensuring adequate 
patrol presence in the city. 
B. The Chief may not serve exclusively in an administrative role unless approved by the City 
Council. 
C. If the Police Chief fails to meet work expectations, the City Council may: 
 
Issue a formal reprimand 
 
Recommend corrective action to the Mayor 
 
 
SECTION 3: DISCIPLINARY REVIEW PROCESS 
 
A. The City Council reserves the right to initiate a disciplinary review if the Police Chief 
violates policies or fails to fulfill job expectations. 
B. The Council may issue a formal reprimand, request corrective action, or escalate 
concerns to the Mayor. 
C. If ongoing violations occur, the Council may call for a public hearing to discuss the 
issue. 
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R E S O L U T I O N  NO.   2 0 2 5 – 0 8
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA: 

The Application for Payment No. 1 filed with the Clerk by the special engineer of the 
project, showing the amount of material furnished and work performed in the City under contract 
heretofore from Eriksen Construction for Water Treatment Plant Expansion and the 
statements of the engineer and others set out below are hereby approved and the Council finds that 
the materials therein set out have been furnished and have been received by the City and work has 
been performed and claim therefor is hereby submitted as follows:

1.   ORIGINAL CONTRACT PRICE $8,900,670.00
2.  Net change by Change Orders
3.  Current Contract Price (Line 1 + 2) $8,900,670.00
4.  TOTAL COMPLETED AND STORED TO DATE
       (Sum of Column G Lump Sum Total & Column J Unit Price Total) $86,417.50
5.  RETAINAGE:
          a.  10% x $86,417.50  Work Completed $8,641.75
          b.  10% x $______       Stored Material $0.00
          c. Total Retainage (Line 5.a + Line 5.b) $8,641.75
6.  AMOUNT ELIGIBLE TO DATE (Line 4 + Line 5.c) $77,775.75
7.  LESS PREVIOUS PAYMENTS (Line 6 from prior Application) $0.00
8.  AMOUNT DUE THIS APPLICATION $77,775.75
9.  BALANCE TO FINISH, PLUS RETAINAGE (Line 3 – Line 4) $8,814,252.50

                            PAYMENT OF:            $77,775.75

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Valley City Council consents to and 
authorizes payment to:

ERIKSEN CONSTRUCTION $77,775.75

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 11th  DAY OF FEBRUARY 2025.

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA

____________________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor

ATTEST:

_______________________________
Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk







Eagle Engineering Group

BID TABULATION
12100 West Center Road, Suite #803 Omaha, Nebraska 68144

Project Project 

No.

Owner Bid 

Date:

Address Time:

BIDDER

24-61

CITY OF VALLEY January 29, 2025

203 North Spruce Street

Valley, NE 68064
10:00 AM

Ginger Cove Bridge

Steel Girder Blasting & Repainting

COMMENT

LINDER PAINTING INC.

JEM RESTORATION

TMI COATINGS, INC

K2 REAL ESTATE 

DEVELOPMENT

FISHER BUILDING SERVICE 

INC.

ABHE & SVOBODA, INC.

MCGILL RESTORATION

YONG CONSTRUCTION

BIDDING NOTES

Engineer's Opinion of Probable Construction Costs: $200,000

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BID AMOUNT

$101,242.00

$149,800.00

$394,000.00

NO BID



 EAGLE ENGINEERING GROUP 
 12100 West Center Road, Suite 803 Omaha, Nebraska 68144 
 (402) 399-0227 | www.eagleengineeringgroup.com 

January 31, 2025 

To: Mayor and City Council 
 Cameron Gales, City Administrator 
 Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk  
 File 

From: Gregory Perry, PE, City Engineer 

Re: Ginger Cove Bridge Steel Girder Blasting & Repainting 
 Valley, Nebraska  
 EEG #24-61 

The City held the bid opening on Wednesday, January 29, 2025 at our office for the above referenced project.  The 
project includes the repainting of the structural steel under the Ginger Cove bridge near 41 Ginger Cove Road.  This 
project will remove the existing paint and apply a new paint coating to protect the steel for the next 15-20 years.  

A total of three bids were received with the apparent low bidder for the project being JEM Restoration in the amount of 
$101,242.00. Our engineer’s Opinion of Probable Construction Cost (OPC) at the time of bidding was $200,000. A 
copy of the Bid Tabulation is attached.  

Our evaluation of the experience, reputation, and financial conditions of JEM Restoration, Inc. indicates that they are 
capable of completing the work required; therefore, this office recommends to the City Council that they award the 
construction contract to JEM Restoration. for the project in their bid amount of $101,242.00.  

The project is funded by the City’s local street revenues and is a budgeted item in the FY25 budget. 

We will be at the February 11th council meeting to answer any questions you may have regarding the bids received 
and our recommendation.  

Attachment:  Bid Tabulation 

http://www.eagleengineeringgroup.com/


Eagle Engineering Group

BID TABULATION
12100 West Center Road, Suite #803 Omaha, Nebraska 68144

Project Project 

No.

Owner Bid 

Date:

Address Time:

$1,137,397.55

Non-Responsive BidConstructers, Inc.

Luxa Construction

$1,935,277.60

Valley Corporation $2,030,693.93

TAB Construction $2,084,837.02*

Engineer's Opinion of Probable Construction Cost for Contract No. 2: $1,245,000

Thompson Construction

BIDDING NOTES

Engineer's Opinion of Probable Construction Cost for Contract No. 1: $1,673,000

$1,998,057.30

Bauer Infrastructure

COMMENT

Vrba Construction

United Utilities & Excavation

HD Utilities and Grading

Bauer Infrastructure

Cedar Construction

Judds Brothers Construction

Graham Construction

BIDDER

24-44 & 24-45

CITY OF VALLEY February 6, 2025

203 North Spruce Street

Valley, NE 68064
10:00 AM

Valley Landing - Sewer, Water Main, Storm

& Paving Improvements

CONTRACT NO. 1 CONTRACT NO. 2

$969,229.65

$1,302,425.87

$1,074,057.66*

$1,179,775.52

$1,281,865.00

$1,383,015.80

$1,401,090.05

Steve Harris Construction $992,364.21*

Valley Corporation $1,020,646.86

Vrana Construction $1,116,117.40

NLC $1,071,718.05

Graham Construction $1,055,742.00

TAB Construction $1,056,683.60



 EAGLE ENGINEERING GROUP 
 12100 West Center Road, Suite 803 Omaha, Nebraska 68144 
 (402) 399-0227 | www.eagleengineeringgroup.com 

February 6, 2025 

To: Mayor and City Council 
 Cameron Gales, City Administrator 
 Christie Donnermeyer, City Clerk  
 File 

From: Gregory Perry, PE, City Engineer 

Re: Valley Landing Sanitary Sewer, Water Main, Storm Sewer, and Street Paving Improvements 
 Valley, Nebraska  
 EEG #24-44 | 24-45 

The City held the bid opening on Thursday, February 6, 2025 at our office for the above referenced project.  The project 
includes installation of gravity sanitary sewer, water distribution mains and storm sewer under Contract No. 1 and 
construction of street paving and trail sidewalk under Contract No. 2 within the proposed development.  

A total of ten bids were received for Contract No. 1 – Utilities with the apparent low bidder for the project being United 
Utilities & Excavation in the amount of $ 1,074,057.66. Our engineer’s Opinion of Probable Construction Cost (OPC) 
at the time of bidding was $1,673,000. A copy of the Bid Tabulation is attached.  

Our evaluation of the experience, reputation, and financial conditions of United Utilities & Excavation. indicates that 
they are capable of completing the work required; therefore, this office recommends to the City Council that they award 
the construction contract to United Utilities & Excavation. for the project in their bid amount of $ 1,074,057.66.  

A total of eight bids were received for Contract No. 2 – Street Paving with the apparent low bidder for the project being 
Luxa Construction in the amount of $ $969,229.65. Our engineer’s Opinion of Probable Construction Cost (OPC) at 
the time of bidding was $1,245,000. A copy of the Bid Tabulation is attached.  

Our evaluation of the experience, reputation, and financial conditions of Luxa Construction indicates that they are 
capable of completing the work required; therefore, this office recommends to the City Council that they award the 
construction contract to Luxa Construction for the project in their bid amount of $ 969,229.65.  

The project is funded by the City’s agreement with the Developer Irrevocable Letter of Credit for the improvements. 

We will be at the February 11th council meeting to answer any questions you may have regarding the bids received 
and our recommendation.  

Attachment:  Bid Tabulation 

http://www.eagleengineeringgroup.com/
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