
The City Council reserves the right to enter into an executive session at any time during the meeting, in accordance with the 
Nebraska Open Meetings Act, even though the closed session may not be indicated on the agenda. 

It is the intention of the City Council to take up the items on the agenda in sequential order.  However, the City Council reserves 
the right to take up matters in a different order to accommodate the schedules of the City Council members, persons having 
items on the agenda, and the public.  

AGENDA
VALLEY CITY COUNCIL

Tuesday, September 12, 2023
City Hall

203 North Spruce
Valley, NE 68064

7:00 PM

1. Roll Call

2. Meeting Called to Order 

3. Pledge of Allegiance 

4. Proof of Publication 

5. Visitors/Correspondence

At this time, any individual may speak on any issues not on the agenda or on any 
agenda items that do not include public hearings. Comments are limited to three 
minutes for each individual.  Visitors may state their comments and should not expect 
the Council to engage in back-and-forth dialogue regarding the comments. Unless an 
agenda item includes a public hearing, no visitors may speak during the business 
portion of the meeting.

6. Approval of Agenda 

7. Consent Agenda

All agenda items on the consent agenda and will be acted on in a single 
motion.  Consent agenda items are being forwarded to the Council Members.  Any 
individual item may be removed by a council member for special discussion and 
consideration.

7.A.Accept Minutes 
  August 8, 2023, Meeting
  August 15, 2023, Budget Workshop
  August 22, 2023, Budget Workshop
  August 29, 2023, Budget Workshop
 

7.B.Accept Treasurer's Report 

7.C. Approve invoices and additional invoices presented for payment
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7.D.August Payroll - $96,472.08
                August IRA - $6,195.13

7.E. August KENO Receipts - $7,243.05   

7.F. Accept PeopleService Inc., Report 

7.G.Accept August Cemetery Board Minutes

7.H.Accept August Library Statistics

7.I. Accept August Board of Adjustment Minutes

8. Everett D. Lerew - 1105 S. East Street 

• Memorial to two-year old child in park.

• Water issues and budget.

9. Eagle Scout project 

• Approval of Eagle Scout project to benefit the cemetery.

10. Council Consideration/Action  - to increase the total restricted funds authority by an 
additional 1%. 

11. Ordinance No. 796  - Adopt Budget Statement/Annual Appropriation Bill. 

12. Resolution No. 2023-45 - Setting Tax Request

13. Resolution No. 2023-46 - Still Water Lake reimbursement. 

14. Resolution No. 2023-47 - LB77 regarding concealed handguns in vehicles owned by 
the City.  

15. Resolution No. 2023-48 - LB77 regarding concealed handguns on City owned 
property. 

16. Discussion  - Capital Facilities fees

17. Discussion - Park Board advisory committee 

18. PeopleService - general update

19. Olmsted & Perry - Water Improvement Projects
 

19.A. Water Engineer's Report

19.B. Council Consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 in the amount 
of $606.84 deduction for piping changes, backwash waste recovery project. 
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19.C. Resolution No. 2023-49 - Council consideration and action to approve 
Application for Payment No. 2 from Neuvirth Construction Inc. in the amount of 
$71,470.76, backwash waste recovery project. 

19.D. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 in the amount 
of $17,842.50 deduction for unit price work changes, well project. 

19.E. Resolution No. 2023-50 Council consideration and action to approve Application 
for Payment No. 4 to Layne Christensen Company in the amount of $5,017.50, well 
project. 

19.F. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 2 for 
miscellaneous charges in the amount of $1,827.16 increase, chemical feed project. 

19.G. Resolution No. 2023-51 Council consideration and action to approve Application 
for Payment No. 2 from Neuvirth Construction, Inc. in the amount of $130,406.01, 
chemical feed project. 

19.H. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 2 in the amount 
of $17,096.30 increase for miscellaneous charges for work directive order for 
welding repairs in control column on time and material basis, filter media project. 

19.I. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 adjusting the 
start and completion times for the work on water tower repainting project. 

20. City Engineer 

20.A. The Pines subdivision concrete street repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. 
Waring Street concrete repair.

20.A.1. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 2 for an 
increase in the amount of $3,717.25. 

20.A.2. Resolution No. 2023-52 Council consideration and action to approve 
Application for Payment No. 2 from Spencer Management in the amount of 
$105,105.25.

20.B. 288th Street and State Street pavement resurfacing

20.B.1. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 for a 
decrease in the amount of $8,111.25. 

20.B.2. Resolution No. 2023-53 Council consideration and action to approve 
Application for Payment No. 1 from Omni Engineering in the amount of 
$277,177.25. 

20.C. Still Water Phase 2 - Water Main, Sanitary Sewer, and Street Paving 
improvements. 
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20.C.1. Review of Bids received September 7, 2023.

20.C.2. Council action to consider award of contract. 

20.D. Other/Miscellaneous 

• Ginger Cove Lift Station No. 3 upgrades.

• Val-haven (Southwest No. 2) and Ginger Woods No. 2 Lift Station 
improvements.

• Ginger Cove, Fern Lake, and Spruce Street asphalt pavement preservation - 
September 11, 2023.

• EAA development.

• Valle View development.

• Valley Landing development. 

21. City Attorney

22. Mayor's Report 

23. Upcoming Items

• Planning Commission: September 19, 2023 at 4:30 p.m. 

• City Council Special Meeting - September 26, 2023 at 7:00 p.m. 



























Due Date Vendor Description Amount
9/15/2023 TOOLE, ALEXANDER Water service deposit - 121 W Whittingham 82.37 
9/13/2023 Amazon Business picture frames 11.91 
9/13/2023 Amazon Business RECEIPT PRINTER WITH CASH DRAWER 250.98 
9/13/2023 Amazon Business 6-PACK LABEL MAKER TAPE REPLACEMENT  FOR BROTHER,  LAMINATED WHITE LABEL MAKER TAPE 37.99 
9/13/2023 Amazon Business GARBAGE CAN LINER, 33 GALLON TRASH BAGS 58.48 
9/13/2023 Amazon Business CARBOARD BOXES,  STORAGE BOXES, BULK BOXES 65.90 
9/13/2023 Amazon Business VOLCORA CASH REGISTER DRAWER FOR POINT SALE 190.93 
9/13/2023 AFLAC INSURANCE 712.38 
9/13/2023 ACCUFUND BUDGET MANAGEMENT, UTILITY BILLING, CREDIT ADJUSTMENT 1,660.26 
9/13/2023 ACCUFUND PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 1,375.00 
9/13/2023 ASTRO BUILDING 9508 N 294TH ST DEPOSIT REFUND 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 Ace Outdoor Parts COMMERCIAL TAP HEAD 152.52 
9/13/2023 Ace Outdoor Parts COMMERCIAL TAP HEAD 44.99 
9/13/2023 Ace Outdoor Parts STRAIGHT SHAFTSTRING TRIMMER 414.98 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE TRAIL FENCE CLEANUP 824.99 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE LAWN WEEDER V NOTCH 19.99 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE WET/DRY VAC 79.99 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE EAGLE SCOUT PROJECT 38.95 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE FASTENERS 3.87 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE NOZZLE TWIST 4' BRASS 19.98 
9/13/2023 VALLEY ACE HARDWARE SUPER GLUE LIQUID 4.59 
9/13/2023 MUTUAL OF OMAHA PAYMENT PROCESSING CENTER GROUP INSURANCE 3,226.62 
9/13/2023 BARNES, GENE 28272 W REICHMUTH RD   PERMIT DEPOSIT REFUND 500.00 
9/13/2023 Black Hills Energy 529.37 
9/13/2023 Bomgaars SAFETY GLASSES 71.88 
9/13/2023 CINTAS CORP TOILET PAPER, MATS, WET MOP, SOAP 215.89 
9/13/2023 COMMUNITY FIRST NATIONAL BANK / CINDY TURNER LEASE AGREEMENT2024 INTERNATIONAL 85,053.87 

9/13/2023 CHARLES THOMAS HOMES permit deposit refund   28542 jessie circle 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 CINTAS CORP wet mop, sig air, toilet paper, black mat,soap, white paper 222.00 
9/13/2023 Ciaccio Roofing NEW ROOF 51,832.00 
9/13/2023 Core & Main 2,265.38 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY ARMORALL,  MICROFIBER TOWELS 28.97 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY HDFLEET 10W30 75.96 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY MOTOR TUNE-UP 160 33.96 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY CORE DEPOSIT,   3MO WTY BAT, PREM AW 32 HYD FL 5G 256.97 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY SPIN-ON FLUID FILTER 12.99 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY FILTERS 579.39 
9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY HOSE CLAMP 112.35 

City of Valley
Bills



9/13/2023 CAPPEL AUTO SUPPLY HOSE CLAMP 202.23 
9/13/2023 Jeffrey Bowdino Inc PERMIT DEPOSIT REFUND     6717 FERN LAKE CIR 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 DICKS VALLEY MARKET CAMPER PADS 3.09 
9/13/2023 DICKS VALLEY MARKET EGGS 2.19 
9/13/2023 Datashield Corporation SHRED VAULT 45.00 
9/13/2023 DU-RITE ELECTRIC TROUBLE SHOOT & LOCATE TRIPPED BREAKER 150.00 
9/13/2023 Eakes Office Solutions CONTRACT BILLING CHARGE 571.56 
9/13/2023 Eakes Office Solutions LIBRARY  CONTRACT BILLING CHARGE 257.76 
9/13/2023 Eakes Office Solutions PAPER, USB DRIVES, 159.06 
9/13/2023 Eakes Office Solutions PAPER 47.10 
9/13/2023 Eakes Office Solutions CRTDG, 52.89 
9/13/2023 ELECTRIC PUMP MEIGS ST RAIN WATER 998.68 
9/13/2023 CINTAS CORP LIBRARY 96.82 
9/13/2023 Eagle Engineering Group LLC 288TH ST & STATE ASPHALT RESURFACING 22,929.88 
9/13/2023 Eagle Engineering Group LLC WARING ST & LAKEWOOD CONCRETE 3,475.88 
9/13/2023 Eagle Engineering Group LLC PINES SUBDIVISION CONCRETE 4,736.82 
9/13/2023 Eagle Engineering Group LLC GENERAL ENGINEERING 530.96 
9/13/2023 Eagle Engineering Group LLC GENERAL SEWER, STREETS,BUILDING ZONING,STAFF MEETING,PLANNING COMMISSION, 3,296.04 
9/13/2023 Evoqua Water Technologies LLC BIOXIDE-AQ 17,556.00 
9/13/2023 Five Nines Technology Group INC 2,833.50 
9/13/2023 FIRST NEBRASKA BANK CREDIT CARD 4,275.02 
9/13/2023 Farnham & Griffin, P.C., L.L.O. 6,580.00 
9/13/2023 Five Nines Technology Group INC service agreement 3,825.91 
9/13/2023 Fremont  Department of Utilities monthly sewer 40,625.73 
9/13/2023 Fleet Charge international 7600 3,436.50 
9/13/2023 First State Bank Nebraska #110  nursing home bond payment 5,962.50 
9/13/2023 First Nebraska Bank (Brainard) nursing home bond #110 5,962.50 
9/13/2023 Petty Cash 61.51 
9/13/2023 G LEE HOMES PERMIT REFUND   29207 MARTIN CIR 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 G LEE HOMES PERMIT REFUND   5404 N 290TH CIR 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 Golden Construction LLC PERMIT REFUND    7908 N 281ST AVE 500.00 
9/13/2023 GREAT PLAINS COMMUNICATIONS 229.67 
9/13/2023 GREAT PLAINS COMMUNICATIONS 679.47 
9/13/2023 Host Coffee Service 197.15 
9/13/2023 HGM  ASSOCIATES, INC. ENGINEERING SERVICES FOR CITY OF VALLEY OVERLAY DISTRICT COMMERCIAL DESIGN 1,346.46 
9/13/2023 Helena Agri-Ent LLC 198.40 
9/13/2023 JD'S CAR WASH & DETAILING LLC POLICE CAR WASH 159.80 
9/13/2023 JEO CONSULTING VALLEY PARK MASTER PLAN 750.00 
9/13/2023 JEO CONSULTING VALLEY MUNICIPAL BUILDING STUDY 1,740.00 
9/13/2023 Jones Automotive #53 SERVICE CALL GUNLOCK TIMER 444.85 
9/13/2023 IOWA PUMP WORKS FOR BLUEWATER LAKE     CORD    ABS SEAL LEAK/OVER TEMP RELAY     DIN RAIL MOUNTED    MACHINE WORK 14,678.25 
9/13/2023 KRIZ-MAW REPLACE STARTER   REPLACE BREAKERS  (WASTEWATER)   GINGERWOODS #2 & #3 694.90 
9/13/2023 KRIZ-MAW REPLACE STARTER  LS#5 BLUEWATER 611.40 



9/13/2023 LAYNE CHRISTENSEN COMPANY NEW WELL 22-1 PROJECT 5,017.50 
9/13/2023 LOVE'S TRAVEL STOPS & COUNTRY STORE 521.66 
9/13/2023 LOVE'S TRAVEL STOPS & COUNTRY STORE 3,616.45 
9/13/2023 Lien Termite & Pest Control PEST CONTROL 92.00 
9/13/2023 LARM 25.96 
9/13/2023 LIM CONSTRUCTION DBA EVOLVED STRUCTURES WATER DEPOSIT REFUND    28569 JESSIE CIR 150.00 
9/13/2023 MAXIM ENTERPRISES LLC PERMIT REFUND    5707 N 294TH CIR 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 Municipal Code Services CODE UPDATE   PARKING VIOLATION 100.00 
9/13/2023 Michael Matzen CLEANING 823.90 
9/13/2023 MENARDS - ELKHORN CONCRETE MIX 112.20 
9/13/2023 MENARDS - ELKHORN 6' STDDED T-POST 495.94 
9/13/2023 MENARDS - ELKHORN WEDGE ANCHORS 15.25 
9/13/2023 MILLARD SPRINKLER INC 235 E CONDRON 5,346.59 
9/13/2023 MILLARD SPRINKLER INC 235 CONDRON 1,312.20 
9/13/2023 Midwest Tape LLC DVD 26.24 
9/13/2023 Midwest Tape LLC DVD 26.24 
9/13/2023 Midwest Tape LLC DVD 35.24 
9/13/2023 Midwest Tape LLC DVD 38.98 
9/13/2023 Midwest Tape LLC DVD 53.23 
9/13/2023 JOHN MOWREY MOWING SEASON 2023  GINGER WOODS  FERN LAKE 3,654.00 
9/13/2023 NEUVIRTH CONSTRUCTION INC. BACKWASH RECOVERY PROJECT 71,470.76 
9/13/2023 NEUVIRTH CONSTRUCTION INC. CHEMICAL FEED PROJECT 130,406.01 
9/13/2023 NEBRASKA MUNICIPAL CLERKS ASSOCIATION MEMBERSHIP DUES  CHRIS DONNERMEYER 100.00 
9/13/2023 NCD, NCD PERMIT REFUND    29204 MARTIN CIR 750.00 
9/13/2023 Olmsted & Perry Consulting Engineers Inc. WATER TOWER REPAIR & REPAINTING 2,505.97 
9/13/2023 Olmsted & Perry Consulting Engineers Inc. 2022 WELL IMPROVEMENTS 851.74 
9/13/2023 Olmsted & Perry Consulting Engineers Inc. CHEMICAL FEED EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT 14,334.82 
9/13/2023 Olmsted & Perry Consulting Engineers Inc. FILTER MEDIA REPLACEMENT 3,763.92 
9/13/2023 Olmsted & Perry Consulting Engineers Inc. BACKWASH WASTE RECOVERY SYSTEM 7,516.00 
9/13/2023 Olmsted & Perry Consulting Engineers Inc. WATER FUNDING ADMIN SERVICES 760.00 
9/13/2023 OPPD 17,357.38 
9/13/2023 POWERTECH PORTABLE UNIT LOCATED IN GARAGE 675.00 
9/13/2023 PEOPLESERVICE INC WATER/WASTEWATER 32,197.00 
9/13/2023 Rasmussen Welding ROLL OFF DUMPSTER 4,700.00 
9/13/2023 Stewart, Samantha THREE RIVERS MEETING 110.04 
9/13/2023 L & L CUSTOM BUILDERS INC PERMIT REFUND   6115 GINGER WOODS 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 SANCHEZ, EFRAIN PERMIT REFUND    28557 JESSIE CIR 1,000.00 
9/13/2023 SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY WEED BARRIER FOR NEW WELL 161.24 
9/13/2023 SCHINDLER, STACY PERMIT REFUND     8302 N 281ST AVE 500.00 
9/13/2023 TWO RIVERS SAND & GRAVEL ROAD GRAVEL 1,116.66 
9/13/2023 VRBA Construction LABOR 2,465.00 
9/13/2023 VRBA Construction MINI EXCAVATOR    SKID STEER 7,007.50 
9/13/2023 VRBA Construction SKID LOADER   JD 50 EX    MATERIAL & LABOR 6,140.00 



9/13/2023 Window Pro 20.00 
9/13/2023 Window Pro 20.00 
9/13/2023 TWIN RIVERS YMCA POOL MANAGEMENT FEE  FOR AUGUST 11,827.90 
9/13/2023 YMCA OF GREATER OMAHA MEMEBER  SHIP 20.00 
9/13/2023 WIESE PLUMBING & EXCAVATING INC REPLACE CURB STOP    308 W WARING   805 VALLEYVIEW 3,983.00 
9/13/2023 Waste Connections of Nebraska Inc 265.84 
9/13/2023 WEST-E-CON 30HP VFD  1 SPARE & 1 FOR THE NEW WELL 17,762.32 
9/13/2023 ES OPCO USA LLC (VESERIS) mosquito Control/chemicals 1,338.40 
9/13/2023 ES OPCO USA LLC (VESERIS) FLUSHING SOLUTIONS 71.50 
9/13/2023 COX BUSINESS 519.69 
9/13/2023 OMNI ENGINEERING 288TH ST & STATE ST 276,067.25 
9/13/2023 SPENCER MANAGEMENT LLC PINES SUBDIVISION CONCRETE   & S LAKEWOOD & W WARING ST 105,105.25 
9/12/2023 HEMPHILL-WILSON, MISTY Water service deposit - 05/12/2022   624 s pine 148.31 

9/9/2023 ART OF A CRAFTSMAN Water service deposit - 28443 Laurel Cir
6/282022

62.12 

9/9/2023 CHARLES THOMAS HOMES Water service deposit - 28545 Jessie Cir
9/12/2022

87.47 

9/2/2023 JANECEK, MOLLY Credit refund 78.39 
9/2/2023 JANECEK, MOLLY Credit refund 7.10 
3/1/2023 Grove, Cynthia L Reimbursement for Admin Office 100.00 

1,053,811.29 







 

 

 

Date:   September 7, 2023 

To:   City of Valley 

From:   Mike Adair, Nebraska Region Manager   

O & M Report: August 2023 

 

Water Operation & Maintenance 

➢ As you may know, Jeremy Beam injured his knee when working on the filters. He 
has had surgery and is healing nicely. He is expected to be back soon.  
 

➢ PeopleService performed 378 locates for the month. 
 

➢ We had a water main leak in Ginger Cove by the fire hydrant between 63 and 64. 
The leak was repaired. 
 

➢ On August 30, 2023 we received a report of a possible water main break on 
West Meigs Street. We responded to the call and discovered a 4-inch water main 
had broken, leaking in the middle of the street. The repair was completed, and 
the street was closed during the repair. This water main showed signs of possible 
water being the cause of the break. The Fire Department was in the area that 
evening having training using a fire hydrant. I have reached out to the fire chief to 
discuss notice when a fire hydrant is used.  
 

➢ This month a lot of work was done at the water plant.  Jetco came and set the 
new actuators in the water filter inlet valves. They also replaced the pressure 
transducer coming off the high service pumps.  West-E-Con worked with Jetco 
on the actuators.  West-E-Con ran more wiring to the chemical pumps and the 
new well is wired and a start-up needs to be done for the new well. Wesie 
Plumbing plumbed water to the chemical tanks.  They also ran the plumbing to 
the chlorine analyzers. NewVert is running all the pipes from the recirculation 
tank to the build.  That is still in process. PeopleService piped the chlorine tanks 
together and ran all the chemical lines from the tanks to the new pumps when we 
noticed the pumps for the potassium permanganate were way too small. We 
have talked with Jim Olmstead and bigger pumps are being ordered. We are still 
waiting on a new SCADA computer from Jetco which has the updated SCADA 
program for the water plant.  
 

➢ When installing the actuators, it was discovered the valves also needed replaced. 
They have been ordered.   The estimated delivery is about 8 weeks away. 



 

 

 
➢ Because of the high-water usage this month we had to postpone the water tower 

project. We have rescheduled it for October 1, 2023, if the usage drops.  
 

➢ We handed out shutoff notices on the 25th and then shut off 3 people on the 28th.  
We also read meters on the 28th.  
 

➢ The meter replacement project is still ongoing.  
 
 
 
Wastewater Operation & Maintenance 
 

➢ We got a high-level alarm from Valmont lift station. We went out to investigate 
and found the dry pit that holds the pumps had sewage in the pit. We called 
Trekk to pump it down.  Once the level was down, we went into the dry pit and 
found the sump pump had burned up and were leaking between a flange.  
PeopleService tightened the bolts and got the leak to stop.  West-E-Con has 
been working to try and get us some new motors because these motors we have 
are not submersible pumps.  If we cannot find motors we will try to have our 
motors baked - this will be a drying process that is done.  

 



 

 

August-23 July-23 August-22

Water Units

Total Monthly Pumped Valley gallons 39,149,000 36,099,000 44,595,000

Daily Average Pumped Valley gallons 1,196,000 1,105,000 1,438,548

Average Fluoride Residual mg/L 0.00 0.00 1.03

Fluoride used lbs 235.90 87.20 482.40

Average Chlorine Residual mg/L 0.40 0.40 0.40

Chlorine used lbs 241.00 101.10 314.80

Potassium Permanganate lbs 1,603.00 1,357.00 1,069.00

Wastewater

Effluent Flow

Total Flow Meigs Street gallons 8,799,000 7,963,000 8,229,000

Avg Daily Flow Meigs Street gallons 314,000 256,000 265,451

Total Flow Byarsville gallons 11,282,000 10,433,000 10,695,000

Avg Daily Flow Byarsville gallons 402,000 336,500 345,000

Total Flow Valmont gallons 624,960 252,000 428,780

Avg Daily Flow Valmont gallons 20,160 8,130 13,831

Lift Station Data

Gardiner St Rainwater Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 0.00

Valhaven (#1) Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 0.00

Valhaven (#2) Total Runtime hours 0.53 16.10 6.30

Country Aire (#1) Total Runtime hours 33.90 24.40 32.00

Legacy Valley Total Runtime hours 73.20 57.20 31.20

Legacy Valley Avg Daily Runtime hours 2.36 1.84 1.00

Valley Shores (1) Pump 1 Total Run hours 0.69 17.00 27.10

Valley Shores (1) Pump 2 Total Run hours 0.64 14.70 24.00

Valley Shores (2) Pump 1 Total Run hours 1.58 40.00 113.80

Valley Shores (2) Pump 2 Total Run hours 0.00 0.00 119.20

Valley Shores (3) Pump 1 Total Run hours 0.28 7.60 6.30

Valley Shores (3) Pump 2 Total Run hours 0.35 9.20 6.10

Regional Pump #1 Total Runtime hours 669.10 674.60 0.00

Regional Pump #2 Total Runtime hours 669.20 674.50 0.00

Mallard (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 13.50 10.10 12.90

Mallard (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 13.60 10.90 12.30

Mallard (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 4.60

Mallard (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 10.00 9.00 4.20

Mallard (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.04 28.20 22.30

Mallard (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 23.67 40.80 20.50

Mallard (4) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 1.07 30.20 16.00

Mallard (4) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 1.27 32.80 51.80

Bluewater (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 13.70 15.50 10.90

Bluewater (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 18.00 17.90 16.10

Bluewater (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 125.50 129.20 68.30

Bluewater (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 52.30 48.50 33.30

Bluewater (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 37.90 70.00 22.80

Bluewater (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 39.90 24.00 13.00

Bluewater (4) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.70 88.20 17.10

Bluewater (4) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 30.90 20.40 10.30

Bluewater (5) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 224.80 54.30 0.00

Bluewater (5) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 98.90 215.90 45.40

Bluewater (6) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 12.70 17.10 9.10

Bluewater (6) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 236.90 340.00 133.00

Bluewater (7) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 8.80 9.70 6.50

Bluewater (7) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 7.80 9.70 6.70

Ginger Cove (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 24.80 Comm Fail 37.41

Ginger Cove (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 26.20 Comm Fail 32.61

Ginger Cove (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 Comm Fail 27.90

Ginger Cove (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 21.00 Comm Fail 68.10

Ginger Cove (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 Comm Fail 51.40

Ginger Cove (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.00 Comm Fail 29.80

Ginger Woods (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 5.20 Comm Fail 2.50

Ginger Woods (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 3.70 Comm Fail 2.50

Ginger Woods (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 15.20 Comm Fail 11.19

Ginger Woods (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.00 Comm Fail 11.19

Ginger Woods (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 Comm Fail 48.00

Ginger Woods (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 93.00 Comm Fail 48.00

Flat Water LS (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.13 3.20 48.00

Flat Water LS (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.13 2.90 48.00

Flat Water LS (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.17 7.60 48.00

Flat Water LS (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.19 1.30 48.00

Flat Water LS (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.32 5.70 48.00

Flat Water LS (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.32 6.10 48.00

West Street LS (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.40 0.00 48.00

West Street LS (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.50 0.00 48.00

Rainwater Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 0.00

Rainwater Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 0.00   
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Contract True-Ups - Current Contract Year 

Item Budgeted Amount Amount Spent % of Budget % of Time 

Maintenance Budget $29,736.00 $17,808.00 60% 92% 

Total $29,736.00 $17,808.00 60% 100% 

 
AUGUST WORK ORDERS COMPLETED 

Date 
completed Equipment Location Task 

8/16/2023 BYERSVILLE LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/16/2023 COUNTRY AIRE LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/16/2023 COUNTRY AIRE LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/17/2023 DAIRY QUEEN LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/15/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/15/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/15/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/15/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 4 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/17/2023 MEIGS LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/17/2023 REGIOINAL LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/17/2023 VALHAVEN LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/14/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/14/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/14/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/14/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 4 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/11/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 5 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/11/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 6 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/11/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 7 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/11/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/11/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #1 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/7/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/7/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #2 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/7/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/7/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #3 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/4/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/4/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #1 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/4/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/4/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #2 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/4/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/4/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #3 5029 Valley, NE LS Annual PM 

8/25/2023 INFLUENT GRINDER/BYERSVILLE LS 5029 Valley, NE Inspection 

8/25/2023 INFLUENT GRINDER/ MEIGS ST LS 5029 Valley, NE Inspection 

    



 

 

8/25/2023 MEIGS ST & BYERSVILLE LS PUMPS 5029 Valley, NE Service Equipment 

8/3/2023 LIFT STATION #1-VALLEY,NE SYST 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/3/2023 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/3/2023 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/3/2023 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/3/2023 VALMONT LIFT STATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

8/2/2023 AIR COMPRESSOR 6029 Valley, NE Inspection 

8/2/2023 PORTABLE GAS MONITOR 6029 Valley, NE Calibrate Equipment 

8/2/2023 FIRE EXTINGUISHERS 6029 Valley, NE Inspection 

 







DAILY RECORDS  August 2023 
     This month  Last month  Last year 
LIBRARY VISITS:  
   Adults  681  360   349 
   Children 651  779   579 
  
Computers  Adults  44  26   44 
   Children 39  63   19 
 
Fax/Copies    49  45   24 
  
Reference transactions (indicate nature of question) 
Locating Library Materials 69, Readers’ Advisory 15, Account info and renewals 37, 
Technology Assistance 48, Local Info 19, General Info 170.  

Total 358  627   232 
PROGRAM ATTENDANCE:  
   Adults  233  68   32 
8/5 Knitting – 8; 8/10 Quasar Drive-In – 198; 8/12 – 6; 8/19 Knitting – 6;  
8/22 Community Gardening – 3; 8/26 Knitting – 5; 8/28 Book Club – 7;  
   Teens  26  10   0  
8/2 D&D – 5; 8/9 D&D – 4; 8/16 D&D – 6; 8/23 D&D – 7; 8/30 D&D – 4;  

Children 321  571   405 
8/1 YMCA Visit – 25; 8/3 YMCA Visit – 16; 8/8 YMCA Visit – 20; 8/10 YMCA Visit – 16; 
8/11 Elizabeth’s Farewell – 20; 8/14 DC West Open House – 213; 8/18 LEGO Club – 7; 
8/25 – LEGO Club – 4;  
   Pre-K  0  17   0 
 

Total   580  666   437 
  
New patrons (indicate Valley, other Douglas Co., non-DC) 
Valley 16, other DC 2, Non DC 0 
Total     18  13   11 
 
Volunteers/hours   1/15  3/40   0/0 
 
MATERIALS CHECKED OUT: 
 
Adult      935  1212   920 
 
Children    1528  2619   1156 
      
Overdrive    329  278   251  









1

Christie Donnermeyer

From: Valley City Office
Sent: Saturday, August 26, 2023 7:35 PM
To: Cindy Grove; Cheryl Eckerman; Tyler Cooper; Christie Donnermeyer
Subject: Council Agenda Request 

Name:  
Phone:  
Email Address:  
Address: .  
Agenda Item Description: I am a member of BSA troop 1885 based out of Omaha. I live here in Valley and I am working 
on my Eagle Scout project. I have already spoken to the cemetery board and they have approved my request to do my 
project of cleaning and servicing stones at the valley cemetery. I will purchase all materials that I will need to complete 
my project, or ask for donations. My project will be completed by fellow scouts, friends, family and volunteers.  
Requested Action: I would like to have the city approve my Eagle Scout project to benefit the cemetery.  
Does this require an expenditure of funds: No 
 
View in List 



O R D I N A N C E     N O.   7 9 6   
 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO ADOPT THE BUDGET STATEMENT TO BE TERMED THE ANNUAL 
APPROPRIATION BILL; TO APPROPRIATE SUMS FOR NECESSARY EXPENSES AND 
LIABILITIES; TO PROVIDE FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF VALLEY, 
DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA: 
 
 Section 1.  That after complying with all procedures required by law, the budget presented 

and set forth in the budget statement is hereby approved as the Annual Appropriation Bill for the 

fiscal year beginning October 1, 2023, through September 30, 2024.  All sums of money contained 

in the budget statement are hereby appropriated for the necessary expenses and liabilities of the 

City of Valley, Nebraska.  A copy of the budget document shall be forwarded as provided by law 

to the Auditor of Public Accounts, State Capitol, Lincoln, Nebraska, and to the County Clerk of 

Douglas County, Nebraska, for use by the levying authority. 

 Section 2.  This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force from and after its passage, 

approval, and publication or posting as required by law. 

 PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 12th DAY OF SEPTEMBER 2023. 

     CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA 
       
 
     ___________________________________ 
     Mayor, Cindy Grove 
 
ATTEST: 
 
_______________________________  
Clerk, Cheryl K. Eckerman 
 



R E S O L U T I O N     N O.     2 0 2 3  – 4 5 
 

 WHEREAS, Nebraska Revised Statutes 77-1632 and 77-1633 provide that the Governing 
Body of the City of Valley passes by a majority vote a resolution or ordinance setting the tax 
request; and 
 

WHEREAS, a special public hearing was held as required by law to hear and consider 
comments concerning the property tax request; and 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, the Governing Body of the City of Valley, resolves that: 
 

1. The 2023-2024 property tax request be set as follows: 
 

        Fund      Request       Levy 
 

General Fund   $1,773,167  $ .254600 
Bond Fund        386,169      .055448 

 
2. The total assessed value of property differs from last year’s total assessed value by 
 27.76%. 
 
3. The tax rate which would levy the same amount of property taxes as last year, when 
 multiplied by the new total assessed value of property, would be $ .253845 per 
 $100 of assessed value. 
 
4. The Governing Body of the City of Valley proposed to adopt a property tax request 
 that will cause its tax rate to be $ .310048 per $100 of assessed value. 
 
5. Based on the proposed property tax request and changes in other revenue, the total 
 operating budget of the City of Valley will exceed last year’s total operating 
 budget by 35.28%. 
 
6. A copy of this resolution shall be certified and forwarded to the Douglas County 

Clerk on or before October 15, 2023. 
 

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 12th DAY OF SEPTEMBER 2023. 
 

     CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA 
 

_________________________________ 
     Mayor Cindy Grove 
 
      _________________________________ 
     Council President John Batcher                                                  
 
 



_________________________________ 
     Council Member Bryon Ueckert 
 

_________________________________ 
     Council Member Linda Lewis 
 

_________________________________ 
     Council Member Chris TenEyck 
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________ 
Cheryl K. Eckerman, Clerk 
 







































































Change Order No. 2

Owner's Project No.:

Engineer's Project No.:

Contractor's Project No.:

Attachments:  [List documents supporting change] 

Attachment No. 1 To Change Order No. 2

$

$

$

$

$

Recommended by Engineer (if required) Accepted By Contractor

By: By:

Title: Title:

Date: Date:

Authorized by Owner Approved by Funding Agency (if applicable)

By: By:

Title: Title:

Date: Date:

Increase (Decrease) of this Change Order:

     Ready for Final Payment:  

Contract Price prior to this Change Order:

Contract Price incorporating this Change Order: Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:

$277,894.00

9/7/2023

Project Manager

     Ready for Final Payment:  September 12, 2023

Eagle Engineering Group

Spencer Management, LLC

     Substantial Completion:  
     Ready for Final Payment:   

Increase  (Decrease) from previously approved Change Orders No. - 

to No. 1 :
0
0

Increase (Decrease) from previously approved Change 

Orders No. - to No. 1 :

Change in Contract Price

Original Contract Price:

Change in Contract Times
[State Contract Times as either a specifiec date or a

number of days]

August 15, 2023
August 31, 2023

Original Contract Times:
     Substantial Completion:  
     Ready for Final Payment:  $281,611.25

Owner:

Engineer:

Contractor:

Project:

Contract Name:

Increase (Decrease) this Change Order:
     Substantial Completion:  

September 12, 2023September 6, 2023 Effective Date of Change order:Date Issued:

The Contract is  modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:

Description:

0
12

n/a

22-75

n/a

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete 

Repair

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete 

Repair

City of Valley

Adjust project quantities for as constructed conditions. 

Mayor

9/12/2023

     Substantial Completion:  August 15, 2023

($3,717.25)

$281,611.25

$0.00

Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
     Substantial Completion:  
     Ready for Final Payment:  

August 15, 2023
August 31, 2023

EJCDC® C-941, Change Order.

Prepared and published 2013 by the Engineers Joint Contract Documents Committee.  

Page 1 of 2



Project: The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete RepairDated: Project No. 22-75

ITEM 

NO.
DESCRIPTION OF WORK UNIT PRICE UNITS

CONTRACT 

QUANTITY

ACTUAL 

CONSTRUCTED 

QUANTITY

QUANTITY  

CHANGE

CHANGE IN 

CONTRACT PRICE

5 BITUMINOUS JOINT SEALING $1.50 LF 900 0.0 -900.0 -$1,350.00

6 REMOVE & REPLACE 4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK $4.50 SF 282 435.0 153.0 $688.50

7 REMOVE & REPLACE 6-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK RAMP $5.75 SF 269 210.0 -59.0 -$339.25

8 DETECTABLE WARNING PANELS $30.00 SF 56 64.0 8.0 $240.00

9 REMOVE & REPLACE UNSUITABLE SUBGRADE $18.00 CY 200 0.0 -200.0 -$3,600.00

11 TESTING ALLOWANCE $2,000.00 ALW 1 0.0 -1.0 -$2,000.00

21 TESTING ALLOWANCE $2,000.00 ALW 1 0.5 -0.5 -$934.00

24 REMOVE AND REPLACE INTEGRAL CURB & GUTTER $45.00 LF 0 79.5 79.5 $3,577.50

TOTAL -$3,717.25

Attachment No.   1    to    Change Order No.:  2

September 6, 2023

EJCDC® C-941, Change Order.

Prepared and published 2013 by the Engineers Joint Contract Documents Committee. Page 2 of 2







From

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

a. X

b. X

c.

6.

7.

8.

9.

66,662.75$                  

348,274.00$                

348,274.00$                

22-75

Current Contract Price (Line 1 + Line 2)

Contractor:

-$                              

Net change by Change Orders

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete Repair

to

Original Contract Price

 $       348,274.00 

-$                              

 $                        -   

Total Work completed and materials stored to date 

(Sum of Column G Lump Sum Total and Column J Unit Price Total)

Retainage

Work Completed

Stored Materials

Total Retainage (Line 5.a + Line 5.b)

Amount eligible to date (Line 4 - Line 5.c)

Less previous payments (Line 6 from prior application)

Amount due this application

-$                              

-$                              

105,105.25$                

0%

0%

243,168.75$                

281,611.25$                

8/1/2023 9/8/2023

Application Date:

Approved by Funding Agency

By:

Title:

Date:

By:

Title:

Date:

Mayor

By:

Title:

Date:

By:

Title:

348,274.00$                

Date:

Project Manager

Signature: Date:

Spencer Management

Contractor's Certification

Balance to finish, including retainage (Line 3 - Line 4)

Approved by Owner

The undersigned Contractor certifies, to the best of its knowledge, the following:

(1) All previous progress payments received from Owner on account of Work done under the Contract have been 

applied on account to discharge Contractor's legitimate obligations incurred in connection with the Work covered by 

prior Applications for Payment;

(2) Title to all Work, materials and equipment incorporated in said Work, or otherwise listed in or covered by this 

Application for Payment, will pass to Owner at time of payment free and clear of all liens, security interests, and 

encumbrances (except such as are covered by a bond acceptable to Owner indemnifying Owner against any such 

liens, security interest, or encumbrances); and

(3) All the Work covered by this Application for Payment is in accordance with the Contract Documents and is not 

defective.

Recommended by Engineer

Contractor's Application for Payment  

Application No.: 2

City of Valley

Spencer Management

Eagle Engineering Group

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete Repair

Owner's Project No.:

Engineer's Project No.:

Contractor's Project No.:

Application Period:

Contract:

Owner:

Contractor:

Engineer:

Project:

EJCDC C-620 Contractor's Application for Payment

(c) 2018 National Society of Professional Engineers for EJCDC.  All rights reserved.



22-75

2  From 08/01/23 to 09/08/23 09/12/23

A C D E F G H I J K L

Item Quantity Units

Unit Price

($)

Value of Bid Item

(C X E)

($)

Estimated 

Quantity 

Incorporated in 

the Work

Value of Work 

Completed to Date

(E X G)

($)

1                      1.00  LS               5,000.00                   5,000.00                      1.00                   5,000.00                               -                     5,000.00 100%                               -   

2                      1.00  LS               3,500.00                   3,500.00                      1.00                   3,500.00                               -                     3,500.00 100%                               -   

3               2,597.00  SY                    75.50               196,073.50               2,597.00               196,073.50                               -                 196,073.50 100%                               -   

4               5,225.00  LF                      2.50                 13,062.50               5,225.00                 13,062.50                               -                   13,062.50 100%                               -   

5                  900.00  LF                      1.50                   1,350.00                           -                                 -                                 -                                 -   0%                   1,350.00 

6                  282.00  SF                      4.50                   1,269.00                  435.00                   1,957.50                               -                     1,957.50 154%                     (688.50)

7                  269.00  SF                      5.75                   1,546.75                  210.00                   1,207.50                               -                     1,207.50 78%                      339.25 

8                    56.00  SF                    30.00                   1,680.00                    64.00                   1,920.00                               -                     1,920.00 114%                     (240.00)

9                  200.00  CY                    18.00                   3,600.00                           -                                 -                                 -                                 -   0%                   3,600.00 

10                      1.00  LS               5,000.00                   5,000.00                      1.00                   5,000.00                               -                     5,000.00 100%                               -   

11                      1.00  ALW               2,000.00                   2,000.00                           -                                 -                                 -                                 -   0%                   2,000.00 

12                      1.00  LS               2,000.00                   2,000.00                      1.00                   2,000.00                               -                     2,000.00 100%                               -   

13                      1.00  LS                  575.00                      575.00                      1.00                      575.00                               -                        575.00 100%                               -   

14                  479.00  SY                    75.50                 36,164.50                  479.00                 36,164.50                               -                   36,164.50 100%                               -   

15                  120.00  SF                      5.75                      690.00                  120.00                      690.00                               -                        690.00 100%                               -   

16                    16.00  SF                    30.00                      480.00                    16.00                      480.00                               -                        480.00 100%                               -   

17                      2.00  EA                  100.00                      200.00                      2.00                      200.00                               -                        200.00 100%                               -   

18                      1.00  EA                  150.00                      150.00                      1.00                      150.00                               -                        150.00 100%                               -   

19                      1.00  LS                  900.00                      900.00                      1.00                      900.00                               -                        900.00 100%                               -   

20                      1.00  ALW                  950.00                      950.00                      1.00                      950.00                               -                        950.00 100%                               -   

21                      1.00  ALW               2,000.00                   2,000.00                      0.53                   1,066.00                               -                     1,066.00 53%                      934.00 

22                    38.00  SY                    90.00                   3,420.00                    38.00                   3,420.00                               -                     3,420.00 100%                               -   

281,611.25$           274,316.50$           -$                         274,316.50$           97% 7,294.75$               

Work Completed

SITE PREPARATION / MOBILIZATION

REMOVE & CONSTRUCT 7-INCH CONCRETE PAVEMENT - 

REMOVE & REPLACE 4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK 

REMOVE & REPLACE 6-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK RAMP

SURFACE RESTORATION

Original Contract Totals

TRAFFIC CONTROL / BARRICADES / WARNING SIGNS

REMOVE AND CONSTRUCT 7-INCH CONCRETE PAVEMENT - 

REMOVE AND REPLACE 6-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK

DETECTABLE WARNING PANELS

ADJUST VALVE BOX & COVER TO GRADE

ADJUST MANHOLE FRAME & COVER TO GRADE

SURFACE RESTORATION

TRAFFIC CONTROL / BARRICADES / WARNING SIGNS

REMOVE & CONSTRUCT 7-INCH CONCRETE PAVEMENT - 

Description

STAKING ALLOWANCE

TESTING ALLOWANCE

TESTING ALLOWANCE

SITE PREPARATION / MOBILIZATION

BITUMINOUS JOINT SEALING

DETECTABLE WARNING PANELS

REMOVE & REPLACE UNSUITABLE SUBGRADE

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALING

Original Contract

% of 

Value of 

Item

 (J / F)

(%)

Balance to Finish (F 

- J)

($)

Materials 

Currently Stored 

(not in G)

($)

Work Completed 

and Materials 

Stored to Date 

(H + I)

($)

Contract Information

Bid Item 

No.

Engineer:

Contractor:

Project:

Contract:

Owner: City of Valley

Eagle Engineering Group

Spencer Management

B

Contractor's Application for Payment

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete Repair

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete Repair

Application Date:Application Period:Application No.:

Progress Estimate - Unit Price Work

Owner's Project No.:

Engineer's Project No.:

Contractor's Project No.:

Unit Price
EJCDC C-620 Contractor's Application for Payment

(c) 2018 National Society of Professional Engineers for EJCDC.  All rights reserved. 2  of 3



22-75

2  From 08/01/23 to 09/08/23 09/12/23

A C D E F G H I J K L

Item Quantity Units

Unit Price

($)

Value of Bid Item

(C X E)

($)

Estimated 

Quantity 

Incorporated in 

the Work

Value of Work 

Completed to Date

(E X G)

($)

Work Completed

Description

% of 

Value of 

Item

 (J / F)

(%)

Balance to Finish (F 

- J)

($)

Materials 

Currently Stored 

(not in G)

($)

Work Completed 

and Materials 

Stored to Date 

(H + I)

($)

Contract Information

Bid Item 

No.

Engineer:

Contractor:

Project:

Contract:

Owner: City of Valley

Eagle Engineering Group

Spencer Management

B

Contractor's Application for Payment

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete Repair

The Pines Subdivision Concrete Street Repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street Concrete Repair

Application Date:Application Period:Application No.:

Progress Estimate - Unit Price Work

Owner's Project No.:

Engineer's Project No.:

Contractor's Project No.:

26                  828.00  SY                    85.00                 70,380.00                  828.00                 70,380.00                               -                   70,380.00 100%                               -   

27                           -    LF                    45.00                               -                      79.50                   3,577.50                               -                     3,577.50                 (3,577.50)

28                     (1.00)  LS               3,717.25                 (3,717.25)                               -                                 -                                 -   0%                 (3,717.25)

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

                              -                                 -                                 -                                 -                                 -   

66,662.75$             73,957.50$             -$                         73,957.50$             111% (7,294.75)$              

348,274.00$           348,274.00$           -$                         348,274.00$           100% -$                         

CHANGE ORDER NO. 2

 Project Totals

Original Contract and Change Orders

Change Order Totals

Change Orders

REMOVE & CONSTRUCT 7-INCH CONCRETE PAVEMENT - 

REMOVE AND REPLACE INTEGRAL CURB & GUTTER

Unit Price
EJCDC C-620 Contractor's Application for Payment

(c) 2018 National Society of Professional Engineers for EJCDC.  All rights reserved. 3  of 3







R E S O L U T I O N  NO.   2 0 2 3 – 5 3 
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA:  

The certificate filed with the Clerk by the special engineer of the project, showing the 
amount of material furnished and work performed in the City under contract heretofore for 
Oldcastle Materials Midwest Co. d/b/a Omni Engineering for 288th Street and State Street 
pavement resurfacing and the statements of the engineer and others set out below are hereby 
approved and the Council finds that the materials therein set out have been furnished and have 
been received by the City and work has been performed and claim therefor is hereby submitted as 
follows: 

1.   ORIGINAL CONTRACT PRICE $284,178.50 
2.  Net change by Change Orders ($7,001.25) 
3.  Current Contract Price (Line 1 + 2) $277,177.25 
4.  TOTAL COMPLETED AND STORED TO DATE  
       (Column F total on Progress Estimates) $277,177.25 
5.  RETAINAGE:  
          a.  0% x $276,067.25   Work Completed $0.00 
          b. 10% x $0.00               Stored Material $0.00 
          c. Total Retainage (Line 5.a + Line 5.b) $0.00 
6.  AMOUNT ELIGIBLE TO DATE (Line 4 + Line 5.c) $277,177.25 
7.  LESS PREVIOUS PAYMENTS (Line 6 from prior Application) $0.00 
8.  AMOUNT DUE THIS APPLICATION $277,177.25 
9.  BALANCE TO FINISH, PLUS RETAINAGE (Line 3 – Line 4) $0.00 

                            PAYMENT OF:            $277,177.25  
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT the Valley City Council consents to and 
authorizes payment to:   

 
OMNI ENGINEERING  $277,177.25 

 
PASSED AND APPROVED this 12th day of September, 2023. 

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA 
 

____________________________________ 
Cindy Grove, Mayor 

 
____________________________________ 
John Batcher, Council President 

 
 



____________________________________ 
Linda Lewis, Council Member 

 
____________________________________  
Bryon Ueckert, Council Member 

 
____________________________________ 
Chris TenEyck, Council Member 
 
 
 

ATTEST: 
 
_______________________________ 
Cheryl K. Eckerman, City Clerk 
 
 









Eagle Engineering Group

BID TABULATION
12100 West Center Road, Suite #803 Omaha, Nebraska 68144

Project Project 

No.

Owner Bid 

Date:

Address Time:

$387,296.40

BIDDING NOTES

Engineer's Opinion of Probable Construction Costs: $545,000 (CONTRACT NO. 1) / $368,000 (CONTRACT NO. 2)

COMMENT

NL&L CONCRETE

CEDAR CONSTRUCTION 

COMPANY

STEVE HARRIS 

CONSTRUCTION, INC.

VRBA CONSTRUCTION

VALLEY CORP.

THOMPSON CONSTRUCTION 

INC

YOUNG CONSTRUCTION

BIDDER

23-38 & 23-39

City of Valley September 7, 2023

203 North Spruce Street

Valley, NE 68064
10:00 AM

Stillwater Phase 2

Water, Sanitary, Storm, and Paving

CONTRACT NO. 1 CONTRACT NO. 2

NO BID

NO BID

$484,166.00

$526,626.00

$394,789.85

$378,881.00

NO BID

$479,623.25

NO BID

$324,214.50

$352,252.93

NO BID

NO BID


	Agenda
	1. Roll Call
	2. Meeting Called to Order
	3. Pledge of Allegiance
	4. Proof of Publication
	2023.09.12 Aff of Publication

	5. Visitors/Correspondence
	6. Approval of Agenda
	7. Consent Agenda
	7.A. Accept Minutes 

  August 8, 2023, Meeting

  August 15, 2023, Budget Workshop

  August 22, 2023, Budget Workshop

  August 29, 2023, Budget Workshop
	2023.08.08
	2023.08.15
	2023.08.22
	2023.08.29

	7.B. Accept Treasurer's Report
	August report

	7.C. Approve invoices and additional invoices presented for payment
	Accounts Payable
	2023.09.12 Add'l August Bills

	7.D. August Payroll - $96,472.08

                August IRA - $6,195.13
	7.E. August KENO Receipts - $7,243.05
	August KENO Receipts

	7.F. Accept PeopleService Inc., Report
	08 2023

	7.G. Accept August Cemetery Board Minutes
	August Cemetery Min

	7.H. Accept August Library Statistics
	DAILY RECORDS August 2023

	7.I. Accept August Board of Adjustment Minutes
	August Board Minutes


	10. Council Consideration/Action  - to increase the total restricted funds authority by an additional 1%.
	11. Ordinance No. 796  - Adopt Budget Statement/Annual Appropriation Bill.
	Ord 796

	12. Resolution No. 2023-45 - Setting Tax Request
	Res No. 2023-45

	13. Resolution No. 2023-46 - Still Water Lake reimbursement.
	Res No. 2023-46

	14. Resolution No. 2023-47 - LB77 regarding concealed handguns in vehicles owned by the City.
	Res No. 2023-47

	15. Resolution No. 2023-48 - LB77 regarding concealed handguns on City owned property.
	Res No. 2023-48

	16. Discussion  - Capital Facilities fees
	17. Discussion - Park Board advisory committee
	18. PeopleService - general update
	19. Olmsted & Perry - Water Improvement Projects
	19.A. Water Engineer's Report
	DOC090723 VALLEY WATER REPORT-09072023153214

	19.B. Council Consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 in the amount of $606.84 deduction for piping changes, backwash waste recovery project.
	DOC090723 VALLEY BACKWASH CHANGE ORDER 1-09072023141915

	19.C. Resolution No. 2023-49 - Council consideration and action to approve Application for Payment No. 2 from Neuvirth Construction Inc. in the amount of $71,470.76, backwash waste recovery project.
	Res No. 2023-49 - backwash
	DOC090723 VALLEY BACKWASH APP FOR PAYMENT 2-09072023141800

	19.D. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 in the amount of $17,842.50 deduction for unit price work changes, well project.
	DOC090723 VALLEY WELL CHANGE ORDER 1-09072023142610

	19.E. Resolution No. 2023-50 Council consideration and action to approve Application for Payment No. 4 to Layne Christensen Company in the amount of $5,017.50, well project.
	Res No. 2023-50
	DOC090723 VALLEY WELL APP FOR PAYMENT 4-09072023142510

	19.F. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 2 for miscellaneous charges in the amount of $1,827.16 increase, chemical feed project.
	DOC090723 VALLEY CHEM FEED CHANGE ORDER 2-09072023153511

	19.G. Resolution No. 2023-51 Council consideration and action to approve Application for Payment No. 2 from Neuvirth Construction, Inc. in the amount of $130,406.01, chemical feed project.
	Res No. 2023-51 chemical feed
	DOC090723 VALLEY CHEM FEED APP FOR PAYMENT 2-09072023142311

	19.H. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 2 in the amount of $17,096.30 increase for miscellaneous charges for work directive order for welding repairs in control column on time and material basis, filter media project.
	DOC090723 VALLEY FILTER MEDIA WORK CHANGE DIRECTIVE-09072023142147

	19.I. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 adjusting the start and completion times for the work on water tower repainting project.
	DOC090123 VALLEY TANK REPAINTING C.O. 1-09012023091001


	20. City Engineer
	20.A. The Pines subdivision concrete street repair and S. Lakewood Street and W. Waring Street concrete repair.
	20.A.1. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 2 for an increase in the amount of $3,717.25.
	Change_Order_2_22-75

	20.A.2. Resolution No. 2023-52 Council consideration and action to approve Application for Payment No. 2 from Spencer Management in the amount of $105,105.25.
	Res No. 2023-52
	Contractors_Application_for_Payment_2_22-75


	20.B. 288th Street and State Street pavement resurfacing
	20.B.1. Council consideration and action to approve Change Order No. 1 for a decrease in the amount of $8,111.25.
	Change_Order_1_22-79 Signed

	20.B.2. Resolution No. 2023-53 Council consideration and action to approve Application for Payment No. 1 from Omni Engineering in the amount of $277,177.25.
	Res No. 2023-53
	Contractors_Application_for_Payment_1_22-79 Signed


	20.C. Still Water Phase 2 - Water Main, Sanitary Sewer, and Street Paving improvements.
	20.C.1. Review of Bids received September 7, 2023.
	Bid Tab_09-07-2023_23-38 & 23-39

	20.C.2. Council action to consider award of contract.


	21. City Attorney
	22. Mayor's Report
	23. Upcoming Items
	2023.08.30 memorial
	2023.08.21 water and budget issues
	Eagle Scout request

