
The City Council reserves the right to enter into an executive session at any time during the meeting, in accordance with the 
Nebraska Open Meetings Act, even though the closed session may not be indicated on the agenda. 

It is the intention of the City Council to take up the items on the agenda in sequential order.  However, the City Council reserves 
the right to take up matters in a different order to accommodate the schedules of the City Council members, persons having 
items on the agenda, and the public.  

AGENDA
VALLEY CITY COUNCIL

Tuesday, March 14, 2023
City Hall

203 North Spruce
Valley, NE 68064

7:00 PM

1. ROLL CALL

2. MEETING CALLED TO ORDER

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

4. PROOF OF PUBLICATION

5. VISITORS/CORRESPONDENCE

6. APPROVAL OF AGENDA

7. CONSENT AGENDA

All agenda items indicated by an asterisk will comprise the consent agenda and will be 
acted on in a single motion.  Consent agenda items are being forwarded to the Council 
Members.  Any individual item may be removed by a council member for special 
discussion and consideration.

7.A.ACCEPT MINUTES 

7.B.ACCEPT TREASURER’S REPORT

7.C. APPROVE MARCH ACCOUNTS PAYABLE INVOICES AND ADDITIONAL FEBRUARY 
CHECKS

                          

7.D.FEBRUARY PAYROLL $77,163.97   FEBRUARY IRA 2,575.84

7.E. FEBRUARY KENO RECEIPTS - $9,956.40 

7.F. ACCEPT PEOPLESERVICE, INC., REPORT

7.G.ACCEPT February 2023 Cemetery Board Minutes 

7.H.ACCEPT JANUARY 12, 2023 Library Board Minutes

7.I. ACCEPT  February Library Statistics

7.J. RE-APPOINTMENT PLANNING COMMISSION - Mark Conrey - 3 Year Term (2026)
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7.K. ACCEPT February 2023 Planning Commission Minutes 

8. CORNHUSKER STATE GAMES - TRIATHLON - update Lindsay Toussant 

9. MAPA AFFORDABLE HOUSING PRESENTATION/DISCUSSION - Amy Haase 

10. WATERLOO VALLEY OPENING DAY BASEBALL FUND RAISER - Rick Wiese

Permission to close East Front Street in front of the Legion Hall. 

11. TEMPORARY ANTENNA DEPLOYMENT AT JOE ROBERTS ARBORETUM - Matt Jones 

12. VALMONT EASTER EGG HUNT - APRIL 1, 2023 PERMISSION TO USE PARK  - Diego 
Salamanca 

13. OATH OF OFFICE - NEW POLICE OFFICER - Geoffrey Willmann - Police Chief James 
Deemer 

14. SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 785 ELKHORN ATHLETIC ASSOCIATION 

15. RESOLUTION NO. 2023-08 INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT WITH DOUGLAS COUNTY FOR 
ELECTRICAL INSPECTIONS AND PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION SERVICES 

16. ORDINANCE NO. 787 - RELATING TO BURNING PROHIBITIONS AND EXCEPTIONS

17. DISCUSSION CITY ORDINANCE PROCESS MAPPING - DANGEROUS BUILDINGS 

18. RESOLUTION NO. 2023-09 TO AUTHORIZE METROPOLITAN AREA PLANNING AGENCY 
TO CONDUCT COMMUNITY NEEDS ASSESSMENT SURVEY 

19. RETIREMENT PLAN PROPOSALS/RECOMMENDATION - Tyler Cooper 

20. OLMSTED & PERRRY CONULSTING ENGINEERS - Special Engineer on Water Projects - 
James Olmsted 

20.A. 1.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System 
Improvements - New Well 22-1.
2.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System 
Improvements - Filter Media Replacement.
3.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System 
Improvements - Chemical Feed Equipment Replacement.
4.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System 
Improvements - Cleaning, Repair, and Repainting of Water Tower.
5.  Consider Awarding Contracts for the above projects.
6.  Updates on Other Water Components (Backwash Recovery, Treatment Plan 
Expansion, Regional Supplier, Etc.,)
 

21. CITY ENGINEER
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21.A. Stillwater Phase 1 - Water Main, Sanitary Sewer, and Street Paving 
Improvements 

21.A.1. Review of Bids Received March 7th 

21.A.2. Council action to consider award of contract (Water Main, Sanitary 
Sewer, and Storm Sewer) - Vrba Construction 

21.A.3. Council action to consider award of contract (Street Paving) - NL&L 
Concrete 

21.B. Asphalt Pavement Preservation Project - Authorization to Advertise for bids 

21.C. Other / Miscellaneous

21.C.1. Ginger Cove Lift Station No. 3 Upgrades

21.C.2. Valhaven (Southwest No. 2) and Ginger Woods No. 2 Lift Station 
Improvements

21.C.3. EAA Development 

21.C.4. Access Commercial Development 

22. CITY ATTORNEY

23. MAYOR'S REPORT

24. UPCOMING ITEMS

• Planning Commission: -  March 21, 2023 - 4:30 p.m. 

• Valley Days Planning Meeting: - March 21, 2023 - 6:00 p.m. 

































 

 

 

Date:   March 9, 2023 

To:   City of Valley 

From:   Jeremy Beam, Lead Operator  

O & M Report: February 2023 

Water Operation & Maintenance 

➢ PeopleService performed 150 locates for the month. 
 

➢ We installed 20 MXU’s for water meters. 
 

➢ On the 22nd shut-off notices were placed on customers’ doors. However, no 
water was shut off because of outside temperature. 

 
➢ On the 23rd PeopleService read water meters. 

 
➢ The on-call operator got an alarm on the 27th for a seal leak on one of the 

backwash pumps at the water plant.  PeopleService, with the help of West-E-
Con, pulled the pump and sent it in to see if it can be fixed. We also ordered a 
new pump because we don’t know for sure if it can be fixed. We are hoping it can 
be fixed so we have an extra pump on hand. We do not have one on backup if 
one goes down in the summertime. A new pump is in stock and will have it within 
a week. 

 
 
Wastewater Operation & Maintenance 
 

➢ PeopleService helped two different customers with sewer issues.  They were 
having problems and are looking at their lines being replaced. 

 
➢ Lighting is being replaced at Meigs Street and Byarsville lift stations. We tried to 

replace bulbs, but the fixtures were burned out.  
 

➢ Ginger Cove #2 and Valhaven lift stations are waiting on control panels so they 
can be replaced. PeopleService will be working with the contractors when it is 
time for these lift stations to be replaced. 

 
➢ We are still cleaning the bar screen at Byarsville. The new grinder will be coming 

soon. 



 

 

February-23 January-23 February-22

Water Units

Total Monthly Pumped Valley gallons 10,076,000 11,185,000 8,206,000

Daily Average Pumped Valley gallons 359,857 360,806 293,071

Average Fluoride Residual mg/L 1.01 0.00 0.73

Fluoride used lbs 120.80 135.80 93.60

Average Chlorine Residual mg/L 0.43 0.41 0.32

Chlorine used lbs 54.90 99.00 77.50

Potassium Permanganate lbs 354.00 383.00 171.00

Wastewater

Effluent Flow

Total Flow Meigs Street gallons 6,810,000 7,576,000 8,973,000

Avg Daily Flow Meigs Street gallons 252,200 244,000 320,000

Total Flow Byarsville gallons 8,279,000 9,552,000 10,239,000

Avg Daily Flow Byarsville gallons 306,620 308,000 365,678

Total Flow Valmont gallons 221,000 292,000 428,780

Avg Daily Flow Valmont gallons 8,200 9,400 13,831

Lift Station Data

Gardiner St Rainwater Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 0.00

Valhaven (#1) Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 0.00

Valhaven (#2) Total Runtime hours 17.20 15.10 6.80

Country Aire (#1) Total Runtime hours 33.90 24.40 32.00

Legacy Valley Total Runtime hours 73.20 57.20 31.20

Legacy Valley Avg Daily Runtime hours 2.36 1.84 1.00

Valley Shores (1) Pump 1 Total Run hours 16.70 15.90 27.10

Valley Shores (1) Pump 2 Total Run hours 14.20 12.90 24.00

Valley Shores (2) Pump 1 Total Run hours 41.30 40.70 113.80

Valley Shores (2) Pump 2 Total Run hours 0.00 0.00 119.20

Valley Shores (3) Pump 1 Total Run hours 7.80 7.50 6.30

Valley Shores (3) Pump 2 Total Run hours 10.10 9.00 6.10

Regional Pump #1 Total Runtime hours 674.90 814.70 0.00

Regional Pump #2 Total Runtime hours 674.90 813.60 0.00

Mallard (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 12.00 11.60 12.20

Mallard (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 11.50 12.30 12.00

Mallard (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 4.70 4.60 3.70

Mallard (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 4.70 4.30 3.90

Mallard (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 18.70 19.70 22.90

Mallard (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 18.60 19.30 5.30

Mallard (4) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 27.00 28.30 23.20

Mallard (4) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 28.90 28.20 28.00

Bluewater (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 10.80 11.60 9.80

Bluewater (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 16.30 19.40 18.80

Bluewater (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 119.30 84.80 13.50

Bluewater (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 35.30 46.50 13.30

Bluewater (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 18.80 37.90 23.70

Bluewater (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 13.80 16.80 17.20

Bluewater (4) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 42.20 56.90 9.70

Bluewater (4) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 47.20 74.30 10.70

Bluewater (5) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 12.40 0.00 0.00

Bluewater (5) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 23.00 14.20 32.70

Bluewater (6) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 11.10 18.90 10.50

Bluewater (6) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 149.10 411.30 79.60

Bluewater (7) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 7.00 9.60 4.90

Bluewater (7) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 6.80 9.20 4.70

Ginger Cove (1) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 68.60 114.20 37.41

Ginger Cove (1) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 32.61

Ginger Cove (2) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 27.90

Ginger Cove (2) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 14.10 16.60 68.10

Ginger Cove (3) Pump 1 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 51.40

Ginger Cove (3) Pump 2 Total Runtime hours 0.00 0.00 29.80

This Month Last Month
Same Month 

Last Year
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Contract True-Ups - Current Contract Year 

Item Budgeted Amount Amount Spent % of Budget % of Time 

Maintenance Budget $29,736.00 $8,008.00 27% 42% 

Total $29,736.00 $8,008.00 27% 100% 

 
FEBRUARY WORK ORDERS COMPLETED 

Date completed Equipment Location Task 

2/2/2023 BYERSVILLE LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/2/2023 COUNTRY AIRE LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/2/2023 DAIRY QUEEN LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/2/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/2/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/2/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 MALLARD LANDING LIFT STATION 4 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 MEIGS LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 REGIOINAL LS EMERGENCY GENERATOR 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 VALHAVEN LIFTSTATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/3/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/6/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 4 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/6/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 5 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/6/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 6 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/6/2023 BLUEWATER LIFTSTATION 7 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/6/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/8/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/8/2023 GINGER COVE LIFT STATION #3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/8/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/9/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/13/2023 GINGER WOODS LIFT STATION #3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/13/2023 INFLUENT GRINDER/BYERSVILLE LS 5029 Valley, NE Inspection 

2/13/2023 INFLUENT GRINDER/ MEIGS ST LS 5029 Valley, NE Inspection 

2/14/2023 LIFT STATION #1-VALLEY,NE SYST 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/14/2023 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 1 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/13/2023 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 2 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/21/2023 VALLEY SHORES LIFT STATION 3 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/21/2023 VALMONT LIFT STATION 5029 Valley, NE LS Monthly PM 

2/8/2023 BLOWER #1 6029 Valley, NE Service Equipment 

2/21/2023 AIR COMPRESSOR 6029 Valley, NE Inspection 

2/21/2023 AIR COMPRESSOR 6029 Valley, NE Service Equipment 

    



 

 

2/21/2023 HIGH SERVICE PUMP #3 6029 Valley, NE Inspection 

2/8/2023 PORTABLE GAS MONITOR 6029 Valley, NE Calibrate Equipment 

2/8/2023 FIRE EXTINGUISHERS 6029 Valley, NE Inspection 

 







JANUARY 12, 2023 Valley Public Library Board of Trustees Minutes

Call to Order:  President, Kyle Held, called the meeting to order at 6:33 p.m.  

Roll Call:  Trustees answering roll call:   Theresa Samson, Kyle Held, Moria Winters 
and James Musson. Librarian, Sami Stewart was also in attendance. 

Proof of Posting/Open Meetings Act Poster:  The meeting was held in accordance 
with the Nebraska Open Meetings Law, with meeting notice posted in the library 
windows and on web site .  Continuously updated copies of the agenda were 
maintained on the library’s bulletin board and the library’s website. 

 Approval of Agenda:  Motion to approve by T. Samson seconded by M. Winters. Yeas:   
T. Samson, K. Held,  M. Winters and J. Musson   Nays: None.  Motion carried 4-0.  
There were no consent agenda items which required approval.

Recognition of Visitors/Correspondence:  None

Public Comment:   None was given.

Approval of Prior Meetings Minutes:  Motion to approve the November minutes was 
made by M. Winters, seconded by J. Musson.  Yeas:   K. Held ,T. Samson, J. Musson, 
M. Winters.  Nays:  none. Motion carried 4- 0.

Reports

A.  Board President:  No official report.

B.  Library Director:  S. Stewart had emailed the Librarian’s report; she then went over 
verbally and answered questions.  

C. Friends of the LIbrary:  None
D. Foundation: None



Old Business:

A.  Friends Revitalization Committee - no report

New Business  

A. Telescope Policy - LIbrarian went over the current telescope policy for checking it 
out. There were two wording changes/corrections suggested. T. Samson made a 
motion to approve the changes and M. Winters seconded.  Yeas:   K. Held ,T. 
Samson, J. Musson, M. Winters.  Nays:  none. Motion carried 4- 0.

 

Comments and Announcements by Board Members:  None 

Meeting Adjournment was announced by President, K. Held at 7:13 p.m. 

Next meeting is March 9, 2023  at 6:30pm

Respectfully submitted,

Theresa Samson, secretary

 

 







































 

 

O R D I N A N C E     N O.     787 
 
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND AN EXISTING SECTION OF THE CITY OF VALLEY MUNICIPAL 
CODE RELATING TO BURNING PROHIBITIONS AND EXCEPTIONS THERETO; PROVIDING 
FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE, PROVIDING FOR A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; 
AND PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH. 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS 
COUNTY, NEBRASKA, AS FOLLOWS: 
 
 Section 1.  Section 7-108 of the Valley Municipal Code is hereby repealed. 
 Section 2.  Section 7-108 of the Valley Municipal Code shall hereafter be as follows: 

§ 7-108: BURNING PROHIBITED; EXCEPTIONS 
 

It shall be unlawful to start or build or cause to start or build or to maintain any fire on 
public or private property; provided, however, the provisions of this section shall not 
apply to the following:  

 
1. For recreational purposes or for outdoor cooking of food for human 

consumption on other than commercial premises and no nuisance or hazard is 
created.  

2. For essential agricultural operations in the growing of crops if no nuisance or 
traffic hazard is created.  

3. Fires set in the operation of smokeless flare stacks for the combustion of waste 
gases, provided emissions therefrom: (A) are not of a shade or density equal 
to or darker than that designated as No. 1 on the Ringlemann Chart or its 
equivalent; (B) are not of such opacity as to obscure an observer’s view to a 
degree equal to or greater than that designated as No. 1 on the Ringlemann 
Chart or equivalent.   

4. When a permit has been obtained from the city clerk for: (A) destroying 
organic materials only; (B) materials to be burned originate only from site 
stated in permit; or (C) training public or industrial fire-fighting personnel.  An 
application for a burn permit shall be made in the following manner: 

a. Application shall be made on such form as shall be prescribed by the 
city clerk and shall be filed with the said clerk. 

b. An application fee of $50.00 shall be paid to the city clerk with the 
application. None of the application fee will be refunded. 

 
Section 3. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force after its passage and approval, as 

provided by law. 

Section 4. If any section, clause, provision or part or portion of any section, clause or 

provision of this ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstance is held unconstitutional, 

such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or application of any other section, clause, 

provision or part or portion of this ordinance. 



 

 

Section 5. All ordinances or parts thereof in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. 

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS _____ DAY OF MARCH, 2023. 

     CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS COUNTY, NEBRASKA 
 

________________________________________________ 
     Cindy Gove, Mayor 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
____________________________ 
Cheryl Eckerman, City Clerk 



R E S O L U T I O N       2 0 2 3 – 0 9
WHEREAS, the City of Valley (City) is committed to planning for the City’s future 
and engaging the public to assess community needs and priorities; and

WHEREAS, City officials, community stakeholders and volunteers have discussed 
strategic planning and community engagement practices with the Omaha-Council 
Bluffs Metropolitan Area Planning Agency (MAPA), which is a voluntary 
association of local governments that serves Valley and Douglas County; and

WHEREAS, MAPA has offered to make available its services and resources to assist 
the City in its planning efforts and community outreach strategies; and 

WHEREAS, the City has expressed interest in partnering with MAPA to pursue 
these aforementioned community endeavors. 

BE IT RESOLVED THAT, the City of Valley wishes to partner with MAPA to 
assist in developing a Community Needs Assessment and to engage with City 
officials and the public to identify and record actionable objectives for the benefit 
of the entire community.    

DATED THIS 14TH DAY OF MARCH, 2023. 

CITY OF VALLEY, DOUGLAS
COUNTY, NEBRASKA

______________________________
Cindy Grove, Mayor

______________________________
John Batcher, Council President

______________________________
Bryon Ueckert, Council Member

______________________________
Linda Lewis, Council Member

______________________________
Chris TenEyck, Council Member

ATTEST:
___________________________
Cheryl K. Eckerman, City Clerk



Memo
To: Valley City Council

From: Mayor Cindy Grove & Tyler Cooper

cc: City Clerk

Date: 3/14/2023

Re: City of Valley Retirement Services  

In December, 2022 the City Council approved to increase to the city matching contribution to the employee retirement 
plan from 3% to 6% and to evaluate options for a 457b plan. The City Administrator met with three advisors, Galloway 
Financial Services, Primerica and Harris AND Davis Financial Advisors, to review costs, plan options, employee services, 
and future needs. 

Based on the information below, it is the recommendation from the City Administrator that the City of Valley establish a 
457(b) Plan and a corresponding 414(h) Plan with Galloway Financial Advisors Inc. to manage the employee retirement 
benefits.  

• Galloway Financial Advisors Inc. currently manages retirement funds for multiple municipalities and state and 
local government agencies. The firm comes highly recommended by other municipalities and has vast knowledge 
of the specific requirements for government entities. 

• Galloway Financial has the unique ability to provide a 414(h) plan for our employees to reduce taxes and provide 
annual tax savings. 

o The addition of a 414(h) plan to supplement a 457(b) plan is often called a “pick-up plan”.  It allows 
government employees to avoid paying FICA taxes on city vested contributions and the city does not have 
to pay the additional FICA taxes either.  This plan is a tax-advantaged way to grow retirement savings for 
an employe as neither the employee nor the city is required to pay FICA on their pretax contributions 
under this plan.  The addition of a 414(h) plan reduces the plan’s total annual expense.

• Employees will have access to financial education resources via in-person, phone, or self-service web services.

Galloway Financial Advisors Primerica Harris AND Davis

City Implementation Costs $1,500 $0 $2,250 - $2,400

City Annual Expenses1 $2,865 ($1,700 annual + $39 per 
employee + 0.55% Fiduciary and 

Admin fee)

$600 ($30 per 
employee)

$700 ($500 + $10 
per employee)

Participant Annual Expenses1 1.75% of plan assets 1.12% of plan assets 1.73% of plan assets

414(h) Plan Projected annual tax cost savings of 
$4,590 (15.3% of contributions 

projected to be ~$30,000 annually.)

N/A N/A

Fund Group Matrix Funds Equitable Annuity 
Funds

Lincoln Financial

City Annual Expenses1 ($1,725) $600 $700

1 Estimated costs 
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LINCOLN FINANCIAL GROUP

Fees Associated with 457

Benefit Plans, Inc. (Third Party Administrator- TPA)
- Plan Installation $500 (normally $1,300)

- 457 Administration fee $500 + $10 per participant (20) - annual

Lincoln Financial Group (Record Keeper)
- Required Revenue 1.23% - paid by participant (at $250,000 can 

be
reassessed).

- Annual participant charge $25/ yr. per participant. This is charged 
quarterly

and can be paid by participant or plan.

- Annual dollar-based administration fee $750/ year if rollovers under $250,000. Can be
assessed once balance reaches $250,000

- Financial Representative Fee .50% - must be paid by participant

City of Valley Participant

$500 Plan Installation 1.23% Required revenue
$500 Administration Fee ($200 per year after)
$500 Per Participant fee .50% Representative Fee
$750 Annual Admin Fee

$2,250 1.73%

*Lincoln has a top-rated mobile app and website
*All call centers located in US
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VOYA

Fees Associated with 457

Benefit Plans, Inc. (Third Party Administrator- TPA)
- Plan Installation $500 (normally $1,300)

- 457 Administration fee $500 + $10 per participant (20) - annual

Voya (Record Keeper)
- Required Revenue 1.95% - paid by participant (at $200,000 can 

be
reassessed).

- Annual participant charge $70/ yr. per participant. This is charged 
quarterly

and can be paid by participant or plan.

- Annual dollar-based administration fee $1,000/ year if rollovers under $250,000. Can be
assessed once balance reaches $250,000

- TPA program (revenue .05% - must be paid by participant
sharing)

- Financial Representative Fee .50% - must be paid by participant

City of Valley Participant

$500 Plan Installation 1.95% required revenue
$500 Administration Fee ($200 per year after) .05% revenue sharing TPA Fee
$1,400 Per Participant fee .50% Representative Fee
$1000 Annual Admin Fee

$3,400 2.5%

*Voya has 2 call centers in US, 1 in Philippines
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JOHN HANCOCK

Fees Associated with 457

Benefit Plans, Inc. (Third Party Administrator- TPA)
- Plan Installation $500 (normally $1,300)

- 457 Administration fee $500 + $10 per participant (20) - annual

John Hancock (Record Keeper)
- Required Revenue .65% - paid by participant (at $250,000 can 

be
reassessed).

- Annual participant charge $48/ yr. per participant. This is charged 
quarterly

and can be paid by participant or plan.

- Annual dollar-based administration fee $1,000/ year if rollovers under $250,000. Can be
assessed once balance reaches $250,000

- TPA program (revenue  .05% - must be paid by participant
sharing)

- Financial Representative Fee .50% - must be paid by participant

City of Valley Participant

$500 Plan Installation .65% Required Revenue
$500 Administration Fee ($200 per year after) .05% TPA revenue sharing Fee
$960 Per Participant fee .50% Representative Fee
$1000 Annual Admin Fee

$2,960 1.2%
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NATIONWIDE

Fees Associated with 457

Benefit Plans, Inc. (Third Party Administrator- TPA)
- Plan Installation $500 (normally $1,300)

- 457 Administration fee $500 + $10 per participant (20) - annual

Nationwide (Record Keeper)
- Required Revenue 1.20% - paid by participant (at $250,000 can 

be
reassessed).

- Annual participant charge $24/ yr. per participant. This is charged 
quarterly

and can be paid by participant or plan.

- Annual dollar-based administration fee $2,000/ year. Reduces to $1,000 @ $250k. $500 at 
$500,000. $0 once > $1,000,000.

- Financial Representative Fee .50% - must be paid by participant

City of Valley Participant

$500 Plan Installation 1.20% Required Revenue
$500 Administration Fee ($200 per year after)
$480 Per Participant fee .50% Representative Fee
$2000 Annual Admin Fee

$3,400 1.7%

*Nationwide’s call centers are in U.S. with Saturday availability
*Nationwide has a top-rated mobile app and website



















Eagle Engineering Group

BID TABULATION
12100 West Center Road, Suite #803 Omaha, Nebraska 68144

Project Project 

No.

Owner Bid 

Date:

Address Time:

BIDDER

22-77 & 22-78

City of Valley March 9, 2023

203 North Spruce Street

Valley, NE 68064
10:00 AM

Stillwater Phase 1

Paving & Sewer Improvements

THOMPSON CONSTRUCTION 

INC

RPL UTILITY, LLC

OLDCASTLE MATERIALS 

MIDWEST CO dba OMNI 

ENGINEERING, INC.

NEUVIRTH’S CONSTRUCTION 

INC.

MBC CONSTRUCTION INC.

NL&L CONCRETE

VALLEY CORP.

BIDDING NOTES

Engineer's Opinion of Probable Construction Costs: $689,000

VRBA CONSTRUCTION

NO BID

NO BID

$585,186.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

UNITED UTILITIES & 

EXCAVATION LLC

NO BID

$747,870.00

CONTRACT NO. 2

NO BID

COMMENTCONTRACT NO. 1

NO BID

$1,589,815.64

$1,247,462.00*

NO BID

$200,316.15

$174,996.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


	Agenda
	1. ROLL CALL
	2. MEETING CALLED TO ORDER
	3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
	4. PROOF OF PUBLICATION
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	20.A. 1.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System Improvements - New Well 22-1.

2.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System Improvements - Filter Media Replacement.

3.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System Improvements - Chemical Feed Equipment Replacement.

4.  Review bids received on March 13, 2023 for the 2022 Water System Improvements - Cleaning, Repair, and Repainting of Water Tower.

5.  Consider Awarding Contracts for the above projects.

6.  Updates on Other Water Components (Backwash Recovery, Treatment Plan Expansion, Regional Supplier, Etc.,)
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	21.B. Asphalt Pavement Preservation Project - Authorization to Advertise for bids
	21.C. Other / Miscellaneous
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	21.C.4. Access Commercial Development


	22. CITY ATTORNEY
	23. MAYOR'S REPORT
	24. UPCOMING ITEMS

