
This meeting is a meeting of the Board of Education in public for the purpose of conducting the School District’s business and is not to be 
considered a public community meeting.  There is a time for public participation during the meeting as indicated on the Agenda.

PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BOARD OF EDUCATION

REGULAR MEETING
CENTRAL HIGH SCHOOL ROOM #1136, 8135 S. WESTNEDGE, PORTAGE, MICHIGAN 49002

APRIL 14, 2025, 6:30 PM
AGENDA

VISION STATEMENT
An exceptional, continuously improving learning culture with high expectations, committed to all!

MISSION STATEMENT
Portage Public Schools will educate all students to achieve their potential.

I. CALL TO ORDER AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
II. REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA
III. REPORTS

1. SUPERINTENDENT'S REPORT
a. BOND PROJECT UPDATE

IV. BOARD EDUCATION
1. ALTERNATIVE EDUCATION UPDATE

V. COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS
1. BY CITIZENS
2. BY BOARD TRUSTEES
3. BOARD COMMITTEE REPORTS

VI. CONSENT AGENDA
1. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

a. MARCH 10, 2025 SPECIAL MEETING & REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING
VII. ASSURANCE OF DISTRICT PERFORMANCE

1. MONITORING REPORT 1.3, ENDS (GP 4.4)
VIII. REQUIRED ACTION ITEMS

1. KRESA BIENNIAL ELECTION RESOLUTION #1 (MCL 380.614)
IX. ACTION ITEMS

1. TEACHER & STAFF APPRECIATION WEEK PROCLAMATION
X. DISCUSSION ITEMS

1. COPY / PRINT SERVICES (OP 6320)
2. PCEC ROOF REPAIR (OP 6320)

XI. CLOSED SESSION
1. DISCUSS COLLECTIVE BARGAINING STRATEGY (OMA)

XII. ADJOURN
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 II. Revisions/Approval of Agenda 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 Recommended  Motion: 

 

Motion offered by   , seconded by   , that the 
 

Board of Education approve the Agenda as printed (or as amended). 
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III. Reports 

 1. Superintendent’s Report 

  a. Bond Project Update 
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IV. Board Education 

 1. Alternative Education Update 
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V. Comments or Communications 

1. By Citizens 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 

2. By Board Trustees 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

3. Board Committee Reports 
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VI. Consent Agenda 

1. Approval of Minutes 

a. March 10, 2025 Special Meeting & Regular Business Meeting 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION 

 

SPECIAL MEETING & REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 

MARCH 10, 2025 

 

SPECIAL MEETING 

The Special Meeting of the Board of Education of Portage Public Schools held on Monday, March 

10, 2025, was called to order at 5:07 p.m. by President Van Antwerp.  The meeting was held in 

Conference Room #1 of the Administration Building.  

 

Board Trustees Present: Emily Crawford, Kimberly Larson, Mary Lou Rohwer, Bo Snyder, Mark 

Stevenson, Randy Van Antwerp 

 

Board Trustees Absent:  Terri Novaria 

 

Administration Present:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent 

 

Others Present:  Andy Ingall of Michigan Leadership Institute (MLI) 

 

REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA   

Motion offered by Mrs. Rohwer, seconded by Mrs. Crawford, that the Board of Education 

approve the agenda as printed. 

 

The motion carried unanimously. 

 

COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS   

There were no comments or communications. 

 

DISCUSSION ITEMS  

Superintendent Search 

Mr. Andy Ingall of Michigan Leadership Institute facilitated discussion regarding the superintendent 

search, which focused on the search timeline and job posting. 

 

The meeting adjourned at 5:54 p.m. 
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REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
The Regular Business Meeting of the Board of Education of Portage Public Schools held on Monday, 

March 10, 2025, was called to order at 6:30 p.m. by President Van Antwerp.  The meeting was held 

in Room #1136 of Portage Central High School.  The Pledge of Allegiance was recited. 

 

Board Trustees Present: Emily Crawford, Kimberly Larson, Mary Lou Rohwer, Bo Snyder, Mark 

Stevenson, Randy Van Antwerp 

 

Board Trustees Absent:  Terri Novaria 

 

REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA   

Motion offered by Dr. Stevenson, seconded by Mrs. Crawford, that the Board of Education 

approve the agenda as printed. 

 

The motion carried unanimously. 

 

REPORTS 

Superintendent’s Report 

Bond Project Update 

The bond project update provided by Mr. Johnny Edwards, Assistant Superintendent of Operations, 

was specific to Woodland Elementary.  This summer the current Woodland building will be 

demolished and construction on the new school will begin and continue for two years.  During the 

construction phase for Woodland Elementary, staff/students will use the current Haverhill Elementary. 

There are several items to consider with operating two schools on the same campus, including traffic, 

safety and the student day start/end times.  Currently, all of our elementary schools begin/end at the 

same time of the school day.  For the next two school years at the old Haverhill, the doors for 

Woodland students will open at 8:55 a.m. with classes starting at 9:00 a.m. with the day wrapping up 

at 4:00 p.m.  This schedule will limit traffic congestion on campus.  There is no reduction to the 

instructional minutes given these starting and ending times changed.  This week during parent-teacher 

conferences, we will survey Woodland families to gauge interest in busing.  

 

Student Presentation re CEL Playground Design 

Mr. Johnny Edwards introduced Ms. Sara Wagenaar, Principal of Central Elementary.  Ms. Wagenaar 

provided introductory remarks.  Fourth grade students shared their impressions of the new CEL 

playground via a presentation. 

 

Trustees appreciated the presentation and applauded the students. 

 

CIA Department Update 

Unfortunately, the planned presenter Dr. Tracy Speaker-Gerstheimer, Director of Curriculum & PD 

9-12, was out ill.  Superintendent Bielang stepped in to provide the update.  Mr. Bielang gave an 

overview of the World Language curriculum review cycle and key issues needing attention.  The 

issue of inconsistency in how credits are allocated to level one courses was identified and explored 
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during the summer/fall of 2024.  It was also found that, unlike other middle school courses that grant 

high school credit, the World Language courses spanned a longer duration and utilized different 

resources than their high school counterparts.  In addition, we were in conflict with policy regarding 

granting of credit toward graduation.  Based on these findings, we decided to weigh programming 

options in order to look at our structures, credits, and programming.  A meeting was held in mid-

February 2025 to discuss the findings and considerations.  At this meeting, three concerns emerged – 

credit allocation, the requirement that all students take World Language in middle school for high 

school credit, and the need/effectiveness of introductory courses.  These were discussed and 

researched to better understand how they should be addressed. 

 

The current practice awards two full credits for middle school World Language courses, fulfilling the 

state’s graduation requirement but creating inconsistencies such as (1) disparity in credit allocation – 

middle school students earn two credits for a course taught over two years while high school 

students earn one credit for the same course completed in a year. (2) There is a misalignment with 

Michigan Department of Education guidance.  Credits earned in middle school, while noted on the 

student’s transcript, have not counted toward the 26 credits required for graduation; however, the 

same course taken in high school does count toward the 26 credits.  This needs to be corrected. 

 

There was a concern raised that the requirement for middle school students to take World Language 

may not be appropriate for all learners.  This raised the question why are we compelling all students 

to engage in advanced coursework prematurely when it is not necessary.  Evidence exists that 

students can succeed in high school courses offered at the middle school that are paced in the same 

manner as their high school counterparts.  For example, middle school runs two or more sections of 

Math Plus 8, the equivalent to Algebra 1.  In addition, as of this board meeting, the Michigan 

Department of Education is not aware of any other district in Michigan that requires all students to 

take World Language for high school credit in middle school.  Offering World Language in middle 

school should be optional; allowing families to choose participation based on the child’s readiness. 

 

In conclusion, earning high school credit in middle school can be advantageous but should not be 

mandatory.  To ensure developmental appropriateness, academic rigor, and equity, it is 

recommended that we ensure the middle school World Language courses maintain the same 

structure and rigor as their high school equivalents, adjust credit allocation to be consistent with 

other district practices (in this case, a World Language 1 class offered as an elective course in eighth 

grade will award one credit for successful completion of the course), and implement an Introductory 

World Language course in seventh grade beginning in 2025. 

 

Next steps include - finish the current course sequence with rising eighth graders, develop an 

introductory semester course during the summer 2025 to begin with rising seventh graders, and form 

a team to outline the long-term progression of offering various levels and the introductory course 

beginning in sixth grade. 

 

Superintendent Bielang addressed questions from Trustees.  
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Other 

Per Superintendent Bielang, the Grand Opening for the new Career Connect Center is May 22, 2025 

from 4-7 p.m.  The Center will serve as the transportation hub for districts in the county for other 

off-site CTE programs.  Each district in the county is allotted a number of student slots based on 

enrollment.  Portage has 393 slots.  Finance, accounting, marketing and engineered woods will 

continue to be supported at PPS.  We are excited for the opening of the Center and the opportunities 

for our students. 

 

In addition, Superintendent Bielang shared that he recently had the opportunity to hear the Dean of 

the Mary Lou Fulton Teachers College at Arizona State University.  She is doing a lot of work in 

redesigning the educational workforce and workplace and creating models for team-based teaching 

and learning. The things she talked about reinforced the direction we are going in with our new 

elementary building designs and staff professional development. 

 

COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS 

President Van Antwerp opened the floor to public comment and read aloud the guidelines for public 

participation.  

 

Kat Frink, on behalf of the PEA, shared “good news” from around the District on staff/student 

events/activities. 

 

Each of the following public commenters addressed the Board in regards to World Language Program 

changes: 

 Sarah Baker 

 Bonnie Moss 

 Heather Canenguez 

 Rachele Reidel 

 Katherine Millar 

 Shae Vaughn 

 Sophia Lin 

 Adelaide Kauchak 

 Jillian Hatfield 

 Kathryn Jawahir 

 Kadyn Mackey 

 Paarth Sharma 

 Kaitie Paynich 

 Christy Rath 

 

President Van Antwerp thanked the public commenters and opened the floor to Trustee comments. 

Dr. Stevenson thanked the public commenters for their remarks. 

 

Mrs. Crawford appreciated the public comments and was especially impressed by the student 

statements. 
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Ms. Larson thanked the public commenters for their remarks and congratulated all who participated 

in the band festival. 

 

Mr. Snyder thanked the public commenters for their remarks and encouraged all to understand all 

views on the matter – keep an open mind.  He also appreciated the Central Elementary student 

presentation, and requested Superintendent Bielang provide a follow-up report on ELA, which Mr. 

Bielang acknowledged. 

 

President Van Antwerp thanked all commenters for their remarks. 

 

CONSENT AGENDA 

President Van Antwerp presented the following Consent Agenda items for approval by the 

Board of Education: the February 24, 2025 Special Meeting and Regular Business Meeting 

minutes and approve the revisions to Bylaw 0142.7-Orientation, as presented. 

 

There being no objections, the motion carried unanimously. 

 

ASSURANCE OF DISTRICT PERFORMANCE 

Motion offered by Mr. Snyder, seconded by Mrs. Rohwer, that the Board of Education accept 

Monitoring Report 1.2 - Ends, as a reasonable interpretation and evidence of compliance with 

policy. 

 

Superintendent Bielang shared highlights from his report. 

 

The motion carried unanimously. 

 

DISCUSSION ITEMS 

Classroom Technology 

Dr. Ryan Miller, Director of Information and Technology Systems, and Mr. Steve Van Dyke, Data 

Center Systems Specialist, reviewed the recommendation to award contracts for the installation of 

classroom technology equipment at the new Central and Haverhill Elementary Schools. 

 

The Board opted to move the item to action. 

 

Motion offered by Mrs. Crawford, seconded by Ms. Larson, that the Board of Education move 

the Classroom Technology discussion item to action.  

 

The motion carried unanimously. 

 

Motion offered by Mr. Snyder, seconded by Mrs. Crawford, that the Board of Education 

approve award of a contract with Parkway Electric for installation of classroom technology 

equipment at the new Central Elementary and Haverhill Elementary for a total project cost not-

to-exceed $251,064.00, which includes a ten percent contingency for each school, and to be 

funded by the 2021 Bond. 
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The motion carried unanimously. 

 

With no further business to come before the Board, the meeting was adjourned at 8:38 p.m. 

 

Respectfully submitted, 

 

 

Barb Atkinson 

Recording Secretary 
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VII. Assurance of District Performance 

1. Monitoring Report 1.3, Ends (GP 4.4) 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by ________, seconded by ________, that the Board of Education 

accept as presented, the Monitoring Report on 1.3, Ends, as a reasonable 

interpretation and evidence of compliance with policy. 
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VIII. Required Action Items 

 1. KRESA Biennial Election Resolution #1 (MCL 380.614) 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion 

Motion offered by __________, seconded by __________, that the Board of Education 

approve the Resolution to Consider Designation of Electoral Representative for the 

June 2, 2025 Biennial Election, as presented. 
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IX. Action Items 

 1. Teacher & Staff Appreciation Week Proclamation 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion 

Motion offered by __________, seconded by __________, that the Board of Education 

approve the Teacher & Staff Appreciation Week Proclamation, as presented. 
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TEACHER & STAFF APPRECIATION 

WEEK PROCLAMATION 
 

Whereas, a strong effective free public education for all children is critical to our 

democracy at the national, state and local level; and 

 
Whereas, a strong public school system makes for a strong community; and 

 
Whereas, the vision of Portage Public Schools is to be an exceptional, 

continuously improving learning culture with high expectations, committed to all; 

and 

 
Whereas, the commitment Portage Public Schools teachers and staff show to 

students by inspiring them to succeed academically, artistically, socially and 

athletically is essential to making the vision a reality; and 

 

Whereas, our educators go above and beyond for our students, making a lasting 

contribution to their lives. 

 
Therefore, the Board of Education of Portage Public Schools, does hereby 

proclaim May 5-9, 2025 as Teacher & Staff Appreciation Week in the Portage 

Public School District, and encourages all citizens to thank educators for their daily 

work. 

 
Adopted this 14th day of April 2025 

Portage Public Schools’ Board of Education 
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X. Discussion Items 

 1.  Copy / Print Services (OP 6320) 
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‭To: Mark Bielang, Superintendent‬

‭From: Ryan Miller, Director of Technology and Systems‬

‭CC: Paula Johnson, Director of Finance‬

‭Date: April 1, 2025‬

‭Re: Copy/Print Contract‬

‭RECOMMENDATION‬

‭I‬ ‭recommend‬ ‭the‬ ‭Board‬ ‭of‬ ‭Education‬ ‭authorize‬ ‭the‬ ‭Superintendent‬ ‭or‬ ‭his‬ ‭designee‬ ‭to‬ ‭enter‬ ‭into‬‭a‬
‭three‬ ‭year‬ ‭agreement‬ ‭(with‬ ‭the‬ ‭option‬ ‭to‬ ‭extend‬ ‭the‬ ‭agreement‬ ‭up‬ ‭to‬ ‭two‬ ‭additional‬ ‭years)‬ ‭with‬
‭Adams‬ ‭Remco,‬ ‭located‬ ‭in‬ ‭Kalamazoo‬ ‭Michigan,‬ ‭for‬ ‭the‬ ‭lease‬ ‭of‬ ‭copy/print‬ ‭equipment‬‭along‬‭with‬
‭associated‬‭maintenance‬‭and‬‭service‬‭agreements‬‭as‬‭laid‬‭out‬‭in‬‭the‬‭attached‬‭documentation.‬‭The‬‭term‬
‭of‬‭this‬‭agreement‬‭will‬‭begin‬‭on‬‭July‬‭1,‬‭2025‬‭and‬‭end‬‭no‬‭later‬‭than‬‭June‬‭30,‬‭2030.‬‭Required‬‭payments‬
‭for this agreement will be taken from the general fund budgets covering the term of the agreement.‬

‭COST BREAKDOWN‬

‭Lease Year‬ ‭Lease Fees‬ ‭Software / Fees‬ ‭Estimated Copy Fees‬ ‭Total Estimated Cost‬

‭1‬ ‭$116,622.78‬ ‭$3962.11‬ ‭$72,841.67‬ ‭$193,426.56‬

‭2‬ ‭$116,622.78‬ ‭$3962.11‬ ‭$72,841.67‬ ‭$193,426.56‬

‭3‬ ‭$116,622.78‬ ‭$3962.11‬ ‭$72,841.67‬ ‭$193,426.56‬

‭4‬ ‭$0‬ ‭$4830.00‬ ‭$72,841.67‬ ‭$77,671.67‬

‭5‬ ‭$0‬ ‭$4830.00‬ ‭$72,841.67‬ ‭$77,671.67‬

‭Equipment Credits‬ ‭-$5000.00‬

‭Estimated Total - 5 Year‬ ‭$730,623.01‬

‭BACKGROUND INFORMATION‬

‭The current fleet of multifunction printers (MFPs) are in their fifth year of service, and the current fleet of‬
‭printers are in their tenth year of service, and are due to be replaced.  A request for proposal was issued in‬
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‭January for a proposed solution, municipal lease agreement, and a per-impression (copy) charge for‬
‭service and supplies. With a municipal lease, PPS becomes the owner of the machines after 3 years.  The‬
‭total contract value fluctuates with our actual usage of the equipment.  The estimated $731,000 for the 5‬
‭years is based on an annual average of about 13-14 million impressions per year.‬

‭BIDDING PROCESS‬

‭These services were formally bid out, our team met with three finalists, and Adams Remco was the lowest‬
‭qualified bidder.  We have worked with Adams Remco for many years and maintain a good working‬
‭relationship. We have found the equipment they provide is reliable and their service technicians have‬
‭done a great job with response and minimizing downtime.  The term of the lease is 3 years, and keeping‬
‭with past practices, we will plan to extend the service contract for 2 additional years after the lease is paid‬
‭off.  Those two years we will only incur per-impression service and supplies cost.  As per terms of the‬
‭proposal, PPS will provide paper and staples, while Adams Remco will provide toner and replacement‬
‭parts & service.  I would be happy to answer any questions that the Board members have related to this‬
‭recommendation.‬

‭Attachments‬
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Vendor:
US Business -

Kyocera
US Business -

Sharp
US Business -

HP Printers Applied Innovation

Additional Features (Years 1-3):
Total Est. Annual (Years 1-3):

Total Estimated (Year 4):
Total Estimated (Year 5):

Equipment Removal Costs/Credits:
Software Establishment (One Time):

5 Year Est. Investment:

Copier Lease $116,820.96 $116,215.74 $0.00 $97,848.00
Printer Lease $0.00 $5,634.21 $5,634.21 $5,960.00

# of Copiers not specified not specified 0 70
# of Printers not specified not specified not specified 43

Per Page - Copier - BW Less than 8.5x14 $0.0034 $0.0029 $0.0032
Per Page - Copier - BW Greater Than

8.5x14 $0.0068 $0.0058 $0.0064
Per Page - Copier - Color Less than

8.5x14 $0.035 $0.029 $0.033
Per Page - Copier - Color Greater than

8.5x14 $0.065 $0.058 $0.066
Per Page - Printer - BW $0.0078 $0.01 $0.009

Per Page - Printer - Color $0.068 $0.09 $0.06
Software $8,229.37 $8,229.37 $8,229.37 $6,259.00

Alt - ID-1 Impression $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt - Card Printers Lease $4,328.80 $4,328.80 $4,328.80 $6,300.00

Annual Copier B/W
12,004,128 $40,814.04 $34,811.97 $0.00 $38,413.21

Annual Copier Color
1,100,438 $38,515.33 $31,912.70 $0.00 $36,314.45

Annual Printer B/W
339,696 $0.00 $2,649.63 $3,396.96 $3,057.26

Annual Printer Color
46,611 $0.00 $3,169.55 $4,194.99 $2,796.66

$204,379.70 $202,623.17 $21,455.53 $190,648.59
Year 4 Lease

Year 4 Per Page - Copier - BW $0.0034 $0.0029 $0.0032
Year 4 Per Page - Copier - Color $0.035 $0.029 $0.033

Year 4 Per Page - Printer - BW $0.0078 $0.01 $0.009
Year 4 Per Page - Printer - Color $0.068 $0.09 $0.06

Year 4 - Software/Fees $8,229.37 $8,229.37 $8,229.37 $5,670.00
Year 5 - Lease

Year 5 Per Page - Copier - BW $0.0034 $0.0029 $0.0032
Year 5 Per Page - Copier - Color $0.035 $0.029 $0.033

Year 5 Per Page - Printer - BW $0.0078 $0.01 $0.009
Year 5 Per Page - Printer - Color $0.068 $0.09 $0.06

Year 5 - Software/Fees $8,229.37 $8,229.37 $8,229.37 $5,670.00
$87,558.74 $80,773.22 $15,821.32 $86,251.59
$87,558.74 $80,773.22 $15,821.32 $86,251.59

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$9,684.40 $9,684.40 $9,684.40 $0.00

$797,940.96 $779,100.35 $105,693.63 $744,448.94
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Vendor:

Additional Features (Years 1-3):
Total Est. Annual (Years 1-3):

Total Estimated (Year 4):
Total Estimated (Year 5):

Equipment Removal Costs/Credits:
Software Establishment (One Time):

5 Year Est. Investment:

Copier Lease
Printer Lease

# of Copiers
# of Printers

Per Page - Copier - BW Less than 8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - BW Greater Than

8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - Color Less than

8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - Color Greater than

8.5x14
Per Page - Printer - BW

Per Page - Printer - Color
Software

Alt - ID-1 Impression
Alt - Card Printers Lease

Annual Copier B/W
12,004,128

Annual Copier Color
1,100,438

Annual Printer B/W
339,696

Annual Printer Color
46,611

Year 4 Lease
Year 4 Per Page - Copier - BW

Year 4 Per Page - Copier - Color
Year 4 Per Page - Printer - BW

Year 4 Per Page - Printer - Color
Year 4 - Software/Fees

Year 5 - Lease
Year 5 Per Page - Copier - BW

Year 5 Per Page - Copier - Color
Year 5 Per Page - Printer - BW

Year 5 Per Page - Printer - Color
Year 5 - Software/Fees

DL Gallivan Konica Minolta Adams Remco
Precision Printer Services -

Opt 1
Precision Printer Services -

Opt 2
$107,787.84 $115,544.76 $103,382.01 $176,158.68 $130,905.84

$7,425.32 $12,753.84 $13,240.77 $19.99 $19.99
71 71 72 71 76
43 43 43 44 44

$0.0033 $0.0034 $0.0029 $0.0048 $0.0077

$0.0066 $0.0034 $0.0058 $0.005 $0.0079

$0.03 $0.039 $0.029 $0.031 $0.06

$0.06 $0.039 $0.058 $0.035 $0.063
$0.0073 $0.01 $0.0095 $0.005 $0.005

$0.045 $0.0345 $0.062 $0.05 $0.05
$3,125.20 $7,631.65 $3,962.11 $4,842.20 $4,842.20

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$39,613.62 $40,814.04 $34,811.97 $57,619.81 $92,431.79

$33,013.14 $42,917.08 $31,912.70 $34,113.58 $66,026.28

$2,479.78 $3,396.96 $3,227.11 $1,698.48 $1,698.48

$2,097.50 $1,608.08 $2,889.88 $2,330.55 $2,330.55

$195,542.40 $224,666.41 $193,426.56 $276,783.29 $298,255.13

$0.0033 $0.0034 $0.0029 $0.0048 $0.0077
$0.03 $0.039 $0.029 $0.031 $0.06

$0.0073 $0.01 $0.0095 $0.005 $0.005
$0.045 $0.0345 $0.062 $0.05 $0.05

$3,125.20 $4,842.20 $4,830.00 $4,842.20 $4,842.20

$0.0033 $0.0034 $0.0029 $0.0048 $0.0077
$0.03 $0.039 $0.029 $0.031 $0.06

$0.0073 $0.01 $0.0095 $0.005 $0.005
$0.045 $0.0345 $0.062 $0.05 $0.05

$3,125.20 $4,842.20 $4,830.00 $4,842.20 $4,842.20
$80,329.24 $93,578.36 $77,671.67 $100,604.62 $167,329.30
$80,329.24 $93,578.36 $77,671.67 $100,604.62 $167,329.30

-$5,000.00
$9,904.00 $11,005.00 $0.00 $19,368.80 $19,368.80

$757,189.67 $872,160.93 $730,623.01 $1,050,927.92 $1,248,792.77
*DL Gallivan bid a 2 tier color at .015/.03 per impression for less than 6% color coverage
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Vendor:

Additional Features (Years 1-3):
Total Est. Annual (Years 1-3):

Total Estimated (Year 4):
Total Estimated (Year 5):

Equipment Removal Costs/Credits:
Software Establishment (One Time):

5 Year Est. Investment:

Copier Lease
Printer Lease

# of Copiers
# of Printers

Per Page - Copier - BW Less than 8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - BW Greater Than

8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - Color Less than

8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - Color Greater than

8.5x14
Per Page - Printer - BW

Per Page - Printer - Color
Software

Alt - ID-1 Impression
Alt - Card Printers Lease

Annual Copier B/W
12,004,128

Annual Copier Color
1,100,438

Annual Printer B/W
339,696

Annual Printer Color
46,611

Year 4 Lease
Year 4 Per Page - Copier - BW

Year 4 Per Page - Copier - Color
Year 4 Per Page - Printer - BW

Year 4 Per Page - Printer - Color
Year 4 - Software/Fees

Year 5 - Lease
Year 5 Per Page - Copier - BW

Year 5 Per Page - Copier - Color
Year 5 Per Page - Printer - BW

Year 5 Per Page - Printer - Color
Year 5 - Software/Fees

Precision Printer Services -
Opt 3 American Office Solutions

Printer Source Plus -
MFP Opt 1

Printer Source Plus -
MFP Opt 2

$0.00 $114,117.43 $126,615.20 $138,238.55
$19.99 $7,112.31 $0.00 $0.00

0 71 71 71
44 42 0 0

$0.00368 $0.003 $0.003

$0.00736 $0.006 $0.006

$0.0339 $0.03 $0.03

$0.0678 $0.06 $0.06
$0.0050 $0.0079

$0.050 $0.059
$10,793.97 $4,842.20 $4,842.20

no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid

$0.00 $44,175.19 $36,012.38 $36,012.38

$0.00 $37,304.85 $33,013.14 $33,013.14

$1,698.48 $2,683.60 $0.00 $0.00

$2,330.55 $2,750.05 $0.00 $0.00

$4,049.02 $218,937.40 $200,482.92 $212,106.27

$0.00368 $0.003 $0.003
$0.0339 $0.03 $0.03

$0.0050 $0.0079
$0.050 $0.059

$10,793.97 $4,842.20 $4,842.20

$0.00368 $0.003 $0.003
$0.0339 $0.03 $0.03

$0.0050 $0.0079
$0.050 $0.059

$10,793.97 $4,842.20 $4,842.20
$4,029.03 $97,707.66 $73,867.72 $73,867.72
$4,029.03 $97,707.66 $73,867.72 $73,867.72

$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $37,294.76 $8,804.00 $8,804.00

$20,205.12 $889,522.26 $757,988.22 $792,858.27
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Vendor:

Additional Features (Years 1-3):
Total Est. Annual (Years 1-3):

Total Estimated (Year 4):
Total Estimated (Year 5):

Equipment Removal Costs/Credits:
Software Establishment (One Time):

5 Year Est. Investment:

Copier Lease
Printer Lease

# of Copiers
# of Printers

Per Page - Copier - BW Less than 8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - BW Greater Than

8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - Color Less than

8.5x14
Per Page - Copier - Color Greater than

8.5x14
Per Page - Printer - BW

Per Page - Printer - Color
Software

Alt - ID-1 Impression
Alt - Card Printers Lease

Annual Copier B/W
12,004,128

Annual Copier Color
1,100,438

Annual Printer B/W
339,696

Annual Printer Color
46,611

Year 4 Lease
Year 4 Per Page - Copier - BW

Year 4 Per Page - Copier - Color
Year 4 Per Page - Printer - BW

Year 4 Per Page - Printer - Color
Year 4 - Software/Fees

Year 5 - Lease
Year 5 Per Page - Copier - BW

Year 5 Per Page - Copier - Color
Year 5 Per Page - Printer - BW

Year 5 Per Page - Printer - Color
Year 5 - Software/Fees

Printer Source Plus -
MFP Opt 3

Printer Source Plus -
Print Opt 1

Printer Source Plus -
Print Opt 2

Printer Source Plus -
Print Opt 3 Xerox

$167,471.53 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $130,224.24
$0.00 $205.43 $11,152.46 $4,702.34 $12,018.57

71 0 0 0 72
0 1 47 47 42

$0.003 $0.0035

$0.006 $0.0035

$0.03 $0.0325

$0.06 $0.0325
$0.003 $0.003 $0.003 $0.0075

$0.03 $0.03 $0.03 $0.0690
$4,842.20 $4,842.20

no bid no bid no bid no bid $0.00
$2,637.56 no bid no bid no bid $6,926.64

$36,012.38 $42,014.45

$33,013.14 $35,764.24

$0.00 $1,019.09 $1,019.09 $1,019.09 $2,547.72

$0.00 $1,398.33 $1,398.33 $1,398.33 $3,216.16

$241,339.25 $2,622.85 $13,569.88 $7,119.76 $230,627.57

$0.003 $0.0035
$0.03 $0.0325

$0.003 $0.003 $0.003 $0.0075
$0.03 $0.03 $0.03 $0.0690

$4,842.20 $4,842.20

$0.003 $0.0035
$0.03 $0.0325

$0.003 $0.003 $0.003 $0.0075
$0.03 $0.03 $0.03 $0.0690

$4,842.20 $4,842.20
$73,867.72 $2,417.42 $2,417.42 $2,417.42 $88,384.76
$73,867.72 $2,417.42 $2,417.42 $2,417.42 $88,384.76

$0.00 $20,700.00
$8,804.00 $12,737.94

$880,557.21 $12,703.38 $45,544.47 $26,194.11 $902,090.18
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X. Discussion Items 

 2.  PCEC Roof Repair (OP 6320) 
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To:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent 

From:  Johnny Edwards, Assistant Superintendent of Operations 

Cc: Paula Johnson, Director of Finance 

Date:  April 14, 2025 

Re:  Portage Community Education Center (PCEC) Roof Repair 

 

RECOMMENDATION 

I recommend the Board of Education authorize Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. to issue a Notice of 

Pending Award, in the amount indicated for the PCEC roof repair, to Apex Industrial Roofing, 

LLC, pending confirmation that all requirements of the Contract Documents have been met. 

Furthermore, upon receipt by Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. of the appropriate documentation, a 

contract will be awarded to Apex Industrial Roofing, LLC. by Portage Public Schools, in the 

amount of $371,407 with a sum total of all fees not to exceed $442,780. The funds will come 

from the Building and Site Sinking fund. 

 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION 

The PCEC was originally built in 1951. Over the course of time, the roof has had countless 

repairs. During heavy rains and storms, the roof often leaks and requires contractors to patch 

portions of the roof. This then leads to replacement of ceiling tiles on the inside of the school. To 

extend the life of the building for another six to seven years, an investment to repair or restore 

the roof is necessary. This is short of a complete roof replacement, but a responsible way to 

invest in the building without spending too much money. 

 

BIDDING PROCESS 

The roof repair work was competitively bid with Apex Industrial Roofing, LLC. being the lowest 

qualified bid. A bid tab has been attached to this recommendation for your review.  

I would be happy to answer any questions. 
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Bid Category Contractor Base Bid

Alternate No. 01 

- Safety 

Walkway

Total

1 Roofing Apex Industrial Roofing, LLC 363,965 7,442 371,407

General Conditions Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. 17,427 48 17,475

Preconstruction Services Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. 1,200 1,200

CM Fee Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. 12,205 240 12,445

Subtotal 394,797 7,730 402,527

Building Contingency 39,479 774 40,253

Billing Subtotal/Award 434,276 8,504 442,780

Award Summary Sheet

Construction Manager: Owen-Ames-Kimball Co.

Portage Public Schools

PCEC Roof Restoration
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RECOMMENDED MOTION

1 Roofing Apex Industrial Roofing, LLC $371,407

I move that Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. be authorized to issue a Notice of Pending Award, in the amount indicated, to 

the contractor listed below, pending confirmation that all requirements of the Contract Documents have been met.  

Furthermore, that upon receipt by Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. of the appropriate documentation, a contract be awarded 

to this contractor by Portage Public Schools. 

Construction Manager: Owen-Ames-Kimball Co.

Motion Recommendation

PCEC Roof Restoration

Portage Public Schools
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Apex Industrial Roofing LLC (Bronson, MI) Y 1 $363,965 $7,442 

Hoekstra Roofing Company (Kalamazoo, MI) Y 1 $449,575 $9,200 

Project Name: PCEC Roof Restoration

Alternate No. 

01 - Safety 

Walkway

Owner: Portage Public Schools 

Owen-Ames-Kimball Co. - Construction Manager

Bid Opening: 4/2/2025 @ 2:30pm

Bid Category No. 01 - Roofing

Contractor

B
id

 B
o

n
d

A
d

d
e
n

d
u

m

Base Bid Notes
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Note Page 

XI. Closed Session 

 1. Discuss Collective Bargaining Strategy (OMA) 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________, seconded by __________, that the Board of Education move into 

closed session to discuss collective bargaining strategy, as allowed under the Open Meetings Act 

15.268, Section 8(c). 

ROLL CALL VOTE. 
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