
This meeting is a meeting of the Board of Education in public for the purpose of conducting the School District’s business and is not to be 
considered a public community meeting.  There is a time for public participation during the meeting as indicated on the Agenda.

PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BOARD OF EDUCATION

COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE / WORK SESSION
PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS' ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, CONF. RM. #1, 8107 MUSTANG DRIVE, 

PORTAGE, MI 49002
FEBRUARY 11, 2019, 6:30 PM

AGENDA
VISION STATEMENT

An exceptional, continuously improving learning culture with high expectations, committed to all!

MISSION STATEMENT
Portage Public Schools will educate all students to achieve their potential.

I. CALL TO ORDER AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
II. REVISIONS/APPROVAL OF AGENDA
III. REPORTS

1. SUPERINTENDENT'S REPORT
a. COMMUNITEEN UPDATE
b. BOND PROJECT UPDATE

IV. COMMENTS OR COMMUNICATIONS
1. BY CITIZENS
2. BY BOARD TRUSTEES
3. BOARD COMMITTEE REPORTS

V. CONSENT AGENDA
1. RECOMMENDATION FOR NMS FURNITURE PURCHASE
2. SET 2019-20 BOARD MEETING SCHEDULE

VI. DISCUSSION ITEMS
1. RECOMMENDATION FOR PCEC / WMS CONTRACTS (OP 6320)
2. 2018-19 BUDGET AMENDMENT (OP 6231)
3. RECOMMENDATION FOR BUS PURCHASE (OP 6320)
4. RECOMMENDATION FOR BOARD MEMBER ATTENDANCE (BL 0175.1)
5. MASB BOARD OF DIRECTORS (GROUP V)  ELECTION (REQUIRED BY MASB)
6. RECOMMENDATION-PURCHASE NMS THEATRICAL SOUND PKG (OP 6320)
7. RECOMMENDATION-PURCHASE NMS THEATRICAL LIGHTING PKG (OP 6320)

VII. ACTION ITEMS
1. ACCEPTANCE OF MONITORING REPORT 1.4, ENDS POLICY 1.4 (GP 4.4) 
2. ACCEPTANCE OF MONITORING REPORT 2.4, EXECUTIVE LIMITATION POLICY 
2.4 (GP 4.4)

VIII. ADJOURN
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II. Revisions/Approval of Agenda 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion: 

Motion offered by __________________, seconded by ___________________, that the Board 

of Education approve the Agenda as printed (or as amended). 
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III. Reports 

1. Superintendent’s Report 

 a. CommuniTEEN Update 

 

 

 

 

 b. Bond Project Update 
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IV. Comments or Communications 

1. By Citizens 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2. By Board Trustees 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

3. Board Committee Reports 
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V. Consent Agenda 

1. Recommendation for NMS Furniture Purchase (OP 6320)  

 That the Board of Education approve the purchase of furniture as presented for North 

Middle School totaling $829,274.33, the funds for which will come from the 2016 Bond 

Fund #1 – Furniture, Fixtures, and Equipment Budget. 

 

 

 

 

 

2. Set 2019-20 Board Meeting Schedule (BL 0164.1) 

 That the Board of Education approve the Board meeting schedule for the 2019-20 school 

year (July 22, 2019 through June 22, 2020) as presented with all meetings to be held at the 

Administration Building beginning at 6:30 p.m.  
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TO:                   Mark Bielang, Superintendent 
 

 
FROM:             Ronald Herron, Assistant Superintendent of Operations 

 
CC:                   Paula Johnson, Director of Finance 

 

DATE:              January 17, 2019 
 

 
SUBJECT:        North Middle School Furniture (NMS) 

 

 
We are recommending that the Board of Education approve the purchase of furniture from the 

distributors listed below.  A total purchase cost of $829,274.33 will come from the 2016 Bond Fund #1, 

Furniture, Fixtures and Equipment budget. 
 

 
Bid Tab Summary 

 

 

Vendor 
 

Total Cost 
 

Bid Sections 

Recommended 

 

Custer Furniture 
 

$ 691,446.39 
 

Ancillary, Chairs, 

Classroom, Tables 

 

Demco 
 

$  50,795.52 
 

Library Shelving 

 

Interior Environments 
 

$18,450.43 
 

Workstations 

 

Michigan Office 

Environments 

 

$ 68,581.99 
 

Storage 

 

Totals 
 

$ 829,274.33 
 

 
 
 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION 

 
In August and December 2017, the Board approved our recommendations to purchase pilot furniture for 

four classrooms in both North Middle School and Central Middle School. The selection of the 

manufacturer for the pilot classrooms was made after administrators, teachers and the architecture team 

toured a variety of furniture manufacturers. Among the group, Steelcase was selected to execute the pilot 

program in both middle schools for a semester. Through multiple surveys and feedback sessions, a basis of 

design and furniture specifications were prepared for the new middle schools. 

 
  

Enclosure V.1. 
February 11, 2019 
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Recommendation for NMS Furniture Purchase 
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Page 2 

 

Throughout this process, we have continued to work closely with our Stantec designer to create the layouts 

and furnishing specification for each space within the building, including classrooms and extended 

learning areas.  Please note, that we will also be utilizing the furniture purchased for the pilot program in 

the new buildings and that the pilot furniture has remained in the current buildings this year to allow other 

staff members’ exposure to these new styles and types of learning tools. 

 
The purchase of this 21st-century furniture will allow us to make a significant paradigm shift in 

instruction with the use of mobile furniture with varying instructional surfaces and use in the extended 

learning spaces. We have already begun to see the benefits in providing these types of tools to our staff 

as they embrace this 21st-century facility. 

 
The allocated FF&E budget for North Middle School is $1,093,040.  With this furniture purchase and the 

earlier Board-approved purchase of NMS teacher desks, we are currently $177,766 below our allocated 

budget for NMS.  However, please be aware that there are still some additional FF&E items needed for 

this building, which will be purchased within our budget allocation. We are anticipating that after these 

remaining items are purchased will be approximately $100,000 under this budget. 
 
 
 
 

BIDDING PROCESS 
 

This furniture was competitively bid and the recommended contractors submitted a qualified bid total for 

the categories selected. The seven bids received have been thoroughly reviewed.  Answers to follow-up 

questions/information have been provided by each vendor. Samples of key furniture items were also 

received and reviewed. Care was taken to complete the attached scorecards in each bid category to assist 

in selecting the vendors that provide the best quality of product and service for the price. Vendors have 

committed to delivering furniture on time and within specified proposal amounts. The 

above “Bid Tab Summary” shows the selected bidders and their bid amounts. 
 

 
If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me regarding this recommendation. 
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CLIENT: PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS PROJECT: 

PORTAGE NORTH MIDDLE SCHOOL 
 

 
CHAIRS  CUSTER MOE 

criteria weighted average points score points score 

 
Strength of Manufacturer & Supplier 

Understanding of Key Client Issues Scope 

of Services including Dealer Service Pricing 

of Proposed Solution Design & Quality of 

Product Line 

Warranty 

 
10% 

20% 

10% 

25% 

25% 

10% 

 
9 0.900 

10 2.000 

6 0.600 

9 2.250 

9 2.250 

9 0.900 

 
8 0.800 

7 1.400 

6 0.600 

7 1.750 

8 2.000 

7 0.700 

WEIGHTED SCORE 100% 8.9 7.25 

 

 
CLASSROOM  CUSTER AND RIVER OF 

 criteria weighted average points score points score 

 
Strength of Manufacturer & Supplier 

Understanding of Key Client Issues Scope 

of Services including Dealer Services Pricing 

of Proposed Solution Design & Quality of 

Product Line 

Warranty 

 
10% 

20% 

10% 

25% 

25% 

10% 

 
9 0.900 

9 1.800 

6 0.600 

8 2.000 

9 2.250 

9 0.900 

 
7 0.700 

8 1.600 

7 0.700 

7 1.750 

7 1.750 

8 0.800 

WEIGHTED SCORE 100% 8.45 7.3 

 

 
TABLES  CUSTER AND RIVER OFF MOE 

 criteria weighted average points score points score points score 

 
Strength of Manufacturer & Supplier 

Understanding of Key Client Issues Scope 

of Services including Dealer Service Pricing 

of Proposed Solution Design & Quality of 

Product Line 

Warranty 

 
10% 

20% 

10% 

25% 

25% 

10% 

 
9 0.900 

9 1.800 

6 0.600 

8 2.000 

9 2.250 

9 0.900 

 
7 0.700 

8 1.600 

7 0.700 

7 1.750 

7 1.750 

8 0.800 

 
8 0.800 

7 1.400 

6 0.600 

7 1.750 

8 2.000 

7 0.700 

WEIGHTED SCORE 100% 8.45 7.3 7.25 

 

 
WORKSTATIONS  PARTNR HAUSR IOR ENVIRON M MOE 

  criteria weighted average points score points score points score 

 
Strength of Manufacturer & Supplier 

Understanding of Key Client Issues Scope 

of Services including Dealer Services Pricing 

of Proposed Solution Design & Quality of 

Product Line 

Warranty 

 
10% 

20% 

10% 

25% 

25% 

10% 

 
7 0.700 

6 1.200 

7 0.700 

5 1.250 

6 1.500 

7 0.700 

 
9 0.900 

8 1.600 

8 0.800 

9 2.250 

9 2.250 

8 0.800 

 
8 0.800 

7 1.400 

6 0.600 

7 1.750 

8 2.000 

7 0.700 

WEIGHTED SCORE 100% 6.05 8.6 7.25 

 

 
LIBRARY SHELVING  DEMCO DEW-EL 

criteria weighted average points score points score 

 
Strength of Manufacturer & Supplier 

Understanding of Key Client Issues Scope 

of Services including Dealer Service Pricing 

of Proposed Solution Design & Quality of 

Product Line 

Warranty 

 
10% 

20% 

10% 

25% 

25% 

10% 

 
9 0.900 

8 1.600 

7 0.700 

7 1.750 

9 2.250 

7 0.700 

 
6 0.600 

5 1.000 

5 0.500 

8 2.000 

5 1.250 

5 0.500 

WEIGHTED SCORE 100% 7.9 5.85 
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VI. Discussion Items 

1. Recommendation for PCEC / WMS Contracts (OP 6320) 
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VI. Discussion Items 

2. 2018-19 Budget Amendment (OP 6231) 
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VI. Discussion Items 

3. Recommendation for Bus Purchase (OP 6320) 
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1 
 

 

TO:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent  

FROM:  Ron Herron, Assistant Superintendent of Operations 

CC:  Paula Johnson, Director of Finance 

DATE:  January 18, 2019 

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Bus Purchase 

Recommendation 

That the Board of Education approve the purchase of five (5) 77-passenger buses and two (2) 

lift buses from Holland Bus for a total of $668,768.00.  This purchase would come from the 

2016 Bond Construction Fund bus purchase allocation.    

 

Background Information 

Our regular replacement schedule calls for six (6) busses to be replaced annually. In 

evaluating our current lifts, we have a few that are starting to have increased repairs and we 

will be decommissioning these in the next few years.  Because of this and the increase in 

transportation demand levels, we are requesting one (1) additional lift bus.  We believe this 

will assist us in avoiding major repairs to buses that we would be keeping for only a short time 

before replacement. This rotation and replacement would be done in our normal process of 

evaluating our oldest and/or highest mileage buses, which are beyond their life expectancy.  

 

The increase cost of these buses are due to the additional safety features that we are adding, as 

well as the changes that were made to the specifications of the buses.  These new buses will 

have additional back stop signs, reverse cameras, stability control and air disk brakes to make 

our drivers and students safer.   In the last couple of purchases, we bid “stock” buses, but these 

buses will have to be built. 

 

The attached bid summary provides pertinent results for your review.

Enclosure VI.3. 
February 11, 2019 
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2 
 

 

 

Bid Responses  

Options 

       Warranty Information- 

Full warranties are separate from 
Engine\Trans. 

Vendor Year 
Delivery 

Date 
Reg. Bus 

(5) 

 

Lift Bus 
(2) 

Chassis/ 

Body 

Engine\ 

Transmission 2 Yr 3 Yr 
5 

Yr\100.00 

Engine\Trans. 

5 Yr 

Holland 
Bus- 

Diesel 2020 
90-110 
Days $466,440 

 

Bluebird 

220 HP 
Diesel\ Allison 

2500   X 
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Holland 
Bus- Gas 2020 

80-110 
Days $451,440 

 
Bluebird 

Ford 6.8L\ 
Ford 6R140   X 

Standard- 
Engine\ Trans. 

Holland 
Bus – 

Gas Lift 2020 
80-110 
Days  

$217,328 

Bluebird 
Ford 6.8L\ 

Ford 6R140   X 
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Holland 
Bus – 
Diesel- 

Lift 2020 
90-110 
Days  

$223,328 

Bluebird 

220 HP 
Diesel\ Allison 

2500   X 
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Hoekstra- 
Diesel 2020 

May 1, 

2019 $457,180 

 

Thomas 

220 HP 
Diesel\Allison 

2500  X  
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

Hoekstra- 
Diesel 2020 

June 1, 
2019  

$215,776 

Thomas 

220 HP 
Diesel\Allison 

2500  X  
Standard- 

Engine\ Trans. 

 

In the Warranty Information listed above, “Full Warranty” is basically the whole bus with the 

exception of wear parts. Different components on a bus have different warranties (seats, cross 

members, paint, are examples) and can vary up to a 7 years depending on the vendor. 

 

International did not submit bids for buses. 

 

We have purchased buses from Holland Bus for several years now and have been very 

satisfied with prompt support of any issues that we have had. We purchased gas buses on the 

past couple of purchases and have been very happy with their performance and cost savings 

overall. 

 

We would be happy to answer any questions that Board members have related to this 

recommendation. 
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VI. Discussion Items 

4. Recommendation for Board Member Attendance (BL 0175.1) 
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Mark T. Bielang 

Superintendent 
Phone: 269.323.5147 

fax: 269.323.5149 

mbielang@portageps.org 

 

TO:  Board of Education 

FROM:  Mark Bielang, Superintendent 

DATE:  February 6, 2019 

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Board Member Attendance 

Recommendation 

That the Board of Education approve the attendance of Randy Van Antwerp at the Govern for 

Impact Conference, June 20-22, 2019 in Quebec City, Canada and approve the attendance of 

Randy Van Antwerp, Terri Novari, and Joanne Willson at the Policy Governance® Boot Camp, 

April 25-26, 2019 in Grand Rapids, Michigan.     
 

Background Information 

The Govern for Impact Conference (formerly known as the IPGA Annual Conference) is for 

Boards, CEOs and Administrators that use the Policy Governance® System.  These conferences 

provide rich discussion, networking and engaging workshops.   Mr. Van Antwerp has attended 

this event in past years and would like to attend again this year. 

 

The Policy Governance Boot Camp is a two-day event focused on Policy Governance® theory 

and understanding.  This event also promises to be rich in discussion, networking and engaging 

sessions.  

 

Board action to approve attendance as noted above is recommended. 

Enclosure VI.4. 

February 11, 2019 
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VI. Discussion Items 

5. MASB Board of Directors (Group V) Election (Required by MASB) 
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VI. Discussion Items 

6. Recommendation–Purchase of NMS Theatrical Sound Pkg (OP 6320) 
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Information and Technology Systems 
8107 Mustang Drive, Portage, MI  49002 

(269) 323-5100 -- help@portageps.org 

MEMO 
 

  To: Mark Bielang, Superintendent 
  Fr: Daniel J. Vomastek, Director 
  Dt: February 6, 2019 
  Re: Recommendation to Purchase North Middle School Theatrical Sound Package

 
 

RECOMMENDATION 

I recommend the Board of Education approve the purchase of theatrical sound equipment from Parkway 
Electric & Communications LLC of Holland, MI in an amount not to exceed $33,007.99, proceeds coming from 
the 2016 Bond Construction Fund #1. 
 
BACKGROUND 

Each of our new middle schools will be equipped with a ‘black box’ performance theater.  This 
recommendation is for the purchase of the flexible sound system required for the North Middle’s ‘black box’ 
space.  
 

AWARD AND FINANCIAL DETAILS 

This is a relatively straightforward purchase.  Parkway was the overall low and thus selected.  After careful 
analysis of the bid and the available budget, we have chosen to eliminate and reduce the quantities of some of 
the items requested in the RFP.   The total cost for this equipment aligns with our expectations. 
 
I have attached the bid summary, and I would be happy to answer any questions you or the Board may have. 
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Portage Public Schools

 #10667 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Sound Package
December 21, 2018 -- 1:30 pm

Vendor Name Pro Audio & Lighting Parkway Electric & Communications LLC PROVIDEO
Address 2400 E 14 Mile Road, Warren, MI 48092 11952 James St., Holland, MI 49424 26471 Southpoiont Road, Perrysburg, OH 43551

Contact Name Robert Kuron Brian Rotman Lara Kuhlman
Contact E Mail robk@proaal.com brian.rotman@parkwayelectric.com lara@provideosystems.com

Familial X X X
Iran Econ Act X X X

Legal Status Form X X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

1 Allen & Heath SQ5 w/Dante Card $3,101.06 $3,101.06 $3,031.33 $3,031.33 $3,727.00 $3,727.00

1 Allen & Heath AB168 $887.38 $887.38 $857.00 $857.00 $876.00 $876.00

1 Allen & Heath AR84 $635.14 $635.14 $620.86 $620.86 $634.00 $634.00

8 Electro-Voice Fri-2082 $639.83 $5,118.64 $630.68 $5,045.44 $678.00 $5,424.00

1 Electro-Voice EVF-1181S $1,113.49 $1,113.49 $1,097.71 $1,097.71 $1,180.00 $1,180.00

2 Electro-Voice EKX-12P $581.82 $1,163.64 $587.98 $1,175.96 $632.00 $1,264.00

1 QSC CXD8.4Q $3,161.00 $3,161.00 $3,118.28 $3,118.28 $2,799.00 $2,799.00

1 QSC CXD4.3Q $2,180.00 $2,180.00 $2,150.54 $2,150.54 $1,427.00 $1,427.00

1 QSC QSys Core 110f $2,180.00 $2,180.00 $2,150.54 $2,150.54 $1,976.00 $1,976.00

1 QSC Qsys UCI License $109.00 $109.00 $107.53 $107.53 $110.00 $110.00

1 QSC Qsys Scripting License $218.00 $218.00 $215.05 $215.05 $219.00 $219.00

1 AtteroTech Zone Controller (Axon C1) $399.20 $399.20 $321.51 $321.51 $328.00 $328.00

4 Shure SM58-LC $88.00 $352.00 $86.02 $344.08 $88.00 $352.00

4 Shure SM57-LC $80.30 $321.20 $78.49 $313.96 $80.00 $320.00

4 K&M #210/2 $63.25 $253.00 $50.81 $203.24 $58.00 $232.00

4 K&M #259 $60.50 $242.00 $53.23 $212.92 $60.00 $240.00

2 Whirlwind IMP2 $41.83 $83.66 $42.53 $85.06 $42.00 $84.00

1 Whirlwind Director 2 $98.11 $98.11 $99.74 $99.74 $98.00 $98.00

1 Whirlwind pod DI $61.28 $61.28 $62.30 $62.30 $44.00 $44.00

20 ProCo MasterMike 25’ $24.61 $492.20 $18.76 $375.20 $56.00 $1,120.00

2 ProCo BPMBMB-10 $21.99 $43.98 $9.16 $18.32 $20.00 $40.00

10 ProCo 25-SPK14/2 $22.68 $226.80 $25.13 $251.30 $41.00 $410.00

4 ProCo EG15 $8.84 $35.36 $6.58 $26.32 $11.00 $44.00

2 ProCo C270201-25F $34.09 $68.18 $34.57 $69.14 $33.00 $66.00

1 Tascam SS-CDR200 $903.10 $903.10 $882.80 $882.80 $672.00 $672.00

1 Shure ULXD4Q $4,378.00 $4,378.00 $4,065.59 $4,065.59 $4,369.00 $4,369.00

1 Shure UA8-470-530 $23.10 $23.10 $21.45 $21.45 $23.00 $23.00

4 Shure ULXD1 Bodypack $385.00 $1,540.00 $357.53 $1,430.12 $384.00 $1,536.00

2 Shure ULXD2/B87A $550.00 $1,100.00 $510.75 $1,021.50 $549.00 $1,098.00

2 Shure MX153C/O-TQG $174.90 $349.80 $162.42 $324.84 $175.00 $350.00

2 Shure MX153T/O-TQG $174.90 $349.80 $162.42 $324.84 $175.00 $350.00

0 AKG C1000 $157.08 $0.00 $153.55 $0.00 $157.00 $0.00

0 AKG C3000 $214.83 $0.00 $213.87 $0.00 $218.00 $0.00

0 Shure Beta52a $148.50 $0.00 $137.90 $0.00 $149.00 $0.00

2 Shure SM81 $325.60 $651.20 $302.37 $604.74 $325.00 $650.00

1 EV PC-18/XLR $190.43 $190.43 $187.55 $187.55 $202.00 $202.00

2 Shure WL184 $96.80 $193.60 $89.89 $179.78 $97.00 $194.00

2 Shure WA302 $13.20 $26.40 $12.26 $24.52 $13.00 $26.00

2 K&M 25900 - Black $71.50 $143.00 $62.90 $125.80 $71.00 $142.00

4 On-Stage Stands MS7201B $13.28 $53.12 $14.17 $56.68 $18.00 $72.00

2 Behringer Eurolive B205D $156.80 $313.60 $150.53 $301.06 $154.00 $308.00

0 Drum Shield DS4 L - 5 Section acrylic drum panel with flexible hinges $234.00 $0.00 $224.73 $0.00 $330.00 $0.00

0 Clearsonic C5 bag $160.93 $0.00 $144.62 $0.00 $151.00 $0.00

1 Eartec HUB7SMXS $1,685.00 $1,685.00 $1,503.39 $1,503.39 $1,525.00 $1,525.00
1 Freight $317.20 $317.20 $0.00 $0.00 $750.00 $750.00

Calculated Total $34,761.67 $33,007.99 $35,281.00

Signatures
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VI. Discussion Items 

7. Recommendation–Purchase of NMS Theatrical Lighting Pkg (OP 6320) 
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Information and Technology Systems 
8107 Mustang Drive, Portage, MI  49002 

(269) 323-5100 -- help@portageps.org 

MEMO 
 

  To: Mark Bielang, Superintendent 
  Fr: Daniel J. Vomastek, Director 
  Dt: February 6, 2019 
  Re: Recommendation to Purchase North Middle School Theatrical Lighting Package

 
 

RECOMMENDATION 

I recommend the Board of Education approve the purchase of theatrical sound equipment from Pro Audio & 
Lighting of Warren, MI in an amount not to exceed $30,671.91, proceeds coming from the 2016 Bond 
Construction Fund #1. 
 
BACKGROUND 

Each of our new middle schools will be equipped with a ‘black box’ performance theater.  This 
recommendation is for the purchase of the theatrical lighting fixtures for events for the North Middle’s ‘black 
box’ space.  
 

AWARD AND FINANCIAL DETAILS 

This is a relatively straightforward purchase.  Pro Audio & Video was the lowest complete bid.  After careful 
analysis of the bid and the available budget, we have chosen to eliminate and reduce the quantities of some of 
the items requested in the RFP.   The total cost for this equipment was higher than anticipated due to 
increases in tariffs from LED manufacturing, however, we can comfortably reduce and eliminate certain 
quantities of equipment to commission this space.  In total, the reduction resulted in a cost savings 
approximating 60%. 
 
I have attached the bid summary, and I would be happy to answer any questions you or the Board may have. 
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Portage Public Schools

 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
December 21, 2018 -- 1:30 pm

Vendor Name Pro Audio & Lighting Vincent Lighting Systmes
Address 2400 E 14 Mile Road, Warren, MI 48092 6161 Cochran Road, Ste. D, Solon, OH 44139

Contact Name Robert Kuron John Conley
Contact E Mail robk@proaal.com jconley@vls.com

Familial X X
Iran Econ Act X X

Legal Status Form X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

48 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $445.29 $21,373.92 $475.56 $22,826.88

4 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $357.25 $1,429.00 $338.18 $1,352.72

3 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,149.12 $3,447.36 $1,363.65 $4,090.95

0 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,213.06 $0.00 $1,302.27 $0.00

0 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,541.74 $0.00 $1,829.54 $0.00

0 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $8,567.21 $0.00 $7,704.54 $0.00

2 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $272.44 $544.88 $245.45 $490.90

0 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $682.34 $0.00 $613.63 $0.00

55 10’ DMX cable $6.56 $360.80 $7.89 $433.95

12 25’ DMX cable $9.94 $119.28 $14.71 $176.52

1 50’ DMX cable $18.69 $18.69 $27.21 $27.21

4 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $48.75 $195.00 $38.14 $152.56

51 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $16.25 $828.75 $28.36 $1,446.36

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $22.50 $540.00 $24.20 $580.80

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $45.74 $182.96 $39.06 $156.24

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $65.00 $65.00 $59.45 $59.45

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $105.99 $105.99 $110.61 $110.61

3 Light Source TC Black Clamps $22.81 $68.43 $21.81 $65.43

54 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $8.70 $469.80 $8.53 $460.62

55 Safety Cables $2.75 $151.25 $2.00 $110.00

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $109.93 $439.72 $68.18 $272.72

4 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $4.98 $19.92 $0.00 $0.00

4 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $6.54 $26.16 $6.00 $24.00
1 Freight $285.00 $285.00

Calculated Total $30,671.91 $32,837.92
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 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
Vendor Name John S. Hyatt & Associates Inc PROVIDEO

Address 1765 Alpine Ave NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49504 26471 Southpoint Rd., Perrysburg, OH 43551
Contact Name Jessi Nix Lara Kuhlman
Contact E Mail jessin@jshaa.com lara@provideosystems.com

Familial X X
Iran Econ Act X X

Legal Status Form X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

48 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $460.35 $22,096.80 $508.00 $24,384.00

4 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $345.00 $1,380.00 $415.00 $1,660.00

3 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,320.00 $3,960.00 $1,310.00 $3,930.00

0 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,383.00 $0.00 $1,306.00 $0.00

0 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,771.00 $0.00 $1,758.00 $0.00

0 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $7,828.00 $0.00 $9,180.00 $0.00

2 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $293.00 $586.00 $288.00 $576.00

0 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $594.00 $0.00 $784.00 $0.00

55 10’ DMX cable $10.00 $550.00 $8.00 $440.00

12 25’ DMX cable $16.50 $198.00 $13.00 $156.00

1 50’ DMX cable $30.00 $30.00 $22.00 $22.00

4 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $45.00 $180.00 $39.00 $156.00

51 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $30.00 $1,530.00 $32.00 $1,632.00

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $41.00 $984.00 $39.00 $936.00

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $39.00 $156.00 $35.00 $140.00

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $60.00 $60.00 $53.00 $53.00

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $165.00 $165.00 $124.00 $124.00

3 Light Source TC Black Clamps $27.00 $81.00 $26.00 $78.00

54 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $11.00 $594.00 $9.00 $486.00

55 Safety Cables $2.00 $110.00 $5.00 $275.00

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $70.00 $280.00 $87.00 $348.00

4 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $5.00 $20.00 $6.00 $24.00

4 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $6.50 $26.00 $8.00 $32.00
1 Freight $430.00 $430.00 $375.00 $375.00

Calculated Total $33,416.80 $35,827.00
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 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
Vendor Name SLS Production Services TPC Technologies, Inc. LED Lighting Wholesale Inc.

Address 1711 Vanderbilt Ave, Portage, MI 49002 185 Bell Rd., Niles, MI 49120 400 E. Cork St., Kalamazoo, mI 49001
Contact Name Brad Scott Marty Golob Cody O'Brien
Contact E Mail office@slsmi.com mgolob@tpctechnologies.com cody@ledlightingwholesaleinc.com

Familial X X X
Iran Econ Act X X X

Legal Status Form X X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

48 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $467.16 $22,423.68 $439.43 $21,092.64 $534.75 $25,668.00

4 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $388.85 $1,555.40 $439.52 $1,758.08 No Bid

3 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,205.55 $3,616.65 $1,260.00 $3,780.00 $1,380.00 $4,140.00

0 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,556.50 $0.00 $1,174.95 $0.00 No Bid

0 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,617.45 $0.00 $1,690.50 $0.00 $1,851.00 $0.00

0 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $9,002.40 $0.00 $7,119.00 $0.00 No Bid

2 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $308.00 $616.00 $336.00 $672.00 No Bid

0 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $625.00 $0.00 $567.00 $0.00 No Bid

55 10’ DMX cable $20.97 $1,153.35 $27.51 $1,513.05 $8.75 $481.25

12 25’ DMX cable $32.30 $387.60 $34.91 $418.92 $14.18 $170.16

1 50’ DMX cable $49.41 $49.41 $48.67 $48.67 $25.00 $25.00

4 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $43.13 $172.52 $43.16 $172.64 No Bid

51 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $19.92 $1,015.92 $28.98 $1,477.98 No Bid

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $38.13 $915.12 $55.35 $1,328.40 No Bid

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $40.95 $163.80 $51.22 $204.88 No Bid

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $51.70 $51.70 $75.14 $75.14 No Bid

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $109.00 $109.00 $120.74 $120.74 No Bid

3 Light Source TC Black Clamps $26.32 $78.96 $21.84 $65.52 No Bid

54 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $10.28 $555.12 $8.54 $461.16 No Bid

55 Safety Cables $4.11 $226.05 $6.49 $356.95 $3.15 $173.25

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $111.00 $444.00 $91.35 $365.40 No Bid

4 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $7.85 $31.40 $4.03 $16.12 No Bid

4 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $9.52 $38.08 $5.29 $21.16 No Bid
1 Freight $225.00 $225.00 $500.00 $500.00

Calculated Total $33,828.76 $34,449.45 $30,657.66
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE WORK SESSION 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 11, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VII. Action Items 

1. Acceptance of Monitoring Report 1.4, Ends Policy 1.4 (GP 4.4) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion:  

Motion offered by _________, seconded by ___________, that the Board of Education 

accept as presented the Monitoring Report on 1.4, Ends Policy, as a reasonable 

interpretation and evidence of compliance with policy. 
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PORTAGE PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

BOARD OF EDUCATION – COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE WORK SESSION 

CONFERENCE ROOM 1 – ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 

FEBRUARY 11, 2019, 6:30 P.M. 

 

Note Page 

 

VII. Action Items 

2. Acceptance of Monitoring Report 2.4, Executive Limitation Policy 2.4 (GP 4.4) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommended Motion:  

Motion offered by _________, seconded by ___________, that the Board of Education 

accept as presented the Monitoring Report on 2.4, Executive Limitation Policy 2.4, as a 

reasonable interpretation and evidence of compliance with policy. 
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