BSN - SAMPLES

DESCRIPTION ary TOPNOTCH- SAMPLES ARRIVED LA STAPLES
SAMPLES
3/31/2026
Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

SMALL - TEE SHIRT 2100 $3.82 $8,022.00 $5.20 $10,920.00 $4.23 $8,823.00 $4.25 $8,925.00
ZIEIDRITl'JM -TEE 2200 $3.82 $8,404.00 $5.20 $11,440.00 $4.23 $9,306.00 $4.25 $9,350.00
LARGE - TEE SHIRT 1300 $3.82 $4,966.00 $5.20 $6,760.00 $4.23 $5,499.00 $4.25 $5,525.00
)s(-HLlﬁGE - TEE 900 $3.72 $3,348.00 $5.20 $4,680.00 $4.23 $3,807.00 $4.25 $3,825.00
)s(ﬁ;;’T‘RGE -TEE 200 $5.44 $1,088.00 $6.80 $1,360.00 $5.13 $1,026.00 $6.50 $1,300.00
)S(ﬁféT"ARGE - TEE 200 $6.44 $1,288.00 $7.30 $1,460.00 $5.66 $1,132.00 $8.60 $1,720.00

TOTAL $27,116.00 $36,620.00 $29,593.00 $30,645.00

SHORT STYLE-
N5255

SMALL - SHORT 700 $6.39 $4,473.00 NO BID NO BID $7.12 $4,984.00 $8.75 $6,125.00
MEDIUM - SHORT 1000 $6.39 $6,390.00 NO BID NO BID $7.12 $7,120.00 $8.75 $8,750.00
LARGE - SHORT 500 $6.39 $3,195.00 NO BID NO BID $7.12 $3,560.00 $8.75 $4,375.00

TOTAL $14,058.00 NO BID NO BID $15,664.00 $19,250.00
)Ff :r'«ngLL - SWEAT 600 $9.03 $5,418.00 NO BID NO BID $11.23 $6,738.00 $14.95 $8,972.41
ﬂ"ﬁ% - SWEAT 1200 $11.10 $13,320.00 NO BID NOBID $11.23 $13,476.00 $14.95 $17,944.83
EER'T‘;M - SWEAT 1100 $11.10 $12,210.00 NO BID NO BID $11.23 $12,353.00 $14.95 $16,449.43
LARGE - 600 $11.10 $6,660.00 NO BID NO BID $11.23 $6,738.00 $14.95 $8,972.41
SWEATPANTS : ,660. : 738, : 72
EXTRA LARGE-
SWEATPANTS 300 $11.10 $3,330.00 NOBID NOBID $30.00 $3,369.00 $14.95 $4,486.21
XXXX LARGE-
SWEATPANTS 100 $13.80 $1,380.00 NO BID NOBID $30.00 $3,000.00 $23.00 $2,300.00

TOTAL $42,318.00 $45,674.00 $59,125.29
The lowest responsible
bidder for the shirts Topnotch
The lowest responsible
bidder for the shorts Topnotch
The lowest responsible
bidder for the Topnotch

sweatpants




